EL BORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
BOARD MEETING

AGENDA

2830 Fair Lane Ct., Building “C”
Placervilie, CA 95667

November 21, 2019
12:30 P.M. Closed Session
1:00 P.M. Open Session

Fire Chief, Lloyd Ogan
Mark Bruaton {(Div. 1) Ken Harper (Div. 4)

Mickey Kaiserman (Div, 2) Paul Gilchrest (Div. 5)
Chris Swarbrick (INv. 3)

12:30 P.M. OPEN SESSION

PUBLIC COMMENT:

Any person wishing to address the Board on any item on the closed session portion of the
agenda may do so at this time.

12:35 P.M. CLOSED SESSION

PUBLIC EMPLOYEE APPOINTMENT pursuant to Govt. Code section 54957,

Title: Fire Chyefl

1:00 P.M. OPEN SESSION

1. CALL TO ORDER:

2. ROLL CALL:

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:

4, APPROVE AGENDA:

5. CONSENT CALENDAR;
(All items approved on a single vote except those pulled for individual
discussion and action).

Agenda Page | MNovenher 21, 2019 Mtg,



A. Minutes: Oclober 17, 2019 Board Meeting

B. Claim Payments/Deposits:

Distriet Claims: District Deposits:  JPA Claim:
$1,500.00 $24,522.22 $42.,060.00
$9,051.92 $8,389.50

$42,652.76 $2,322.50

$40,000.00 $17,572.00

$60,907.00

$16,771.00
$236,461.17
$200,862.08
$16,169.19
$4.316.82
$12,822.37

6. PUBLIC COMMENT:
{(Any person wishing to address the Board on any item that is not on the agenda
may do so at this time. Public comments are limited 1o three minutes per
person).

7. REPORT OF ACTION TAKEN IN CLOSED SESSION

PUBLIC EMPLOYEE APPOINTMENT pursuant to Govt. Code section 54957.
Title: Fire Chief

8. DEPARTMENTAL MATTERS:
A. Appointment of Fire Chief Conditioned on Negotiating a Mutually
Agreeable Employment Contract.
B. Appoint Labor Negotiators to Negotiate Employment Contract with
Conditionally Appointed Fire Chief, The Labor Negotiators will be directed
10 negotiate and present an employment contract for consideration by the
Board at its next regular meeting.
C. Memorandum of Understanding between El Dorado County Fire District
and Placerville Police Department.
D. Ordinance 2019-02
* Second Reading — Adoption.
. Presentation by LAFCO
* Jose Henriquez
F. Presemation by Garden Valley
¢ Chief Clive Savacool
G. Un-Annexed Island LAFCO Application.
H. West Slope Fire Authority.
I Fiscal Year 2019/2020 JPA Budget

[T:

9. COMMITTEE REPORTS:

A. Facilities & Equipment (Brunton, Kaiserman)

Agenda Page 2 November 21, 2014 Mg,



B. Fire Prevention (Gilchrest, Harper)
C. Human Resources (Swarbrick, Harper)
D). Budget and Finance (Kaiserman, Gilchrest)

10. CORRESPONDENCE AND COMMUNICATION:

e [ire Engine Response Statistics.
s Medic Unit Response Statistics.
e Resolution 152-2019 LAFCO Project No. 2019-05

11.  FIRE CHIEF'S REPORT;

12. BOARD COMMENTS:

13. FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS;

Next regularly scheduled Board Meeting, December 19, 2019
2850 Fair Lane Court, Building C, Placerville, CA 95667,

14. ADJOURNMENT:

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you are a disabled person and you need a digability
related modification or accommeodation to participate in this meeting, then please contact Fire Chief Lloyd
Ogan by telephone at 530-644-9630 or by fax 530-644-9636. Request must be made as early as possible and
at least one full business day before the start of the meeting,

Apenda Page 3 Movember 21, 2019 Mig.



EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
BOARD MEETING

October 17, 2019
2850 Fair Lane Ct., Building “C”

Placerville, CA 95667
1:00 P.M. Open Session

1:00 P.M. OPEN SESSION

1.

h

Minutes

CALL TQ ORDER:

Director Brunton called the meeting to order at 1:01 P.M.

ROLL CALL:

Present:  Brunton, Swarbrick, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Abgent:  None

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:

Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

APPROVE AGENDA:

It was moved by Director Gilchrest and seconded by Director Kaiserman to approve the
agenda as presented. The moiion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Brunton, Swarbrick, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None

Absent: None

CONSENT CALENDAR:

(All items approved on a single vote except those pulled for individual
discussion and action).

A. Minutes: September 19, 2019 Board Meeting
B. Claim Payments/Deposits:

Page 1 Cretaber 7, 20119 Mtg.




District Claims: District Deposits:

$10,848.83 $10,006.00
$ 27,794.00 $5.619.26
$14,319.12 $10,189.60
$ 5.242.00 $4,021.00
$37,782.00

$ 5,095.89
$30,531.15
$ 200,862.08
$16,169.19
$4,316.82
$12,822.37

It was moved by Director Kaiserman and seconded by Director Swarbrick to approve
the Consert Calendar as presented. The motion was passed by the following vote;

Ayes: Brunton, Swarbrick, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abgent: MNone

o. PUBLIC COMMENT:

{Any person wishing to address the Board on any item that is not on the agenda may do
so at this time. Public comments are limited fo five minutes per person).

No Public Comment,

7. DEPARTMENTAL MATTERS:

Mintes

A. Ordinance 2019-01 - Administrative and Misdemeanor Citations; Peace Officer
Status,
+ Second Reading — Adoption

It was moved by Director Gilchrest and seconded by Director Swarbrick to approve
Ordinance 2019-01 — Administrative and Misdemeanor Citations; Peace Officer Status
with the added language of passing the psychological exam and the response to
violation to a time period of up to 28 days. The motion was passed by the following
woe:!

Ayes: Brunton, Swarbrick, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Absent: None

B. Resolution 2019-08 — Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to the California
Fire Code.
o  Ordinance 2019-02 — First Reading

Fage 2 October 17, 32059 Mig.



8.

Minutes

It was moved by Dirvector Harper and seconded by Divector Swarbrick to approve
Resolution 2019-08 - Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to the Californic
Fire Code with the changes of "station” to “stations . The motion way passed by the
Jollowing vote:

Avyes: Brunton, Swarbrick, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Absent: None

C. Fiscal Year 2017/2018 Final Audit
e Craig Iechter

D. Renewal of Insurance Contract with ISU [nsurance Services — Atwood Agency.

It was moved by Director Swarbrick and seconded by Director Harper to approve the
renewal of insurance contract with ISU Insurance Services - Atwood Agency. The
motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Brunton, Swarbrick, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Absent: None

E. Revision of Stancard Operating Guideline:

» Article 2 Section 4 — Purchasing

It was moved by Director Gllchrest and seconded by Director Kalserman to approve
the Revision of Standard Operating Guideline — Article 2 Section 4 - Purchasing, The
maotion was passed by the following vole:

Ayes: Brunton, Swarbrick. Harper, Kaiserman, Giichrest
Noes: MNone
Absent:  None

F. Fiscal Year 2019-2020 Combined Tax Report.

COMMITTEE REPORTS:

A. Facilities & Equipment
No Report

B. Fire Prevention
No Report

C. Human Resources

Page 3 Qctober 17, 20149 Mtg.



No Report
D). Budget and Finance

No Report
9., CORRESPONDENCE AND COMMUNICATION:

Fire Ingine Response Statistics,

Medic Unit Response Statistics.

Thank you letter to Fire Marshal McKay from Auburn State Recreation.
Thank you letter to Chief Ogan from Auburn State Recreation.

Letter of support from Chief Ortega for the Law Enforcement Program.

5 & & & a

10. FIRE CHIEES REPORT:

Chief Ogan reported on recent activity in the District and on current events,

1. BOARD COMMENTS;

Brunton:  No Comment

Swarbrick: No Comment

Kaiserman: No Comment

Harper: No Comment

Gilchrest: Director Gilchrest presented the Board with a print out of a budget report
from the Cameron Park CSD. Director Gilchrest stated he thought it would
be something beneficial the District could implement. Direct Gilchrest
stated he had a meeting with leadership individuals regarding the Pine Hilfl

Reserve.

12.  FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS:

Next regularly scheduled Board Meecting, November 21, 2019
2850 Fair Lane Court, Building C, Placerville, CA 95667.

13, ADJOURNMENT: A1 3:09 P.M it was moved by Director Gilchrest and seconded
by Director Kaiserman fo adjourn and move into closed session; all in favor.

14. CLOSED SESSION:

Consolidation/Fire Authority

15. REPORT OUT OF CLOSSED SESSION:

Minules Pape 4 Chofober 17, 2019 Mte.



Nothing to report out.

16. ADJOURNMENT: At 2:.54 P M it was moved by Divector Swarbrick and seconded by
Director Kaiserman to adjourn; all in favor

Minutes Page 5 Cleraber 17, 2019 Mg,



EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE
FINANCE REPORT

1. Fire Operations Budget Summary
2. District Claims Submitted for Payment

District Claims FY 18/19:
$1,500.00

$9,051.92

$42,652.76
$40.,000.00
$60,907.00
$16,771.00
$236,461.17

*® & & B £ § 2

District Depogits;
$24,522.22
$8,389.50
$2,322.50
$17,572.00

JPA Claim:
e  $42,060.00



fewang suonessdo ausy

ao Eie mﬂﬂ
(95" 1265085}
1100 00600 FE)
“incazs oL s

(22 avE'as)
(oo'ocy'ngst
ooof
16EZee z68)
{0 ZerEL 8}
0%
ﬁm;m&mmﬂ

Q005
a0GE
J0°68
LV
a0
anas
ZOBEE'LS
s
az'ag

AL EPr0rs
0GBLS' L2
orog
IFE35'5LS
FHOEZ'EES
5 IS

% arG mma
1 95°L30°5095
| D0O0000F S
OBOES'OLE
DEZET'e%

| O00S
FEFES LIS
(I OCCES
0%
GEFLOCEES
CGOODOaES
naley
LE2025ELE
A9B9RTI8E
84 PO LSS

Sjassy pauyd o 3jeg

SPUN§ 5218 5 SPURS SIURISLE]

JEBWSSINGUES TSI

snodEasi i

{0591} ILUSLESSING LIS WHAPY SOUR{RAG LRy,
pein gt 1571 | S99 Juawdoj@saan

ST HREg g S98d YT URld

uonuUBARL - 5,834 UOhIadsuE

JBEFLDY HEIEA - JUBIS WIS
Duiping B pue Jusy

FsauEmy

SIUSLESSING LHaY ajeyS/BI8pa

JZEZL'3S
EC LPR'SESS

{sBupdg 8/Buns) co_‘mmpa%m autd
JUBRSSISEY 193]

SEROETLE
OFECOYS
b5 H5E'ES
QOGS

FIee'%
¥l oLs'se
Z6'5E5'5E
$609L':%

m.m_..m.mmmnwmmﬂm '
0L esaxe ] Apadoly uswaddng

(g2 905'02%!

b2 00'0%

g5t 18}
5505855
(6590F'508)
GI0%

{FE §50'952 550

2008

a0 s

HlEIE
BULEL'IFLE
$E96L'0ELS
Aras
9928l 'GTE

SLB05 048
0gag

BGtFLS
EESER'LOS
DO 5CTE%4S
oFod
BEZ'L LEES

1By xep Apadoad SISUMOBIICH 3R1g
Ig¥ IS J9JSuRd| pun4 ¢ anseam) anlejey pundy

Juakng-saxe | Auedodd easneaddng
{juauns] painsasui-saxe] fpadorg

alegas Jyy3 - sane) Auedolg wm

_Tmnh u.ﬁwtnuu_ ﬁ.m.._bumw.wmﬂm P _..ﬂwaa»m

W 0L §E0EELAE



AEUIENG suokeRdn any

am 105 mvmﬂ
[LE'31LB'2%)
BIOGL'SLE
0o 0Fs'215}
105005181
{LFa8s 219715
L2815z
{1t 45R°G8}

51 ZE0LORE)
e
22752518 18]
OHEBRLES

G ‘EmNE mmu

n_o Nm wNE
ol
BIORLELE
09%
05'668'2E
BE6ZE ¥OSS
BLi0L'SES
DOZeg

OB ZLLBES LS
HYZER'LHE
ST LGS 'ZOES

T 009651208

CFElETIS

o os
BYOFSELS
G100A0LS
GIDES LZL'ES
K GE0BEES
MELESS
GOGEL RIS
BEELL09FE
BFESZIS5'1S
A0S

wh mN.v mww mw

BOHEENSL] nonmm_.mnﬁau 5 UBLIREON,
HQISEA

wesfioid isaunan B AEgesiq way mnn.._
aaleeLrisig juaEdojdiust

1E3M3] 7 YHEDH

UORESLESHNDS JSUR0
Buwipdany

W 8001 SLOZFELEL



Alewaing suonesad) a4 Giog Wy 20iaL BADEFELS LS

1162253 7 L4 iyRRT ]
118089 LS i CHERE'TES = {1000 . H|Rg - SSRLTI J9ng
ali = o0 0008 {BAEl ] F ogeuodsaR L
| {58 SEF BES) GO FES'SS 00 CA0'POS : slldo|anas NI
1 COFLRTLIS GFFLRLLE 0orps JHSUSE WALy
1104101828 CEEES'FS LA R SEUSTE] HIEMYOS
OEBLO LS EIRVRG R WPAC'IZE : senddng Aapes g Ay
BT ELE FE MWLES A006'5S i Huueaf jeuoeInpy
Jtaz Eow 28] ZEGETES O090LELE = asuatdxg jeuswusday jesadsh
W0 GO0FS) 00 2 00000'pE ; sisqndiuon susuwdinbg
{52 599'0E%) LIBESE QCa0g'LES juzwdinbs Joups
Jlonr00ss} 0T Or005S SOSRDT ' SISy
1(Be'5Rg L1 5 o Lerres 1 OC'ODE'SLS waludinbg sases g AN
og | OLTELS O OGES saopon jeloy § suonemny
(0038578 4 OEEY'SS 2 000E0LS SamAteq qe7 3 ‘(euag jespag
oraos'nash 009 00 000 0ES GOEY JO N0 pled Bulay - saorusg eban
o g aras 0% uDesiLpy fauafy
(LL'eog'L 55} GFICHSELS S GOO0STAIES seaaas pazeads 3 jEUDISSaTId
{p0oces) Ao H RGBS suopdLasgny
{7 0re T8t GLELES DOTI9ES aBmsog
i lszeTees) LULIGER | 090002 ssusdxz a0
I veaBst | eogens D000 sdiyssequsly
DOGE 21 B00% 20°0% salddng eatpawF
EOBLLAS) G5 BEZES S 00 D00aES sayddng Supyng
EPEOETLS) LSIBFLS H 00000 FLS gpualUsaoedw) g SBorpgng - asueuagLEy |
T ERETLS) GLLELS A0A0G'IZE S6qR g SRuli- 3UBUSTLEY
S| (99 e zeg) Lty RS =] O0900'0sE sayddng ajuUaA - asuRUSILEY
2478210280 82 LTS 2 00a00'shE SOEBIEA - SIIBUSILIBE
g 1a'asgh 04788858 ] ooang'aLs ; Slie g uadinb g - edUBUSLEY
[P - it BRFLG LS QG OO0 +$ SOEpEY - STUBUSNHEN
(eozolel BELPD' RS F OG'05L PE sudcedinbs - daEusIEN
(o0 L08 FE53 QESDT19S ZE OBO0S LS SRINTUALS FOCENSLY
[ocoon':s) a0 OEFOGD LS LERBHIRUEES
o662 v 15 PEDOL TS 2 OF0GA'G LS g jesodsiq asnjoy
(52 8x0'aLs) GLISE'FS YO LES sasUatng FSHOUBIBAL
gZ5e6'LE) ZLVLTS GIOGE'ES poog
(22685118 ST FOVILS GO DOIEZLS SUECREILUNWOT
{2 51578 ELPES Onang'es Al TE
{erzeelsh EGiEL'eg 0GOBYOLS jusmdindy Aapegs
{85522 y18] =t Z0PELS




=

55,515.43 ¢

5104,519.43

{538,536 00

$38,535.00

$0.00

000

e
e,
°E
E2
ol
"
58
7 <
i
8
o «f
5

07, 858.89

5500,000.00

AFixe

377 456 34

3403508 00

£
3!
&
4
g
5
‘H':‘
1
bR
z
L

Fire Operations Summary

£of§

1132018 $6:08 A



$9,950,442 87

;

$4,353.621.24

ST HR6 TGS

4
ks

41067921

$i04.519.43

$1B5,455.43

314,304,064 1%

$3.138.275.00

3138,040.00

390350 00

SglariesBenefits

Class

1=t

& Suppt

rice

Se

Class H

Long Term Debt

Class 14

o Assels

ixg

F

Ciass By

Fire Qpsrations Summary

Sofs

132012 10:08 AM



HIRUL LIS - UABD NS0 GO OLBL XSPrS2 1S - K 1AM BFIZn03 Q2 EESED 1U15K] OZAT-64080 1

SHERLRID supRces [ BIOGS | L1458 1O BROTLO04 AU 400T cZng H00 1958 E EH02Mln: | BLOLGL 5003 {oooDst HELZi8 o G056 3
EE T .
e Lo uonderasart 1eaiqn apes fag shemgy ajeg W.q“._uz mﬁ\ W FET T asjoau; NS 1 Jopusp shemry
3 .

B ] :spsnjeabis

™ Bugzpouiny

SAJABIT MO STTHIHY TIVS SO GIENISHYL NIS8 SUH WD Eokd ON 1% LET o T HS3E INTH ONY|
ASEIESIO SHL AS 35N HOH AHYSEISEN JSIM MOTISE QZESN ONY GIHAVLLY [SISOIOAN] BHL AS ZBIHOS3U SIVAEES WO HY SHL LYHE AHLHTD A93HIH B

|yed) Iy A9 pajtphy
o0g0g'E g apny SiHE 203 §L02-04-03 DZ-6LOE 22

NPT B Ty BweN ang

FEQ U Ag palwag] PO 2 JESE-E-DET Lok JIENEY

BEEIoa] Loauey g

TG pasedaiy

2zg Adog A8 pxoGS] 6L0Z-0i-0) ajeg

] [6C8E-7ra Uaai@dy  duxond Ag; e Aoy
_ 3810 & Aunos opeaog 13

Heq ynzg g peseua AN ey 3HNsg

fA0TIT I0YHST THL HE QOHISR spicosy IS SPISIAG - [SIOPESA JUSGEGa )

HOLLNBLSHE MOIHD LY SION 38vaId 1 FAD BAPHAUE SAjgRed L4 Emﬁuoi

Gi0 L



ZR1eHus NIl ee LS 2B T e I T S S I GO B LS SRS

uogtangEansy s a0 OGS L LI58 LEBLOTL001 AU 4003 GEos 00GLSSE Z SLOZAOLDE | SEOLOHESOE |0000sE irslo2ich © 5955 3
Jadunp i
iopus, Jung wodiosa ai on Ba g e @l JOpa

*| pLas, ey F i o Poeigg apes Big sfemy w a ! BN 214 m JUROLY w‘w_ahtw\ yrg P shemy
ra1eE = W saaneubs

\ ; : BuElaogny

IBIOIAHEE HO STT2HYY QIS 30 FIINISSTEd B SVH MWD HOHZ OGN LYHE QNY OINEORIED B0 GEH3AN3T N338 3AYH OGNy

ATHRISI0 3K AB F50 HOS ANTESIDIN FHIM MOTIE GALSTT ONY OTHOVLLY (SIF0I0ANE SHE WE 0ISMDSI0 SIMANAS 20 STIMANY TH1 1VHL Adiisan ASTWEH |

Beg Hipey AH pajlany
00005} 3 Bpny SHIE 403 6102-04-0k DT-5LOE 22

Mz a T iaet P R a Ty By i
B ueng Ag paluesg] PO B GESE-4FI-DES SOl FHRIHeS]
LIBEAESES S UaajLReEYy Mg

MBS Ratedndg

2jeq Adogy A paidog] ELOE- D00 ]

[x] fOESE-FTD UBBIEY  ONXO0 0] (€D Zdog
ISIT st funog opeliog 15

g uNeg  Ag peoepaur FETARETY] SUeN 1S

AMOEE FOVHS SHL N JOHLaW =TeET Y 2S[O SRS - {SIOPUSA JUSIBHERI}

HOALABIYLSIO ¥O3HD 2LVHON ISVET IAD BoRUSHY salgeded 1 siayonoy

a1



IEAEUEE NS AP PRSI $EREln TN Dy T S SIUA LS O s e NS E

=g s ZE0L SaIpey Jf Z0-5LOZET00 AR 4003 TFlt a0 Lege Z SHIZ/ALGS | SLOLGLE0T {0OZE0L E0-5LoEEZH o 5LE 4
neg sn (088 SIDAR 1Y Ydr Tk $O-BI0Z06G MIE 4003 153 M4 958 z GL0Z/GLI0E {SLaLM 40T {ossz co-slozosd o G b
g S8 SZ-W Wdf DL 20-6 025080 ML 950 Lap 3005958 z GEDE/S4MOL | BLSIDESDAT Il ei2 ZorelzPOd O ot 1
wueg s{BE Y salddng g1 Z0-6L0Z0L80 A 2003 T e 1 ) z GLOZ/ELAL | 83014003 (850 Zr6i0zald 9 £ $
R BAfZL LA sayddng gL LO-61088060 "M 400F OB 0004558 4 sLE2EEDE | SEOLELISE |2H1LE L-ELOZS0E © Gig '
u2s BN BE AQF serddag 8 £o-6LDZ2290 "alh 3903 CROt J0G1 958 £ gl0Z@Lige SlOLH2I303 {2408 EO-8I02LE8 O GiE F
weg 50| 585 Suiielf 5T3 Le-5LORG1EG AUE 4003 aast OO ass z BIOZISLOL | elelid003 jesos SOBMIESLE D §it 1
Hueg s{ J9r0T BulurRl | 873 POSLGEE IS0 W 4003 il ohnEgsg S BHOEISLOL | 610:0140G3 [2o02 FrEL02EL] @ St i
B Tt BN Beiied |, $2F S0510Z9280 A £33 ozZon neoLasa z SLOZAOEGE | SERLOLAD0E |veise eo-Ebosed © =714 E
wieg SRECESS | Susdies W Z0-6i0ZLE8D A 5703 oL 0o Lage z GLIZ/AL0E | SERLH 03 |saett ZOBLOTLIE O SiE b
weeg on| 52 29E BUIEL | W LORGEOZLZI0 AU 4003 GE0S ancl9ss z g10Zrelot | alelrgo03 sz WELZIEE o Gt !
wed 8| gL FL £8|ddng eciliC} T EO-SLOTITE0 UL S0 08Tk GIDESSE z BEDEMSEMIL | 61950040017 [9475E zo-giozoEd 9 s 3
+ueg 57{6.L 80 BBEEYd 1o 30-6L0ZRZR0 | 2203 LaZr ooDLece z SLOZAEAGY | BEBLOLADGS 5208 b-gEoZozd © G4E 1
wieg SRl FE FRUdEng S Wd 2061029160 "AlH 4030F (1= 1061958 z GLOZ/ALID: | 6LoL0LE003 {eebE To-Glogatd o SLE 4
wieg s 540801 BUIET) g BCrEROZOEDD AU 4003 GE0S 001958 z GHIZHLOE ] 81940 JD03 160 oE0E SO-BL0E0EE D tIE b
=g 50| SO HYT £2£3 SO-SLOZEOE0 AUE J003 ZalL¥ GO0i9cs z SLOZMLML [ B1OE0E40GT [E06SE £oraH0Z80H O £z }
aeg en (gt BE-2 823 HIGLOZETS0 A 2503 Sl oaDLasy z BHOZSEMGL | BEQLALIDGT |EUEGE bFGEOZETH © Gig E
wueg snl L9 PG 823 £0-61020280 Ay S00% Fl:{27 o0r0Lsce z BLOZELMH | 6LOLGLIZ03 i eELDEDZE o SiE 3
wieg s A5G £2-15 823 EO-B30ZE 160 M 00T oRLb 0064958 [ BLOZIOLAE §5LOL034003 {ise LOBLO2ELE D siE !
wrg sl 0z WatLdnb "USD sO-HLOTSHE0 MUE 4203 LB L 004958 z BI0E/ELOL | 6LEDLIT0T (0L DS ¥rei0zang o siE :
Wees 5| L0905 Sl YEOS £23 Z0-SILGEE060 W A00S Sty GOlE95e z BEOZALOL | BABEOLID0 (20908 Z-GLOZEDE @ GLE E
sUE 2N ¥ BEE saddng £2F $O-61022050 A 2003 i1l GeILase z SLOZ/BEDY | B2OEALID0E |v2RSE PFELOZEDE O 54T b
*uem SNEZT LY 12495 I LOB0TL S0 hEY 4003 %G on0Lege z BLOZALGY | Sreled003 |z2as HELOELEE O BLE 4
waeg SRbRY 05 3248 S BOCE 02060 AU 1003 GrO a0t Bse s 810ZraL0E 1 6181054003 lewns SD-BL0ZENE 0 G i
=g snf9070TL TLHS £ E0-ELOEZ060 AU 3003 HOF SO0E95% F BROZMSLOL | 61340L400F [e0 0z To-6EDZE0 O S i
ez 50|05 Z0 BEIS 3 H-SLOZE0E0 "Ml J00S sl GanEase z BEOZMBEOL | 630EDLJ00E (052D brEEOEEOH  © GLE b
yueg s oL aBeysog J +O-61078ER0 A4 5003 LazE acoLesa 4 SloZAaLed | 6EOLOLIDOT |cooLt srstozeed o L€ 3
weq s PSEE #nd 1 261 0T8290 ‘M 400 S0 o0olase z GLOZ/AL0S {5L8LHI302 {saee O-GLOZOZE GLE b
weg snfZ | 5 BsUBdxy 830 1D LOBEOZHIEE "AL: 40013 oEEr oIS z G4DEMALOE | 6L$10E400F fEL'SE prsiozold 0 I8 i
I+ =l iy € anquin F-1 b
JopUIA unaury uopduasac WD pagfig | o= et ey ik junowy mumo_..:n\ o KEMES PR, sdamiy

HEg TSTEUDES |

— § \lu \ \ i Burpowgay

i IBADNAHIS WO $TVTILYY GFE B0 nmwzmmmhmﬁmm\.ﬁwﬁgu HOId ON LYHL ONY OSWNHOINTd HO G3W3A 50 NS28 SAVH ONY

LOHLBIC FHE AS 351 VO ANYSSIOIN IUIM MOISE HSL6ET MY aSHOVLLY SIIooAN Il AG CIBINOSI0 SA0MEIS WO SHIDEHY IHL LYHL AALYID AEIHIY |

e By hi pEpY
Z6L80'e ¢ qprey S8 SD0F SL02-91-04 0Z-ELEE £

BT} JLBHRIOE BN apd

e Fedg g pattieag] 04 £ DES5-PEI-0Tn BUOHd JPENDD

UPLastd usd|{IEy L=

WeEng peseded

E &g pardonf ELOT-3L-01 “#Eg

E HEIETYD UBREY  NHOE 0] HET Aoy
1s:Q 8114 Aunog opelog b

fzguseg A pedepsul FEGTILTY] SRR 195G

MOFTEE 2OVASS SHL NI COHLaN H-GRE NS0 SPISING - (SI0PUSA, FUESHRLE )

NOILRSRLSIA HOEHD SAYMHGN 35vS1d AD agepEy Sejqefed L siananopf

20 L



g0z

bR THINEA TIOHERO L SIFE A8t KT RO LSy s HERSMD

sued sni0ETag 5218 L S0-640ZS080 Ak 4703 QBGH Q00 LS5 4 SLOTALMY | SLEL0LE0D |0EET S-ELCLE0E O SIE 3
weg SNEGE'E S 03 0L WIGL0ZE06a A 2003 39Fk O0G1 948 H SHIEELI0E | SL9LHAIIZ {SE'EL PO-SL0Z00E O BLE L
BIeE S S L L5158 OL SO-6E0TEES Ui 4203 ern) OnGiase z GHIZMLIOE § 8130 40T isF T S0-8i0c82g O CiT 1
@ sn| ELAE T2RAN G113 0, PO-GLOTLER0 "nUs 4003 O L% O3 0s8% 4 Bi0Zra1E | 81L5i0E400T [15795 .vﬁ.mwnwhmﬂ Q SIE i
yueg SN |GG A% SRR UM pUB Oy 51 #0-5L0ZOTRG MY 400D 810 C0easy Z BEOZRHMOL | BI040 S B .wﬂ.mwnw.mw& i Gie 3
kg sn] L8 e GE-15 Id 9761 LOZEEE0 AU I Opik Kaokasg € BEOEMEDL | B18E0LA0GT (B BF Zo-GEi0ZEH @ Sl |3
weg sa{0s 6 S ¥ g SOS10ZE080 M| 2305 THF 0cDLesy z SICTAAECE | BEDLOLADOS (0E'FE SC-EEOTE0N O SAE )
Wl sriLE S 150 BT Td MFEIIZE0ED ARl D81 vy 000 LE5E 4 SLECALIS | SEAlol LI JE6'EC PISLOTECE O 5.6 3
g snipgfi TE #G-630210682 Al 4303 GESYE 031958 z BLOZALME | SL9LEL202 860 FO-&LOZVCE O SLE 3
=20 SrH 66 FE [qUPY JL EC-BEQZFOED "M 4003 BEGt Q00858 F4 GLOZRL0E ] §1L910 2003 (660 £0-810Zp0& O SLE L
e 5N |ES9RG FEUCY UREPY D10 S0-5LOTEL60 AU 40033 03 ohigss Z BR0Zr0L | BlE10E4003 FES DL SU-530ZELE O SIE Y
sune &N (59'GFE sayddng uokEs vidi 0L SOSLOEB0ED “AUF 4003 5l 100 BEE z BEQZAGOL | 8193014003 [soorl SOBLOTEDS O BT i
Heg A5G L sai(ddng vones 0L 081026060 M| 3003 fE1% GhoLass z BEDZGDL | B1LSI0E4D0T FEE O FO-BLO0ZE0E O ] 0 SiE k
Hu0d sMNG FE SDE) Ydi 54 S5 10Z0280 "W 3203 25344 Le0Eetd Z BLOEMOL [ B13201d003 palbg SGiOZoey O 2 3
e snpal'ag abeised 31 FO-BL0T0Z60 "M S303 (143 030 AGE A SHEZREDL | B19E01L400CT [00RE YoGEOZGE O SIE [3
yeed 5N S E5E socddng 3L e0-BE0TR B0 Aty SO0 QB 0001558 4 GLOZ/REIGE | BEQLOLADCS (S8°65E EO-GLoCaig o S48 E

EEn TSRINIEURES |

Bugpogny;




VRIS L HTNE S IR0 LSIBT Ll L I NE S IO E 0 | S R U U LR AR S35

NOLANSHLASIE HO3HD JEYHOME ISYId

El E
i

e apa1s| GO DES 6302 "AON R0 180 9309 EL-ELGELOLL "W 4003 ge5¥ caDEgse z BEOZRZTOL [ 6322014203 (poas 2RO @ PEOE :
LT N g BEGT “AON INQ G0 932 11-8H02L01 | W 3003 [EG il R: 1o z BIOZEEGE | BRZInld03 |COSED LE-GEOZEQY a £igR L1
wepy alan I S G102 "A0% IR0 WG 22008y H-5E0Z10LL ARl F003 e agoLese z SLOZEE | BEZZOLED03 |06S2S ab-gLozEel o sy B
Faspeig WRREASZ0 ELCE Aok NG G 38UR%Y G0rBI0ZHIET A ST SEDE 000 La58 z GLOZZEN: | 6IZE0l£003 oosze GO-SLoZLOE o £651 b
[ R Gl =t GLOZ A0H N0 10 22Uney AC-FEOZL0LL AUz 4903 SEC Q0 95% z GHIZREAL ] 6122054003 foo'sze SO-BH0ZIOE O 9zes i
g sone | 1 6EG &L0Z 130 120 100 82208 SL-6LOTLA0LE ML JO0T Sy G0 958 z GLDZEZML | 8LEZ0E400T fon'cz Si-6i0Zi0d @ bERL i
ncag aw] ['oR BE0Z 18S NG 0 20mFy $1-810832060 A 2503 oEgy QD0 Lasg z GLOEEEML | 6122014005 (ooom st-gtoztzn] o eERL H
wES O¥G]{ 0 96 GHOE “WON A Wl LO-GLOZLGEL A 003 a0t (R Th= z SLOZELOL | 6ETEQI400 |ooss L-BLOZESY o0 STLF 4
¥i3 o088 GLOZ "SON oY Yo $9-610Z10¢ ] Al 3003 a0gk LOOL95E g BLOZEENS | 6EZE01ID03 (09l on-sLeZLel ao SEL L
wEI D2 LG BHIZ A0 VS Yol SO-6EDZR0LL AU 4003 Fh0g 0GLa5E z BIO0ZEZNL | 6IZZH4003 Jesoir SOBIITIIE GO SZip b
wET 2| Q0 EGT BEDZ “AON 3] 1SI0 PO-BEOZEOLL “AUE 4003 ey Og58 z BHIZREZIOL | ELEZ0L4003 [0 ioE FrELOZI0H 00 G2t }
was vod|G09E BLOZ "A0H o3 18I0 E-GLOZLOLE “AUF 4263 il i 211 z BEOZTRTOL [ B1ETOL4003 fooas EgEOELON aG STik i
w2 aved|E4 BT GLOE "AQN LOISIA, ISIE ZO-BLOZ L0 L hY| 2508 LY aS0Lasa F SEOZEZIOL | BIEEOLA0GYE |21 18g zorstogtol oo CTLF 1
BIsR] BREQIELSEAE ZO-GHIGSE003A e $001F QEGE LEaLER 4 SLOZEE0E | GETE0L2008 |52E8%T Zo-eLeglog o L 3
ST EROEGG GO0E s ELOT "ACH 191593 151G L0-DLGELUEGHTY A 4903 SrOE 001958 £ BLOZZEME | LZE 4703 Jeesons HoLusled o iF b
=W BRGT L EERE = SHOE W90 [BIFRCE YdF E0-A6+.6SEGOTT A2 00T (10 oiass z BLOZRZML § 6LZZ0400T Jesesag et A B ir !
R EIRG{ £OS009  ~ GLOT 190 [BIUG 18I0 10-A6ABSE003T AUF 4003 0iE Gankagg z BLOZREZIAL | BIEZ0EADA] [E9CC0G Lerdgtaesy  Q Bt i
asgeasquEy TIRen il Y| L4 RIZRL YHESH aadRed 102 'SR 08 L0ZLGZ) Wl 2503 DFOE 0o0EasE g BLOTREIOL | B3220L4003 L2 BIZEL L-BLOZEIE O £EZE 1
FRQEEHTH 1

Jopuan Jnoy uapdissag walag spon Bip mu%_& SEHEN Bl Wnowy i aovpauy \ﬁm BOPUIA ey

“ﬁmn \.\ DT

R T \\u \ fuzpomny

ISEDMAEEE O STILYY OIVS HO Q3UNISFEd NIFe SvH VIR S0Rd ON IVHL ONY OSRE0445d 80 O593Ara0 N335 ShvH G

EDRSESTO SHL A8 38N W0d AHYSSI0IN JHIM MOTES IS ONY O3H ¥ (SIRSIDAN] 3HL AR JSSIHNISEC STOMETS O STIOLEY IHL LYHE A4LLNT AESHSE |

e JHHTE AgQ pajipny
QLESOEE % TR SINE 2003 SLOT-22-01 0T6EET PE

e Juelireaog izllep A4

e UBlg Ag patLag] 0L 4 OE0E-PPIIET R s (e

HEWIaNI] ueaiey ha

LB paaedaty

Begy Adogy Ag pRIGog: SLOT-TE- 0 HEQ

_Mm_ HOESE-FPe UBINEY  (OnyOHT I0) [BD Fiog
1510 804 Aunog opriog 13
HRZ YNEE g PADBRISIE] JBLELLIN IBEY IMA%I0
TROTAE 30Y4S 361 M GOH1aw RICdEY DS NG - (SIORToA JHENELIsS)

AT BIBUIBIL] SBIgRRB j# SLAYINDA

gie:



ETXINT A I00NyT 3 RN 38t £ TR I S T O b IR BRI A L
]
530 TR0 GINGY MM TO0E 10-6L0TEIE0 AE| £33 e ilchR=t z SLOERENY | BRZEQL4O0R (oooDaor LO-GEOZSTH ¥ 1
z JEOLEMN i
dopuay Loy wepdlarsan jaalgo apog Big shempy #eg BLUBN B34 JHACLLY sopoaly | RS | lopuan shempy
P ey - Fi E
=eg % sadmeths
- * Sz oLEry
-SENAYIS WO SHIDLEY OIS HOd CRINASTEHS NaSd SvH 2 Siud ON (WHE ONY GSWNH0NEEHE GHaaAT 190 NI38 JAVH OGNV
LUIHSIC SHL AE 30N HOZ ANYSSININ THIM AMOTIE 0ILSIT ONY QIHSVLEY (SITHOAN THE A5 QEGRED830 SRAYIS HO STSIYY SHI PvHL ASIEN3D AFSNSH §
HEG YPRY Ag paypay
00800 oY g HpRy SIS 45008 GLO2-22-0L UZ-BLDZ ST
JBiOL ILELINDOg TALEPN BF
eg Ueas Ag panueig] ¥OL # QC0E-tPeDEN BHDYd PERIGY
WRHUTAS ] UEa[YEY g
s paredsig]
#eg Adeg Ag papfon] BL0E-ZE-0 ey
fx] [eES6-brE UBSRARY dnydld 5} 125 oS
s euid fyunoy opereq (S
WET UNeg  Ag pITEHEIU FELTN BN TARSHE
MO HOYdS THE MEQOHEZER IPrO3ay $AHISH] BfHSING ~ {EI0OPLSA JUOLEENSg
NOLRIEASIE HISHD JEYIION 3svald FAD SABLISNE SBOPARL ) Sa3yDnos,

a0l



Ll W T St E T T Py T Mg PR IS AL BRI P e EA A T T T T

G

SacHUDg BRInGLE gooity ¢ ASH 0 0809 DZ/53 [EMBLDY AIYRSENIRS ABLT| AV 2003 o GeaL9Ee z SLOTPECL | BEPEOLIDAS (9 ioane LELEE ) ¥ L
z saqemy i
EDOHISH oWy UopiEasag »algo apen Rig | feanpy apEq SR 214 \ ywwonﬁ xw sojoaly | NS | Jopuas | Koty
s P T
. “VIOPNUX T T e
SR A ] Y\ izoLRcy
“BIATNYIS HO STTHLHY OIVS ¥0d QSLNISAHC NITE SVH NIV TD BOREION IYHL ONY OSNHCTHad H0 OI9aANSG Nagd 3AYH oMY
LIMEASHE SHE A9 IS0 HOJ AHWSERIIN SUIMM MONEE 0315 ONY GIHOVLAY (SIS00ANI SHL AZ 0ITIN0SICE STOMMES MO STTHLNY SHL IVHL A4 MRS ARTHEM
S PN Ag pagipny
00 L08'08 $ dipny SlHE 23013 SLO0E-FE-0L OZ-6H0Z 52
ETO [ SN0 IBe B|id
B BEIG Ag pousess] ¥05 # DS8E-FPS-0ES R T
UELE0l] Usa|yIty L]
wreng] paedasd
e Aduy Ag pefdon] EL0T-FT0L ea
[¥] {0£36-Fpg udBRIRy  Gnyoid o) ji2D oy
IS0 Bl HUnOD opRIGg 1IF
HeQUHEg  AQ pasenEd] FEETIEN U 1081
MAOTEE 3O%ES IHE NEQOHESR ‘puosEy FORRSHT SPISING - (SHOPUAA JHsUR LIS
NOILEE1H L SIQ MOHMD SN 38v31d LAT #2845 sajqeied L4 S1ayanops




LRI | WA I SRS BIEHe | T TGP0 LS IS UG O B R R RIS Y )

") "SRRI Bl 00 £ 191 IFRIEY NS - 1809 SROSEY 8186 AU 4003 orog oo 858 z BIOEVZHE | BLPE0LF0a3 JonElim 818 0 SELE L
z 7 SRy p
Jopunp, wnowy uaptaosag soadan OO BT | ooy ae ,.__Hmﬁﬂ,_ s ESE.U_K sajoauy | MRS | HOPUSA | oo
]

L:FLg

LAk A L

[~

LN

SSEOANES HO SITDNHEY OIVS HOd CRANISAd NI2E SWH WIS S018 ON 19HE ONY GORN0-YSd HO O30aA 130 NISE SAYE OnY
ADRIISIA IHL AR IS0 $OI AHYSSTOUN FUIMN MOTIE AILS1T ONY GIHOVLLY {SIZHOANE SHE AS 0ISRDSI0 SIHANTS YO ST T0ILHY THL EVHL AHLEID AESHEH B

e Hpny A paEgprg

QOLELA"EL L THRRY SIIEE 4003 5H0Z-FE-0L 0T-BMOT L2
Blo] WelHog LSLLEEN 31
HBg ueag Ag pauueng] POE # BESE-FIOLY 1BUoYd SRS
TRILIAEL USBFREW g
IUEDD pRiedasy
e} Adog A8 padog] BEOZ VRO g

ix] [6E96rFs ueanpe  dnyoid rof jfeg Tdog

ISIC 8did Auneg opelog {3
e yojeg G Pecedany Jaqlunpg BLUBN FOLIEHT
AOFIEE FIVAS SHL NI JOHLAW PTFY JALGSHT dpSIN - [SIopUaa JuslEtdag)

HOLLRAMMESIO AD3HS RIYOHON] 33V d

FAD S0BLK SAfqEARd 14 SI9YDROA




LelEHu2 ) YR T e SR LR ldue) RN SaImneel snEnel et FISIESAID

Jaudnsii e[ ED 58T JUsssIRqUIEY 1600 A5G 9L-G10Z1001 M5 4703 L20y D0T1958 Z GL0EFEI0E | §EFEQLIDGT (00BEZ 31-G10T10G o LoBL k
IS Bz QOTDST HUBERRINGIIIEY o SSEI2 L-GI0ZFEI0 w3 4003 LE9Y o0c | 858 A SHOEPEIDE | SEFEQLAD0T [orosE FOBL0ZPZE O Fiz]:l )
&0 aunba sy e 106 ~ £LE-3 DETEED MU 4003 L oeley Q0] 851 A SLOEPSOE | SLTE0LA50GT [26 LSt CLEEE0 a ] S
o0 DWEIAD BUY AP SRG [ 4T .- Hel wdf LASEDL A2 4205 LED¥ lagsase Z SHIEPCOE | SLPZOLAZ0T (SR BELY VREZOL Q g k
S BEIE B N SR O 0ES e L4-2 ZLERGE "AUE 4203 25y Q00iasE Z SHOZPENIL : SLPEQIESOT |GR062 CiBZESE €] L8F F
g RHRIE P UMD e SORLAE 1T-Z 6OPLEGE NUEJDOS Azl OO0 58 Z SLOZPTAL | SLPZ0HE00T (90eLE BO¥EEGE a ia¢ :
TR AR B AN eSe] £ 1602 e 12-Z BLPER5E ML JD0T ok 00 855 z GHIZAEOL | BHEZ0EXIE (L3508 BLPEGGE o ALav ]
RoL Jasag cawen | GA'S | EZ-3 ELOSE AUl JOO3 il el 4 GHIEMFEIOL | BLYE03ADO3 162°6) TEQST o ZhAT 3
P3L N WD) S EE (25 050LS I 2002 QREF cooLagy Z BIJZIPZIOL | BIRZOLIOT HISEE Q8315 1 it L
£y bupicdoy Rkt SEEAEDIBR D SHLESHE IeMad (592955 LIG00E0E MF 300F erdir Goatesg 4 BEOTMFEIG | BiVEDELDOT FOR D CHRLYEELGD 2 522 3
¢ 7 Buipoday eluoud sugaes LG iE ~ BUBTIE-QLE IRy G509455 LOGO0GOL A& 2003 GZ0s oD LeEe [4 GEOEIPEIG) | BIVEOLAD0T [19LE SHORLSELGE Z SEg b
HERORyy SyEsIY Feis H00fES 0T saa disragiel frEs | 4903 Zer NCoLS5n z GLOZREID: | BIFEOLJADGE [EO02 LPEE L al 58 1
| EREG IR H P GfSE R nle2g 08091 A 4003 caly (021958 z BEHEZAFCIO0E | SLET0LAD0T (88 FL BOESES: Q TEBR S
UL SUEPNG (Gl - B2¢-3 0625 AUl 4003 23y D0 SR z GLOZE0L | SLFZ0L3DG3 |S4 4l 05TErS & ] LrE +
R SUGHTE (GREH £33 L8TIFE "AUE DG cely Q0G1858 z SHEEFENL § 3LVZ0LID0T (eRET LETEE G 1t [
RSP 2ISERE (0 D5 e iseasingulay ood g Z9-810Z9260 M3 40005 1Zge Luile ] Z SHOZPEL 1 SLFECISCOR |00'058 COHGE0ESEH O BRER )
uysnrmsenen | GO SRR JUSLLBSINUIEY | S LO-BE0TSTAG "AUE D05 FAR=1 OO0 DGR Z GLOEFZIOL  § BLPZO403 [oosey W-SHoEsEH O et ]
‘3wt ‘sofibsard | Qe Ot o LE18 OGP EOLGE 199y BRLEISLE0T M| 2013 oGk I0Lass Z BHOZHFERL | BLFE044003 {9590 BH:LGSLEDY O ivg k
s sl 0T QRT IBH P00 M 2LL0308 B9Y SLL0LFF0S "l 2505 CESF CanEgcy 4 B0 [ 61¥20LA003 985RE SALOLYFPORT O ERE 1
s D Dy G275 L8PISL0OE 1ROV L0S20R00 A 300 g CanLacg 2 GHIENFZIGL | BAEZ0EAD0T iEQ dD¥ L9LeNvr0EE D EPE 1
Aapiy w2 2 EGE Ganer SWSEd GADE B0 0L 55800 0 2303 Ghos DoDLS5g 4 BIOEMFEIGI LPEQL400T [ZATLSES A LEE0] a QESE L
el MRANGEDE Ay RISEYEL ST LSS FE0H QERGE| ke £33 koS QDL &5 Z BEOE/FPEC] | BiYEOLADGT (157154 GEEGEL s} B55 3
| ISR A | G FGET - e - sHedays SN 16 LO0ZPEP0 A 00T azos [HEE]Re ] Z GECLPZI0E | SERTOLAD0T [867904E Oi-BLOEEEY O cE 1
2| "EERIRN0E A | GO G E e 20027 - JRdey IeBAtAES BO-EEGEFZO0 AE 4003 uls Q001958 [4 BEGLIFENE | SEFEGLIASOT |GDSE9L auol G fa=11] S
2 At v | PO EEAE - SHE - siRdsy wandwidlyd 50-610ZFRSD AU 4003 LEag a0 958 z BLOZPEOL  § SLFI0IIDAZ |porieee BO-EL0EYEH O ft=i i
s aBuespies e ARE L — Joaet sieday snolufly L0-BS0TFESD Wl 4000 03y Glgioce < SLOZENOL § L2 I3 (00'2BEY LO0SLOEYED G BEDL i
i ol i g Bg [T sibeday] WeaouAd $0-610EFZ00 AUs 4003 afadele] 2005858 < SLOZAAEAL {BLERADE JE8esLs S0slEEYEE O €eal ]
EE RN e R Jo0eT Jeday Wanowdly Sore0TEEan WU 3003 aei GANEDES Z SHOEFFEL | 6LVE0EL30T {00056 6 _.vaN.m“ & ceal E
2 OGN GEY e ‘WY SHElsAS ersay Lo-GLOELZED AUl 4303 Ll [Galif3iu ) Z BIDZNZIOL | G19E0Ld00T 100562 wﬂ.mwﬂwn_.mmm bl B0i8 L

JopuEs HIL BT uvoydunsart o apon By w%mm____mﬂ e mﬂ.m..._ ETe E:E:ﬁm MMMM.H.” I ¥ng | Jopuap mhmw._wq

1Ee] \A\\Q %% tgauneiEbg

Buppoymy

SRHAUIS HO STILAY OIS B0 G31NISTxd NI2E SYH WIV1D HoiE a%ﬁ% 243 G 3 0 3930730 KIS FAVH ahY

EHBISI0 IHE AR SN B0 AHYSSIIIN IHIN MOEIE 02181 ONY QIHOWLEY {SI920ANE THE AT a3giyadSs FOAHAS B0 SIT0ILEY SHL PYHl AFIENITD AEFUTH

W Epy Ag paypay
FRANE:1 B~1)d s nay Silig 4003 5102 FI-0k OE-H10E H2

RO L JRESHLUNII00 IQELBN B)i

318} UEDg Ag pauuesg] FOE # DESEFS-0EG TBUD IDEHIGS

LEEWIAS]] BRAIIEY A8

uEDg paaedaig

- - s e i e - e I T e Bt ¥ R e
T o 1 _M_A {ns95-Fra Uadiiey  dmyoid of pes oo
1580 84 AUnod opeled |3
sieq Uiea  AQ paoEdaly JEGTEHL =@y 121
MOTEE 2% dE FHL M QOHLAW HOEEE OG0 PRISIND - {SIoPUAA, IEFUBILLESF

NOLLAERIESI HIZHD A LvDIaNE 3I5VETd

$A0 anBpajE) STIGRAR ¥ SIaUanos

GiC 2



EORREhUAE T NINT A NP a L S| Lajendius | IS amnyeg s51 SRy LEHETD
at el Blnirseon wesaaie G L] BOL-S0TY 188G AB1D RB2E DESES | 42013 GIEFR Q001958 4 BLOTIWEGL | GE¥EOLITOT {05 £11 QESES G 0s9L i
i dnein Buigrswe) savalfoc L L L Z1E—B0ER 19T ABD $RIT SLSES | 5003 DS 0031958 4 SLODPEML | 61#Z0L203 IngLLL BISEE G ogak I3
i dneg Buneseag st 6 F L L GEE-EIEH 9RAG ARID RBIZ (LSES MIF 2003 GAEY o0olesH c SHOEREIGL | BRPE0LSS0Z {05 L1 L1GEG i pgal i
2z dnmg Bulrsion sawanE[H5 L1 L FOE-LOE# 1985 AE1D RR4Z BLSES AUl 4003 COER oA LSEa 4 GLOZ/PL0T [ GEFEQLLSOS JOS 210 SLEES o ogat i
surdneg Bagrduos sawepg[ag 21 | LEI-¥T I A ABRIA 3N GEDE PESRES MIE 4003 ohek bl FReln: [ SLGLIPEMTE | G3FE0IST0Z (05 L1 FESIES [H o8l 1
‘ouf Enarg BunseeD wescau G4 | FOL-ED LR ANy Lasia Sk QECGE SS5ES AUl 2003 SOEY o1 958 4 SLOTPL0l | BEFECGIDOT 05241 S%GE6 ] ogaL 3
2w e Bagrsias srheaas (05 L LL 81 few Aaslar Al 00O £95ES UL 3003 Osd 0COL 558 4 SLOZPENY | BEPECi4003T (05411 ESGES i3 ogak 1
Uy e Gusnsea swasos 05 A LE FEL-ZELE ABMS ABslar aan DECE CESES AU SD0T GOET 000G L958 4 SLOTIPEDY | BEPEC14093 05 r3L 2iGES a ngaL 3
20 dneun Busneuag meeans[0G° 21 L SiZEIEE1920S ARYD DO4T BESES U 40063 GOEY Rl EReley F4 BAOZIFED | SLPEM A0 O LEE GLEES a {aal }
“aurdnean Buirstass a5 L 1L $ 1213 A ABSIS! MEN DEGE Z55ES AUE 5503 CDEF DaGiase Z BLOZHSE | SLEC0sd03T [o5 Ak ZOGES a {Bgl 2
‘oz dncan Buplrsieos sesaaii|0G F || 921-501% fepi, asiar Mobi GEGE BPSES AUl 4003 ey 0063958 Z GlOEEEE | SLPE054203 (o5 LLs BrSES a Fal=1 TR T
“2u) prefpk| Q975 sogddng 6rEEECEOT | 4203 oeoy DO0Gi95E z BIOZPEAL | SHEDEIOCT [a15s SYEEGFL0L| O Feilel] i
au| pedgk| 1070 L sEEi0ng Z0¥5TOaS A 2203 Gaod Q0G5S Zz BIOEFEE | SHPE0LAD0T [Lotos COFSEQL0R| O Za0s 1
3350 [BPUBL Bapeuraenen| 22 BFGE 7 aseaT FuiUsey AJoD SEISRIET AU 3032 02+ Q003G A BiQEMNZL 5 &lLvZ0L4D03 |28 ar5e BEGEEDSE Q L0PE ¥
HoMg, A Euy AES UIReS| OB AT §E-3 YEGR LGS A 4505 4215 4 Q00595 Z BROEAEOL | BLYE0EAD0T (s LLE FEEREQIT €] FEFE 1
g fovebeaig aleis vaplen | SRS - FE-3 LBEBEOID w3 2TH1E a1t SOTEASY Z GEQENRZIDL 2 6142014003 |LeiE LREREDID o] TEPE S
Hanm=a, Sowamuy ks opes| 55 F L~ BE-Z CHISLGID Ak S503 =1%o GOOEDES Z BEDESPLaL [ BLEZOLAO03 |96 201 TAZS L0 o rEPE i
[ty ® SUAADLG Cepevbs wesn | G ES LY BLOT 1025 Eaopeag RS £R1Z Al 4003 0GEY CA0ESGET z BLOEMRZOL | Bl#EDLI503 JO0ERLY TRLE ] esle i
S IEANS SAETH GRDE T e SRR Z-E220050 AU 3203 coly GoaLosy Z SLOEMZIOL | 6372012003 [B80LE T-EZOGSD e} 55 |3
suigaeang s A0 | GO DG |~ AGGET E-gEA0SD A 2003 0sF ConLase 4 SROTPEICL | 6192014203 loo'esL F-EEN0E0 o o5 |3
Sighd (0 LESST L SWslllGag B0 pUZ LERG-TE0E-SISY S Akl 4303 0208 CR0ES5E 4 SLOEPEGL | GiPZ0LA003 J0G'LE0STL FEMOEDEDEE O HHET )
Jedad} Rl aasg s |06 4 £ 2 DLLGEA9B0ET wl) 4303 L ¥GE conlecy o SLOTREGL | B PEQLER03 05 LA SALGES000) LE 1g i
ehs]) wosrelie) opesen 12 4150 = A5 LGFERLEE0EoTY 2061083 FGL A 40T QU H Gollesg [+ [ sloTirzmt BEFEDITAOZE {416 SO-Bi0ZLLE O ¥ E
Fns] Lol apwied 3] 0999 5213 FOZPECEG TR0 (OGO LEGL Al 4003 prld=1 [CEN R 4 GLEZPENH | GLRPERISIOT FOBSHD Ehy il Q& E
e ol optiog 12]60°ES 9315 LOD-9ETSEDRSY Z0rEEOES L0 AU DG sk 0GaLE5e 4 B10ZEDS | SLFEG1AD03 [e0'59 CC-GLOESIY O gy 3
=hass uesebn opme 133 226 - L115 LOOFESEQED oY LB-EEOTS 0 AL 00T AEgk 031558 [4 BLOZIPEID: | SLPE01A033 (2228 IeG6ER0ESHY O e 2
lesedsic opeinG |35 L5 G0E -— S5 PEZOGE-CEIT 190 SERGOTEL L AU 02T SRG 0CaLese A BLOZMFEND: | SLT014003 [sR9s EEROBTELAL| A iE E
EscdeQ IpElc A LT ELL - EL48 C1200E-GEDF 190V ZEE0IETLL MU JDGR LBGI Q08558 [4 FI0ZPEDE | SLPE0E4D33 [3TEE TBE0STELL[ 0 [ b
[esedil apncG 13t LSS0 - 12418 SOEOOE-OEM 100 ELBGAETLE "M 4203 SEQY 00& 1958 Z B10E/PT0E ] GLPENELD0T [seosl HIFDSZELL| O 4 3
lesedsi; apeiog e3P ELGEL ST38 BEPO05-GRE0F 170V 06PORESAL “AUF 003 SROP 0001852 z BRIEHCAL I GLPZ0EJDGE [£L96E QEFISEELL Q B2 [
EsIsale opelag 3| BFGEL . SEYS 92GEAGECE0F POV GLZ0OESL L AL 2003 SeO0F Q0G4 55E Z BEOERZAOL EB1+Z01d009 |9b'sE: BLAZ0STELL| O i2 3
resedsy) opeunsy B3| LETEEL L1315 HOG-DCENGE-0E0F O ELBOBEEL L A 2303 SEOF 00039558 z GEDEAFZIOL F BL¥EZOEADOT [L5°TEL ZIG0BZELL 8] LZ )
FSOTSKY ORRIN] 3| BE 0T - [1H P10 ZOZ2009-080F 0% SLALSZELL AUl 2303 S8 100G 958 4 SLOSZial [ 51¥20L3003 {95621 CLfiggesie ] Lz [
esarsk] ooee] (3| B0 EEL - PLAS BLLLPGO-0R0F WSV ELRLSZCLL nE| 3203 Sai cOGiasg Z SLOTFEMDL | B1PE0LA003 [9GZEE SLHOZELI] D %4 k
igseds) epag 13|82 08T SLHE LOOTENO-DE0F1TOY SLL19T0LA L Ak 00 Sg0 Ol 855 c SECTRETIOE [ B1¥EQLI503 (a0 0L SALEPREELE] © Lz 3
| R epranl 22708 - 2445 PEOCL L A £33 fal¥ GInEDsy Z SLOCPENGL | BikPSGlLS003 {208 ¥aigthL i alal I
Uy Wl eplan] B8 RE L8 BrAPEL AL 4303 FL3t [eala]a=ist] Z SLGEPEMT | BEFPCOLE0O3 1ELEE SifiL & slal L
i LA S LE¥E +EGREGDEGO0RSS IR Yo LO-GROER LG Al J203 ik GO0Lase 4 GLOZPTIC) | GEPEGIE00Y FLE 2Lt e-B50ERLE O 15t +
] EAS EREZ0LOLGIDSE51 B0V, LB EORE LGS A D0 - - - ODE — - 08ak988 ~ |-z ~sroevziny s bbEora03 fagsrr T lIsEtereis & | igFrT T ¢
BENeOIAHGSE L1715 GRS ESOLSO0SSS 1870 LS LOZEADE wud 4003 O¥CE (U] REA] [ BAOZ/FEI0L | BLPEDLAD0T [BO553 LLGEGELOY O 23141 i
sazaab Gl gl - SrASRECISONSEELE 1Y L 0-6LOZ8Z60 ME 9033 QrGe Qcalase £ BIOEFLME ] 8LYE0L4D03 [s0ray: i0-gLeEREy O LEys E)
SESEDISDGEL 218 SZEEEC0 I SO0BSE L EIT0Y Z0-5 L OEEE50 AU 40063 Qi 0041858 T GidgTl H BLYFEDLADGI |69°5%E CElCZSEy O LBF} 1
BT T ERLIE
Buzboyiny




FEE

LEneiLE] TS S IPIWTLEHE LaGes. | KT A e | SRSy £ SIS
i ORI 2000 2 SUD e M ZIORG T L2395 (-20RA0BESFE 190 SO-1020101 A 203 DZak COOLSER [4 GHIZPE/H Bi%EQL4D0 | L2799 EO0-SIGEHD O 23 k
| AR g S oyned| LT RES - PAZLIS S SLISCTPEEDTIIMY Z061L0Z0LOL Ak 2203 ogay ooiLesn 4 BLOEHFE0) | BIFEDLd003 [IE959 TOHELGZO0LE O 4 E
| AR P SeD SIPEd [EGTRIF - SZS A SCES0E00LE R0 LO-S L0ZDLOL A 3205 il g el [ BOZFE0] | SEFEOLID0T [ER'BER I0-GLOZ0LE O 23 3
| AR 2 e e d |[ESTE - S FISOFBSLI5A500Y LO-SLOTEC0L A 4303 nZay CO0LeTR c BlOZrbei | B1¥20L4003 1e575 aucy i a3 E
| SURAIG IR iR L ARG HIH PIOD) §-2 LOZAL 054120 Z0-BL0EREOL "M 2303 DEDY coolsse | T BLOZ#P2i0d | BIFEDLAD0OF [Pl 'S5 CSIGEFE 0 8 3
i | AR P SRS SUedI GG 3 L~ FE1S GRILSTORGSLL IS0 L0 LOTRERN AU 2013 gy ebOlgse ] T GLOIPEMN | BivddE4003 foBLE lrsioEred o ) Z9 H
Y| THERE F STH E0 (G TOE e LE8 FORLZACGELSR 20N LO-SLOEECOL ") 3003 azay SO0 LB5a [ B10ZfFTIT BibE0LLD3T (OP 8T iDEIEEO O Z8 3
U] SHRNT § RO FNE [ BT - IH 5EASE @-1EGEYRAGLG 120 B1L-6 10T LOAL Al 3003 nzey [l fie Z BHOCHEIDE | BEPEQLADGT |MFEE BEBlOZiod a 42} 3
BU| R g S0 Red| LA 0F £2-45 FFOS0aPESLENNY 10-GLOTECD) AU 20303 nzey O31SER [ BIOZIPEME | 6LFEOLA0GT (L4905 HOB0EE0E O 29 k
“BL| IR0 B $R0 0G0nd | GE 0 b 133 EBREFEGTYORTIONY FO-SLOZL00 L AR 23013 negy GoDLSER T BHIZHEI0: | SEPZOILHO0GT |O020L FOBMEANG O €9 b
| B F S0 TRIE |G| Fseer G148 FOEZPESOE LRIV £0-5 04001 nad 3303 near (htd] R 4 GIOTHFEIDE | BEFEUIIOGT (BR 1L TO-610200 O 29 3
3| "SUIPE 2 S2D SYsed | FOEES - BL-25 Z-PEPOPGLOEE o9 Z0B 108001 A 2503 DEsy epOLEse ¢ @ BIIZAEE | SLEE6L3005 |ZaEes CrEi0z0y O ok b
DUl TP F SED OG0 (GF LG - LIS SEEREERLICE 190V OB LCEELE0 M| 303 J2a¢ CEOLESE 4 BLOTHENE | BLPECISZO3 |5k 48 COBLJEEIH O F4:] 3
TR WeLRLk GRS FAME AAOGE L0 A L33 A0kr cooless T BROZHEMNL | SILPI0LE003 |00'SE ZioL [+ FiBL L
1220w Ue= | G0 1S - SAMON HORG LLOY AR $503F a0ty CIOLGSR z BROEMFENOL § SLPEH 0032 00es 0L [H FLER 3
SARS 3mE ¢ DY) sestkg | SETLER - ITISGLA BUID 'eNEwey LAGE Al JO0E a0er 0eLase Z BROZHFEOL JSLPTH A0 |BELES 1] [B=1 L
Stk anjg ¢ ) sesRlEY | QDDER BLIGEIS-LTIG BUID 'SISE 0155 Ak 2003 Joek 0Calese Z BEOZHFZML : ELPE0LITO3 (00GL3 o L5S k
e ANIE ¢ CSETRUEIE A GDTOGR - BESIGL-00S BUED 'SNSHBN £RAZE AL 40500 apeEr o858 Z SLOCHPTAL § GLFEGia00S J00'H59 1 L55 k
U 'Sueg ¢ REND W E1 46D o~ u=fio GSAEHTANT AL J00F 1Z0P Ul Beces Z GEOLIVERDL | ELPE0IA00T JEE S8 9REEZANI] O ¥i5 3
S 'SU0g § SI) R | BTG - &l BLAOLIS R 4003 platst] 0G5l 958 4 GLOEMPZAaL | 6LFE0L R0 (1T S50 GIALLS I PEG k
T SUCE R SEND 9 BT - LE-3 SSLSEEANE AA 4003 ] 06l ass z SLOTIFEIOL | BLPED: 34T ISTEORGE 84GZEANIT D 2k 1
soond |GE L5 FAUE BRSA|2] £RES0SHL AU 4003 bl 00elass Z GROEMFZOL [ BL+Z054003 B 251 el a BLEE k
nedsy o) suad usr |G AL GLOE 1095 S0ISS TUBLYDBIN FLEGCOAM AL 40¢13 ook 001958 Z SLOEIPEIOL [ BLEFT0LADOT 6 5LLE PISSOGAMNE 0 0EEZ 8
o) ey Sugnsucsy [SEasul 5L L3 Isang ek B9 OPSES AU 4003 ek Q0 95 Z GLOLLEMD]L [ Bl7Z0LdDad hsril OPSEE 3l 0g8: 3
2| ot BUNINELE) 15ewmiu) | 0574 L1 LE3-82 14 f2ia ABSIAT A9 0S8 05555 A3 4003 COER Dogtagy 4 SLCTIREGL | BIPZ0EAD03 (057 LE DS5EG a 043t L2
| e SHmsH 1Seem |05 2 L €23 0714 fann des2a e DTOE LSFES M 4003 CaEr D0GLasg 4 BLOEPEICL | BLEFE0E400T [0SR 15885 Q if:3-1H 1
‘| enars Sunsen sEeE G5 AL Er3-0F14 S Lesar Bl 0808 DESES AL 4003 il Q061958 Z SIGTFPEIRY | B1FEDLA003 [0S74L) HESEE [s] 0agt i
“241| Ereeg Bumsueg 1samaERI| 05T AL L depy fesaar wap] 0208 BEEES “AU: 4003 GOEF Q00EacE [ ELOTIPEI0E | BIFEDLAD0T |O5ALE BECEE o ag8gk E
{ "3 droes BURASUOD leaaeul| 0574 LS THE-Biki feh A28sa¢ #naDd DEOE SE5ES AUE 4003 GOEY plijudslets) 4 GLOTIPEMT | GEt2014003 |68AL3 SEGED o oeat H
| e Bumasues [sameu) 0574 | 2 LE1-SE g Ao AssIar aan D06 ZESES AUF 30063 QGEF {00:acd [4 BLOZIFEIGE | SEFEQLAD0E |05 Ll: CEEES o Qagl }
‘s drqig Bdgnsteg 1savesal |05 1 | AL1-EE | AR AE5590 31 0505 BESES AU 409G OsEF a00Less <z BIEFTIDE | DEFECIZD03 |05 ALE SREES G Qaal i
au drougy Bugnsuas (sassarniNg Ll L Oki-vFL Aehy ABSr W@ JEQE DESES M 4003 GEy SO0L2SA [4 BLIZHFENE | SLPEGIEHI2 |05 LLE GERES G 0agal i
‘3w dnein Bunsuas 1sasaap 0 Gk [ jeAg euld | 310 08SES Al G003 fil55 ] annLEEa [4 SLOZHENE | SLYECGIEDO3 [00OKL 5TOES ] Jegl i
“3ug dneuny Bl et ing Z8E 2Rl J|paRIRd 6L SOTES A 4503 nGes GO0ESGH I BIOCFEME | SLPERIIDO3 0525 enasiy o opalL i
i dnegy Busirsuas swavlasi g 29 fEAL SDOS) Z1L9T BOESY A 2003 agey 301258 Z BHEHZAL § ELFEQT4D03 J05°29L BaaEE i 0 ceelL b
2y dacag Dupnsas ssassi (G £ | FEOY 2204 J0E $955 AU 2205 qEd COOLSSR Z GEDZMEAL | 6LPERE S0 JOS'L3L CEEGY - oRal 3
up ANn BAISLIS ERAMNE DG £1 L peoy fagen USSEstS 1281 M 2005 anes 2001958 4 BIOZPERL BLrT0e40]3 05 1L [ 38 o oeal T .
updncin Gug|rsuas sesuaka S S R0 AT B||MUS0Eld BSE "AU| 2203 DoEF 1858 Z SRIEFEIDL P ELPEZ0ESO0T JE080 BGE a [H=]) 3
| o SRSy e 0GB ] Sl Eenciluy 00s 22667 8| 2303 - D08 —— [T R A0S NPT ISPt Ju P F R SASA WY Se—
2| o Supssueg Heneans LR L H pecy Usaas exli! COLE SRESE At CHHES dosy 0coL9se z SLOTIPEML | ELFEDLIDGE |0 ER TRESE +] ngak 13
| e fin|rsvedy IsewaIg| GG TES PROR IO DEE BOPSE Al 4T GEr 0GE1Las8 4 SLOTIREDL | BIFEDLLD0GT [0GZES SateE ¢] g9k 2
| @ SUlINSLCD) KSEIRILE DG AE | ZIE-50T# 1280 ABID GOUE FLSES Al 0T il 000 1858 £} SHCEFEIG] | BIFEQLIDGE (0Ll ¥IGEE +] 089¢ }
131E0 FEETTHCI
Bu|z1acegny




bRIEHILS) kA TIDUPT D SIBG 31t U NI A IR0 L S| PSS SR T B ISR SIS

ATl LELG GLOT 108G Bnd ge0assLs | 3003 ol ilen]3s =] [ BTl | BLPT03AD03 (B4 2046 BR0HL513 a w5el 1
sEERA vane RO EL — B2} BRd? 0LOsECRAE "AUE 2008 003 QGO LSER 4 GIDENEIDL [ G1F20340AF [PO'BL SOLQETOFIY & FEV +
sewpA W] SO POE 7 EHEHU-SLE S0IMBS (225 MNLGEECHEE M| 4003 0¥ 0G0 E5d [ Bi0ZHZI0L PFEOEIDOE (LG HIE LOLGEZOEY O FEb 3
a0 "Moo 00 E TUSIISSIRAIEE Hanoy LWF ECGLESH0E | 4003 Leay QG5B [4 BEOZHEMGL | BEFEDLA003 00'+9 Crellesly G ETEL 3
Longarg L B 00 SR LT L 6107 1dag s8aseS YD EQCrBSDEDERD M| 2043 J0ER D0O1G5E £ BEOSIFENG | BEFEOLIDOT [OXERlE SrGiOcoEy o skl 3
| sHusy cpEEAR] O EERS Bit-3 L2406 Al 3z 0909 a0 95E Zz GEOEIFEI0E | BLFEDI3IDCE [EOEZRG LELG & FAhy 3
Bumuig 5 Addng sips vt L ZS L sal|ddng 200 O IETEETE N 5003 ali D001 a5H z BLGEMFEML | BLP2GIID03 [ReE6t O-GEBGYE 0 ZZ6 k
Sugsid T Addng s e RE TS ssyddng 200 68180 A 2503 e 0005858 A BLCEIFENDS | SLYECHD0T (SETL DELHEGHE b EEG k
1330z, F 203 pRRaN RIS ECR PGS 13 s=di gOlERy A $303 TokF 2001858 Z SLOSFEDL | SLEECIID0S (S8 PS5L B TIF il LELE 2
JRa B L BpRsay eLagiOGEH ~ HE-3 JeOet soLEEr Al 73 LAl Co0sacg Z SHOEfFEIDL | BLPENIDO3 (080 BILEEY a LEET L
RaLn & 2L EpRaRy BERS FETLGY B ssall 51615k Al 47007 Falt GO0: 959 Z SI0EFZI0L | B1PE044003 [2eT18s T-8i5LEF a fTSE 3
Bacta g all epessy mmeg B0 EE-J0987 151615 aU: 4003 calt FHniasg z S0ZHE0L | BLPE0E40032 000200 Gislar Q fELE i
L1 52| G BEF S SLOE "AON UE|Z 2MSS WNUGBEE B L1 AU 4003 BOEE TOLEsY Z BIOEAZ0L | BleZ0Ld003 023515 sLIal ] LEEE i
%ﬂ Ry S0 aeod | 07008, pusdNg Sukiery Z0-GLOZELGL Al 400G Ligy Jilen] R [ GHOERFZIGL | BibE0LJI003 JOG 008 So5i0ERl O Se0t 1
%ESEUEAE BiE WaRasibguay sdet Suies: L0-6L0ZE1GE AU 4733 L3t U0 558 4 BINEFTIsl | BEPEOLADOT (17 LT L2-GE0Z5L O CEaL 3
" ooy FILEE Ll sy BZE-T E1LGR AU 405D Eolt il 8=20s) [ GEDE/FEMCTL | GEVEOLZADCT (B0 LY Lig0g G EGEE [
sier Uotad |GOONE FAWSSINGLEFY Sl Hpsy; S0-5102Z008 Al 4003 Leay NGaLSSR A BROEPENDL | BLPEOLADGT [0 0oE eO-BEDTZO0 C 153419 i
on[eN B TR WA [ER'RL A5 L FEY AU 0050 LG47 DooLgSe z VORIRED: | GLbECl SO0 [ERRE LELEFRY o B5EL 3
ShIEN SIL SAES RHR (5TR - 1245 Zag9geay sl 4503 lBip D0GLASE [4 BLGCIPEINS { BLPEQIA00T |95 R C5RBERY O ES5L [
ShiEp ) Sl WeRd1BEE . LHS ERRSERY AUl 5203 ABER D003 058 4 SEOEFENDE | SLPT0S4203 (GRS 15FREEY a £E51 b
“oug Ay Ae wEsRALE 1G] T BE45 LBFITE W 503 LEiY ong1ase A BIGEPLI0L  § BLPE03L2058 | L5711 LoFLEL fal BEE ]
Mg "By ABIEN WS BT S| -7 BEIS PREPIEE A0 303 ABLEF A0cHSE z SLOEPZRL [ BLFE0EADAE [BE L FeFIE: 3] BEE 3
‘2 Aaw falrp eersas[ Ll o BEIS Qb sl 2503 LELE G ass Z SHOZWZOL [ BIFE0LAT03 jHSr QAFLIEL 4] BEE k
S} B SR|mh, LSRRI RE S S-S OFL2L A 3003 Faiin oali]2-1s ! Z BLOZEIDL | Bl ¥Z0E4D03 J6ES OriEE a BEZ k
‘sl ey lagen Iemeas O0EG T EL1S SEELEL AW 4003 Foiih GoOLocy Z Bi0SrZial | Bi¥E0LA003 labes SEELZL ] B8 +
“u| "sng Aages, liEsesd| $8E S48 ESELEL AU 4003 ISy oCQLecy [ LOEHFEGL | BEREOLAD0T HHEE LasLzL €} BEZ 13
JBABIBN Sl |BR AL SEFIS & ADREL WY A 4003 EL-18 0GaLE%8 [4 BROEPENDS | SLPEGLADCT (68 LE g Aegkildl ¢ 28T 1
BIURAIEH H[LUEEd |T8'S FES G109k L Ly M 400 LT 00aLg5e Z BLOZPE/0E | SLPECIIO0E |86 BlLGaysil-H o EELE 1
arapiEy aqiuaceld (53T~ G218 B 165y L LY AUy 4033 P8 oo ase 4 BLEZI¥GI0% | GIFEGI003 (9121 6LeErLl-H O EGLE I
B FEEd | GF R SZ-E5 BAECE: -y AU DT LGy 1001953 z GEQDIPEME § SIS0 £205 |Gt R BRESELIEE O DGR 3
Qe E|anBly Sy SEIIS § LIS Y AUL 00T PA e Q031859 z SLCEFEDL 8103003 (e BELGFEL-H] O EELE 2
AINEH AR PSS 525 FESGFI WY AU 3033 LB1¥ GOk O5E Z GLGEEHIL | BlLv20: 4003 les's BEGEFD-HE D EGEE k
DIERQLEH BRI LT - SEA% 828k L "M 4003 FA:5Y GOg:asy z SHEFEOL | eLyZ0E4003 28T BEGFLL Q EGET 3
e b L CTISDESFLE-A0 2003, - - 2Bkl EDEOGE —[ - F— - SLOZHTIO L [ BEFZOELD0T dots— tegapr—to ez — 1 —
FPol 'Loafiuie i IR Gl o PIel BERCE TO-S10T2 501 | 2303 Llak G0ESES Z EI0EMFEIGE | GEFEOL4D0T (000 ZOrGI0ELIN O [2e4) i
o Tupald § ve0 ey |82 L BEAS D HSEFROEESE RSN M-S oD DL A 4003 arati g 0calbese [4 GROLFECE | SEFEC4ZO03T [€T148 leElocsiy o 28 3
T 'SP RO e[S ELE T A5 B PERSEEL Y 1909 SO-GL0Z L LG s 200 ek 0G0 g58 [ BEQEIPEMDE L0105 |62 Ly EO-BLGZLLE O Z3 ]
EEg SRIEEEE]
) Sujzgroyny

Gt ¥




EL DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE 16222019
Ei DORADD COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT PREPARED BY Kaihleen Freeman
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (including division} Phone # B30-644-95230
DEPOSITOR NUMBER 808551
EMTER COIN AND CURRENGCY (auto populates Total Deposit section) Total Deposit Saction
.3 001X 0 |3 L 1.00 %} 0 {3 - COIN 0.00
§ $ 005)x] o |3 - |3 500 x| o |s . CURRENCY 0.00
Si$ 010ix] 0 | - 1% 1000ix{ 0 ls - CHECKS 24 522 22
2ls 025(x] o |3 - 1% 2000fx] 0 |s . OFF - SITE 0.00
§ $ 050(x| o |s - |$  soo0|x) 0 |s DIRECT 0.00
$ 10000{x{ 0 {s 101222019
Total Coin: $ - Total Currency: s
TOTAL
Enter Total Chﬁcks:l::j Rnter Total fositets: DEPGSIT 24,522.22
Enter Total Direct Daposit\Wire:

GENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES {type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):

=)
; ORG :}mg‘é; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (30 CHARACTERS MAX.) AMOUNT
1 IB5610001 6040 408 Girant for Rescue Boat - SMUD 20,000.00
2 |B561000| 4500 125 Wallet badye - Chief 95.00
3 85651000 4100 316 Deisted Surplus Equipment Refund 172.00
4 85510001 4021 328 Ruty Boot Reimbursement - McKay 20.63
5 1B561000] 6040 408 Sale of Surplus Equipment 227.25
6 185610001 4840 226 MDC Refund 1,722.50
7_|8561000 6040 408 Bale of Surplus Equipment 2,054.06
8 |8561000) 4022 201 T-Bhirts 40.00
9 18561000) 4022 291 T-Shirts 40.00
10 18561000 3002 199 USAR Reimbursemet - Rarmirez 126,78
11 [8561000] 4022 209 T-Shirts 24.00
12
13
14
15
18
JOE HARN, ¢.PA ﬁ’um QR/CONTROLLER . . ‘Gl MABEETY, TREASURER /TAX COLLECTOR
BY x,f’iﬁﬁ‘z.r'f”" e BY L. G- L o
DATE Fabi ‘ DATE 1~
DP # 4 CERTIFIED INTO THE

COUNTY TREASURY JENUMBER | 2019- -

@—pd)gl ;;’ } l!"l{“{ UNDER SECTION GOVT INPUT BY —

CODE 27008
ISTRIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR | GREEN - TREASURY ! YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECE|R Updated 111123




EL DORADO COUNTY
DEPOSIT PERMIT

TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE 102212019
El DORADOD COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRIOT PREPARED BY athizen Freeman
DEPARTMENT OR AGENGY NAME (including divisian) Phone # 5305449530
DEPOSITOR NUMBER BOBSE
ENTER COIM AND CURRENCY {auio popuiates Telal Deposit section) Tolal Deposit Baction
5 $ 001Xt o |8 - s qo0lx| o COIN 0.00
Gi% 005|x| © |§ - 13 500{x| 0 {s - CURRENCY - 0.00
3% otwlx| o s -~ 1% 1000lx| o |s CHECKS 8,389.50
2l 025ix] 0 |8 - |s 2000lx| © |s ] OFF - SITE 0.00
518 050(x] o | - 1% sp00jx| o |s DIRECT 0.00
° § 10000 (xt 0 s 10/2212019
Total Coin: 3 Total Currency: s
TOTAL
Enter Total Checks:[:: Enter Total fosites: DEPOSIT 8,389.50
Enter Total Direct DaposiUWire:l $ - l
GENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES {type apustro'phe first if there are leading zero):
5 : .
i ORG Sﬁﬁ'g‘é; PROJECT STRING DESCRIFTION {30 CHARACTERS MAX.) AMOUNT
1 85610001 1401 223 Plan Rev./insp. 3505 N. Canyon - 348,00
4 18561000] 1401 - 233 Site Review 4480 Pilot Creek 186.00
3 |85610001 1401 223 Fire Alarm 1166 Broadway 418,00
4 18561000] 1401 223 Site Review 186.00
§ _|85610001 1401 223 Site Review Storage Containers 186.00
& BS61000] 1401 k] Bite Raview Oro Loma Dr. 186.00
7 |8581000] 1404 Pk Site Review 5980 Blarney Way 186.00
B |8661000] 1401 223 rire Flow Letier - Pampas Lane 186.00
9 8561000 1401 223 Site Réview - 4633 Jenkinson Circle 186.00
10 18561000] 1401 a2 Site Raview 3681 Soap Plant Road 186.00
11 (8561000 1401 273 Site Review 3510 Joshua Road 186.00
12 18561000] 1401 223 She Review 1081 El Campo Road 186,00
13 185610001 1401 223 Gite Review 4541 Jankinson Circle 186.00
14 (B561000] 1401 243 Site Review 5361 Weaping Willow Ct 186.00
S |1BEE1000] 1401 223 Site Review 4921 Cable Craek Road 186.00
16 18561000) 1403 223 Fire Alarm 6181 Pine &} ; 390.00
JOE HARN, qe.g?'auoﬂmmg_ﬂnmouaﬂ N I C.L RAFFETY, TREASURER/TAX COLLEGTOR
BY A e ' BY b S0 b b
DATE s PATE 147 - 2 M Y
[ f'{'- f_.l’
‘ CERTIFIED INTQ THE
DP # Yy '“C) o2 COUNTY TREASURY | YENUMBER 1 2019- -
ot 4 ! / h UNDER SECTION GOVT
Z’ CODE 27003 INPUT BY

ISTRIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR / GREEN - TREASURY | YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEI?

Updated 111118




DEPOSIT PERMIT

EL DORADO COUNTY

PAGE 20F 2
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE Qctober 22, 2019
EZi DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (Including Division) PREPARED BY .
PHONE NUMBER: 808861
DEPOSITOR NUMBER
GENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):
§
;  ORG SS&E&; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (50 GHARACTERS MAX) AMOUNT
17 8561000 1401 . 223 Site Review 4731 Jubilee Trail 186.00
18 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 4285 Lorrain St 186.00
19 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 4293 Lorrain St 186.00
20 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 2585 Cold Springs Road 186.00
21 8561000 1401 223 Sire Review Coon Hollow 186.00
22 8561000 1401 223 Plan Rev./ Insp. Fea 2234 Cabls Road 372.00
23 | 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 5161 Alder Dr 186.00
24 ‘8561000 1401 223 Plan Rev./Insp. Fee 4420 Business Dr 547 00
25 8561000 1401 223 Plan Rev./Insp. Fee Business & Product 1.517.80
26 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 5040 Miton Ranch 188.00
27 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 3220 Harmony Hill 186.00
28 8561000 1401 223 Site Review 2245 Frosty Fir Drive 186.00
29 8561000 1401 223 Plan Rev./Insp. Fea1166 Broadway 518,70
30 8561000 1401 . 223 Site Review 5670 Thompson Hill 186.00
| : ‘
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
" JOE HARN, g, P, ;5 AU mm GONTROLLER Gl RAEFETY, mmq\mamm COLLECTOR
BY i N BY L, chocmooh Lo
DATE 4 A DATE f{r" IR
i ¢ P
DP# - “ [7 L COUNTY TREASURY B;:TCEH

N - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIPT

i

wl? BECTION GOVT CODE} CODED BY




EL. DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM : DATE 10/22/2019
£} DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT PREPARED BY Kathleen Fraeman
DEPARTMENT OR AGENGY NAME (including division) Phone # 530-844-9630
DEPQSITOR NUMBER BOBEG
ENTER COIN AMD CURREMCY (auto populates Total Deposit section) Total Depozif Section
| $ 001} 0 |s - |3 100{x| 0 |s . COIN 0.00
o|l8 005|x] 0 Is - 1% s00]x] 0 [s CURRENCY 0.00 |
3ls o10|x| o |3 - 1s 1woolx| o s ] CHECKS 2732250 |
Eis o025ixl o |s - 1% 2000|xi 0 (s ) OFF - SITE 0.00
E18 050 (x| 0 |% - |8 soooixf o |s - DIRECT 0.00
© 5 10000{x| o0 |3 1012212019
Total Coin: 5 - Total Currency: s
TOTAL
Enter Total Checks:l:::] Enter'Totalfositeﬁ: DEPQOSIT 2,322.50
Enter Totat Diract Depusitf‘ﬁ!ire:[ 3 - l

GENERAIL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first If thare are leading zero):

)
z ORG Sf;gg; PROJECT STRING | DESGRIPTION (30 GHARACTERS MAX ) AMOUNT
1_18561000) 1401 223 Site Review - 3161 Shingle Springs Dr 186.00
2 1B581000[ 1401 223 . |Solar - 715 Main St 475.50
3 18581000 1401 223 Incideni Report 40,00
4 |85610001 1401 223 - 1Site Review 532 Main St. 186,00
5 |B561000| 1401 223 Site Review 4064 Flying C Road 186.00
8 18561000] 1401 223 Re-Submittal 420 Main St 186.00
7_|8561000} 1401 223 Water Storage 3137 Big Qak Ct 278.00
8 [B5A1000f 1404 ‘ 223 Incident Report 20,00
9 185661000] 1401 223 Incident Report 20,00
10 18561000 1401 223 Site Review - Circus 186.00
11 |8561000] 1401 223 Ptan Rev./insp. Fee 4242 Sports Club Drive 372.00
12 185610007 1401 223 Slte Review 4960 Flying © " 186.00
13
14
15
16 , .

JOE HARN, G:P.A AUDITOR / CONTROLLER . C.L. RAEFETY;~ TREASURER / TAX COLLECTOR
BY f-“ﬁ-"/ / {,_W_M--f'”""“ ) cowy e Y Y-
DATE Ld i A patE__ {0V o dy e
Ao o !
;
L ceeeoions [ e woween | oo
| S )Y | meemsenoneo [ wpuray
NSTRIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR f GREEN - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIP Updated 171718

=y

i e



EL. DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE 10222018
£l DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT PREPARED BY Kathlean Freeman
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (inghuding division) Phone # 530.644-9630
DEPOSITOR NUMBER 8085&1
ENTER COIN AND CURRENCY (auto populates Total Deposit seciion) : Total Deposit Section
8 001(x] 0 |3 - |3 1.00{x{ 0 |3 . COIN 0.00
g1% 005|x| 0 |3 - 18 s00]x| 0 |s CURRENCY 0.00
S8 o1w|x] o | - |8 tooolx] o |s . CHECKS 17.572.00
Els 025(x} o |3 - I8 00(x| o |s ) OFF - SITE 0.00
-§-$ 050 Ix} ¢ |3% - 1% 5000|x] 0 |s . DIRECT 0.00
O 100001ix) 0 is - 2212019
Total Coin: s . Total Gurrency: 5
TOTAL
Enter Total Checkﬁ:[:m—_:l Enter Total fosnes: DEPOSIT 17,572.00
Enter Total Direct Deposib‘Wim:

GENERAL | EDGER ACCQUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):

s
; ORG ,Smg:; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (30 CHARACTERS MAX.} AMOUNT

1 |B561000{ 1400 431 Inspection Fee's July, August 2019 3,242 .50
2 186681000| 1400 431 Inspection Fee's June 2019 14,320.50

3

4

5

8

7

8

a

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

JOE HARN, /}? AUDITOR  CONFROLLER L A CSRAFFETY, TREASVRER | TAX COLLECTOR
PRIy
DATE & yf/;m/'f’ﬁ pATE \, f‘) A “
sl
BF 7 Y copmmere [ ewoween | 20t
o seeronon [ oy
HSTRIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR / GREEN - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT REGEIP Updated 11118

A 0o
P A W T
e aratl




1ermpun g YING IOk SHE LRI TN IR CIEF DD G WBRATISS T

e (R =T SIS JUT PEE ESFT-020E-S1SY: AU 4903 0e0s i gsg BLOZHZOL | 5lyEoLd003 ZEEO-0Z0Z] @ £9EE !
FEGITE Y
Jopuag nousy uojduaseg s Bpos S50 sleg B 3 funouny \u agoanp | NS | Jepuen &mwa.q
) B3ty gﬂ \qﬁ QJ.Q TN
SILA T ) Burzpowgny
SAAHIE WO ST UV OIvS HOJ ZUNISTHS NIF2 SYRMNTT HO0I¥d ON LvHl ONY GSRB044Sd 50 0093A1E0 NS5 SAvH Ry
£HELSHE IHI AS IS0 HOL ANYSEIITN JHIM MOTAE 0R1SIT ONY SIHOVLLY [SIEDI0AN] SHL A OIINASTE0 SHOMUIS HO SITENY THE 19HE AGILMEED AGTEH
20 PNy ig pajipiy

oU0BG'EY ] ETe SIS S04 SLOT-YE-01 DT 10T 52
Hiz e J =t Bty H- TR
Fjeg Uelg A5 patereag] P8 # DESE-PPO-DES +3L01dd JTEUCT
UBIsaLS Baa|ey g
SUEDE pouedaty
wegq fdoy Af] pasdog) GLOE-#E-0L HEg

[x] EDROE-¥i3 BaSiiEy  dnuow 40] feg Eon

1810 8414 Ajunog opelog i
GBI UNMEG  AQ PSYELIJEL ABELInY IREN J3A S
MOEE I0VLS SHL M oK1 HEGEST FUGSIG BPIENG - [Suopus) TBHEWE )

gie:

HOMNEILSHE HOEHD SLY0IaN: 35V

LAD aveprEiup sajgeded 14 siogonoy




MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING
This MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING (*MOU™) is made and entered into this

day of 2 2019, by and between the El Dorado County Fire Protection District
("ECT™), and the City of Placerville Police Department (*PPD™). The PPD and ECF may be

referred to collectively as “Parties”™ or in the singular as “Party,” as the context requites.

This MOU estabhishes a collaborative relationship between ECF and the PPD to support ECF’s
work to enforce public safety laws and regulations related to fire safety, and investigate possible
violations of such laws and regulations. The public agencies executing this MOU do not intend
it 1o be a joint powers agreement, nor do they intend to create through this MOU & joint powers
agency or entity as such terms are defined in the Joint Exercise of Powers Act, California
Government Code 6500, et seq.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises contained hercin, the Parties
hereby agree as follows:

1. Services Provided by the PPD. The PPD will provide ECF with the following services:

a. Training. The PPD is not responsible for providing ECF employees with training
equivalent 1o the Regular Basic Course for peace officers; ECF will provide or
make available such training to ECF emplovees (“Enforcement Officers™).
However, the PPD will assign Enforcement Officers to ride-alongs with PPD field
training officers to give the Enforcement Officers a practical understanding of the
lopics learned during Regular Basic Course training. In addition, the PPD will
provide training to Enforcement Officers in less lethal use of force and annual
traming sufficient to comply with Commission on Peace Officer Standards’
Continuing Professional Training (“CPT") requirements,

b. Range Use and Oversight. The PPD will provide Enforcement Officers with
access to the PPD’s range at reasonable times and under the supervision of the
PPD’s range master for the purpose of allowing Enforcement Officers to practice
with firearms.

¢. Equipment Purchasing. The PPD will aliow ECF to purchase tirearms, personal
protective equipment, and related supplies through the PPD at the PPD’s cost
whenever the Parties may legally do so under California’s competitive bidding
laws.

d. Armorer Service. The PPD will provide ECF with typical armorer services.
ECF will be responsible for providing any needed parts.



2.

Nondiscrimination Clause. All Parties shall comply with Title VI of the Civil Rights
Act of 1964, as amended; Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973; the Age
Discrimination Act of 19753, as amended; and all requirements imposed by or purstiant to
the regulations of the ULS. DOJ implementing those laws at 28 C.F.R. Parts 41 and 42
issued pursuant to Title VI relating to discrimination on the grounds of race, color, creed,
sex, age or national origin and equal employment opportunities.

Term of Agreement. This agreement shall continue indefinitely unless terminated by
the Parties. The MOU may be terminated at any time by the mutual agreement of ECF
and the PPD. Either Party may terminated the MOU without the other Party’s agreement
after providing written notice of the intent to terminate at least 30 days in advangce.

Liability, Indemnification, and Responsibility. For the purpose of indemnification,
each Party shall be responsible for the acts, errors, or omissions of its assigned officers,
agents or employees, and shall incur any Habilities arising out of the services and
activities of those officers or agents. No Party shall be responsible for the acis, errors, or
omissions of another Party’s officers, agents or employees, nor incur any liabilities
arising out of the services and activities of another Party’s officers, agents or employees.
Each Party shall delend, indemnify, and hold harmless the other Party and its governing
board, officers, agents, contractors, and employees against any and all third-party
demands, debis, hens, claims, Josses, damages, liability, costs, expenses (including,
without limitation, attorney’s fees and costs actually incurred, whether ot not litigation
has commenced), judgments and obligations, actions, or causes of action whatsoever
arising from the actions or omissions of that Party and its officers, agents, or employees,

Severability, If any term, provision, covenant or condition of this MOU is held by a
court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, void or unenforceable, the remainder of the
provisions shall remain in full force and effect.

Assignment. No Party may assign any right or obligation pursuant to this MOU. Any
attempt or purported assignment ot any right or obligation pursuant to this MOU shall be
vord and of no effect.

Authority. The Parties hereby represent and warrant that each party has the authority to
enter into and perform the duties and responsibilities described in this MOU.

Amendment. This MOU may be moditied or amended at any time by the Parties;
provided, however, that no supplement, modification or amendment of this MOU shall be
binding unless executed in writing by the Parties.



9. Captions. The headings or captions in this MOU are for identification purposes only and
shall have no effect upon the construction or interpretation of any part thereof,

H). Integration. This MOU embodies the entire agreement of the Parties in velation to the
scope of services herein described, and no other agreement or understanding, verbal or
otherwise, exists between the Parties.

11, Governing Law. The interpretation and enforcement of the MOU shall be governed by
the laws of the State of California, the state in which the MOU is signed, The Parties
agree to submit any disputes ansing under the MOU to a court of competent jurisdiction
located in Bl Dorade County, Calitornia.

12. Signatures. The undersigned represents that he/she has the authority to execute this
agreement on behalf of the Party they represent, The Parties, evidenced by their
signatures hereto, agree that this MOU shall be effective upon approval of all Parties. It
i3 further acknowledged by all Parties that if a certain portion of this MOU is held invalid
or unconstitutional, such a decision shall have no effect on the validity of the remaining
provisions of the MOU and such remaining provisions shall be in full force and effect.

REQUESTING CONTRACT ADMINISTRATOR CONCURRENCE:

By: Dated:

Joseph Wren, Commander
Placerville Police Department

By: Dated:

Brandon McKay, Fire Marshall
El Dorado County Fire Protection District

11
i
I
I

(Chiefs’ signatures on following page)

-3-



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties have caused this MOU to be duly executed as of the day
and year first above written.

PLACERVILLE POLICE DEPARTMENT

By: ) Dated:

James M. Ortega, Chief of Police

EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

By: Dated:

Lloyd Ogan, Fire Chief’



El DORADO CQUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE 2019-02

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE EL DORADO
COUNTY FIRILE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD) adopting the 2019 Edition of the
California Fire Code, incorporating the 2018 Edition of the Jnternational Fire Code, regulating and governing the
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the oceupancy of
buildings and premises in the El Dorado County Fire Protection District; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2016-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District and
all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD, also known as the El Dorado County Fire
Protection District:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
The El Dorado County Fire Protection District makes certain changes (listed below) to the California
Fire Clode, 2019 Edition, pursvant to Health & Sofety Code Sections 13869.7, 179587 and 18941.5 during this

code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, geological and/or topographical
conditions. The El Dorade County Fire Protection District has adopted, pursuant to Section 189415 of the
California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions by Resolution #2019-08 of

the El Dorado County Fire Protection District dated October 17, 2019,

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

The E! Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2019 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in

its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the Jnternationad Fire Code, 2018 edition not

adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 1



Exclugions: 105.6.17-105.6.19, 105.6.39, 308.1.4, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.1, 403,2.1-403 2.4, 403.3,
403.4, 403.6, 403.7, 403.8 (adopting 403.8.1-403.8.1.7), 403.9, 403.10.2, 403.10.3, 403.11, 403.12, 404. 1-404.4,
405.1-405.4, 405.6-405.9, 406, B05-807 (adopting 807.5.2), 808, 904.1.1, 1101, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.6, 1103.9
(adopting 1103.9.1), 1103.10, 1104-1106, Chapter 25, Chapter 26, the exceptions under D104.2 (Exception),
D106.1 (BException), D107.1 (Exception), Appendix A, Appendix E, Appendix F, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2019 Culifornia Fire

Code.

SECTION 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1

Section 101 Scope and General Requirements

- 101.1 Title shall be amended as follows: Add name of furisdiction [El Dorado Coumy Five Protection
District, ECFPDY

- Bection 105 Permits

- 105.6.27 1 PG-gas shall be amended as follows: Add to the exception: At or above 5,000 feet of

elevation, a permit is not required for individual containers with a 125-gallon water capacity or less,
or multiple container systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding 125 gailons scrving

occupancies in Group R-3.

- Bection 106 Fees

- 1066 Permit, Plan Review and Inspection Fees shall be added as tollows: A4 schedule of fees

adopted by the district board of directors for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permils
by the district may be found in the most current district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

- 106.6.1 Cost Recovery Fees shall be added as follows: Fire service fees may be charged to any

person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district fo respond to the scene of an incident. 4
district board may charge a fee 1o cover the cost of any service which the district provides or the
cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The
Jee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an
incident,

- 106.7 Administrative Costs shall be added as follows: When @ rest or inspection is scheduled, and

the contractor fails (o perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 2



AL may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location

and the time spent of the fest/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

- Section 109 Board of Appeals

- Section 109.4 Appeal Procedures and Timelines shall be added as follows: Amy person or entity

who believes they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the
Jire code official through o written notice may appeal this matter within 13 calendar days of the
postmark on the notice.  All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the
CGroverning Board for the district, A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official
until the matter is determined by the Appeal Board as owtlined in Section 1092, unless the issue
poses an imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall
notify the appellunt by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail.
The appellant shall have the right 1o appear in person or by agent al the hearing and present oral,

written and/or photographic evidence to the Appecl Board.

- Section 110 Violations

- 110.4 Violation Penaltics shall be amended as follows: Persons who shall violate a provision of

this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,
alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire
code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be puilty of 2
misdemeanor or infraction, af the discretion of the prosecuting attorne) or agency, puntshable by a
fine not exceeding 3/00.00 jor a first violation;, 2. A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second
violation of the same provision within one year; 3. A fine not exceeding §1000.00 for each
additional violation of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding /80
days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Sgfety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

- 11042 Citations shall be added as follows: The Fire Chief or histher duly authorized

represesiative, may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant
to Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter Sc
{commencing with Section 833.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the Stare of Califormia,

-~ Section 112 Stop Work Order

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 3



- 1324, Failuge to Comply shall be amended as follows: Any person who shall continue any work

after having been served with a stop-work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisorment or

hoth as described in Section 1704 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17993).

Chapter 2

- Section 202 General Definitions

- Add definition for Campfire - Shall mean o fire which is used for cooking, personal wearmth,
lighting, or aesthetic purposes.  This includes fires comtuined within ourdoor fireplaces and
enclosed stoves with flues or chinmeys, stoves using fellied, liguid, or solid fuels, portable burbecue
pirs, braziers, or space heating devices which are used outside of any structure, mobile home, or
any living accommodation mounted on o vehicle.

- Add definition for District - Shall mean the district and all other areas within the exterior
boundaries thereof row or hereafter established.

- Add definition for Briveway - Shall mean a vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no
more than two (2) residential units and any number of non-commercial or industriol buildings on each
parcel.

- Add definition for Executive Body - Shall mean the Board of Directors of the District.

- Add definition for Fire Chiel - Shall mean the Chief Execurive Fire Officer of the Fire
department/disirict serving the jurisdiction or a duly authorized reprexentative.

- Add definition for Trained Crowd Manager - Shall mean stemdby personnel, wsually a security

guard or usher personmel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from o tent or

other place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of un emergency.

Chapter 3

Section 302 Definitions

1

- 302.1 BPefinitions shall be amended as follows: Added Campfire definition, as shown above in
Chapter 2.

- Section 307 Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Outdoor Fireplacey

- 307.4.4 Campfire Resirictions shall be added ag follows:

- 307448 Jr iy unkowful for aay person to light, maintain, or use a campfire upon or near any brush-
covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land during the time when burning permits are
suspended by the Director of the Depariment of Forestry and Fire Protection, the CAL FIRE Unit
Chief, or the AHJ.

Exception: Commercial cooking operations with approval of the AHJ.

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 4



- 307442 When campfires are allowed, it should be unlawful for any person to light, mairain, or
use a campfive upon any brush-covered land, grass-covered land, or forest-covered land urless the
Jollowing mintmum requivements are complied with.

- 307.4.4.2 (a) The areq within 3 feet of the periphery of the campfire iy cleared of all flanmable
materiad and vegetation.

- 307.4.4.2 (b) One serviceable shovel with a handle of af feast 12 inches v ready for use at the
immediate area of the campfire,

- 307.4.4.2 (¢) Campfires shall be limited to a 1 foot by | foor areq, wunless i oan approved
manufuctured cooking device or fire ring.

- 307.4.4.2 (&Y Written permission of the londowner must be obilained prior to the ignition of the

campfire and shall be on site.

Chapter 3

- Soection 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- 503.2.1 Dimensions shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads shall have an

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, as measured from fuce of curb (o
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and unobstructed
vertical clearance of not less than 15 feer. Al driveweys in the district shall not be Tess than 12 feet
wide,

- 503.2.3 Dead Ends shall be amended as follows: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads amed
driveways in excess of 150 feet in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around
fire apparatus.

- 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces shall be amended as follows: Where a bridge or an

elevated surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and
maintained in accordance with the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Cade, whichever iy more restrictive, Bridges
and elevated surlaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire
apparatus, Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the Fire
Code Official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces
which are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs, or both shall be installed
and maintained when required by the fire code official.

- 503.4.2 No Parking in Fire Lanes shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, puark, or leave

standing any vehicle, whether atlended or unattended, excepr when necessary to avoid conflict with
other traffic or in compliance with the divections of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or afficial iraffic control device along the edge of any hisghway, at any

cirb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facifity,

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 5



designated as a five lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located,
The designation shall be indicated (1) by @ sign posted immediately adjacent 1o, and visible from,
the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is a fire
lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with
the words “FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red peint
on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words "FIRE LANE".

- 503.4.3 No Parking in Front of Hydrants shall be added as follows: No person shall stop, park, or
leave standing any vehicle within 13 feel of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the fiont sear and who can immediately move such
vehicle in case of necessity. (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department and Is
clearly marked as a five department vehicle,

- 503.4.4 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width shall be added as follows: Fire lanes shall be based on

road width as reguired in Appendix D as amended by the district.

- 503.5.3 Firc Apparatus Access Gates shall be added as Tollows: Al awtomatic and manual gates

installed over fire apparatus aceess roads shall comply with the district gate standard ay approved

hy the fire code official.

- Bection 503 Premise Ydentifieation

- 5651 Address ldentification shall have the first ling of this paragraph amended as follows:

Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply with the district address standard as

approved by the fire code official.

«  Section 807 Fire Protection Water Supplies

- 507.3.1 Where Required shall be amended as follows: 400 feet shall be amended to 150 féer.

- Section 509.3 Fire Control Room

- 5093 Fire Control Room Fire Protection and Utility Eguipment Tdentification and Access, s

hereby amended by adding the following to read: Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels,
solar photovoltaic power system rapid shuroff switches, and other five detection, suppression, or
similar control switches shal be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The fire
control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feel in size with a total useable
areq of not less than 33 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on an outside
wall af a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the exterior. An
exterior aceess door with a clear width of not less than 37 inches and a height not less than 80
inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be affixed to the exterior of
the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM™ in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 6



key box complying with Section 306 shall be installed on the exterior side of the fire control room
door opening. The room must be capable or maintaining o minimum temperature of 40 degrees
Fahrenheit. A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkier risers 1o any
adjucent walls, This room can be shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment

that is compatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided 1o store record plans of the

Sire sprinkler system, other fire profection equipment, and site plans. This room shall not be wsed

Jfor any other storage.

Chapter 9

Section 903 Fire Sprinklers

203.2 Where Required shall be amended as follows: An approved automatic sprinkler system shafl

he required and installed in new buildings and structuwres 3600 square feet or greater when
constructed or relocated within the furisdiction gy described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.
Excepfion: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial purposes.

903.2.4 Where Required shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600

square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than ome and two-famify
dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structive I3 increased by an addition of more than thirty
percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet whichever is less, such building or structure shall be made to
corform lo Section 903, 2,

903.2.b Where Reguired shall be added as follows: Status of existing buildings less than 3,600

square feer. In existing bulldings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and rwo-family dwelling

nnits, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, where the

Hoor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage over 3,600 square feel,

by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 square feet, whichever iy less, such
building or structure shall be made to conform 1o Section 903.2.
903.2.1 Group A shall be amended as follows for A groups A-1 through A-4: 903.2.1.1 (1) The fire

area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

903.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows: 903.2.3 (1) Throughout all Group E fire areas
greater than 3,600 square fzet in area.

903,2.4 Group F-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.4 Group F. 903.2.4 (1) A Group F fire area

exceeds 3,600 square feel.
903.2.7 Group M shall be amended as follows: 903.2.7 Group B and M. 903.2.7 (1) A Group B

and M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

903.2.8.2 Manufactured Homes shall be added as tollows: An antomatic fire sprinkler spstem shell

be required in ol new marufactwed homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 7



as a one-gnd two-family dwelling. The design and instollation of such systems shall be in
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300),
Exceptions:

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobilehome park complving with
California Healtht emd Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3,

2. Muanufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square fect in size and serve as an
aceessory dwelling unit, as defined in Goverament Code Section 638302; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not reguired to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3. Manmfactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.

- 903,29 Group S-1 shall be amended as follows: 903.2.9 Group 8. 903.2.9 (1) A Group 8 fire arca
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

- 303,210 Group 8-2 Enclosed Parking Garages shall be amended as follows: 903.2.10 (1) Where

the fire area of the enclosed parking sarage exceeds 3,600 square feet.

- Bection 7 Fire Alarm and Detection Svstems

- 907.2.2a Where Reguired — New Buildings or Structures less than 3,600 sguare feet shall be

added as follows: An approved fire alorm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with o
Hoor areq less than 3,600 square feet.
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other pcoupancies classified
as L),

28]

Agricultural buildings not under special use permit andior not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., refoils sales, food service, and/or special events),

3. Buildings with u floor area less than 300 square feel may be exempt, as determined
by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative, bosed on building
construction material and features, location, occupancy type, and distance to
exposures.

- 907.2.b Status of Existing Buildings shall be added as follows: [ existing buildings without an

approved automatic sprinkier system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural
building not under special use permit for commercial purposes where o fire alarm derection system
does not exist eand the floor area of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than
thirty percent (30%0) or 1,000 square feet, whichever is less, such building or structure shall be
made to conform to Section 907 when requived by the Fire Chief or histher duly authorized

representative.  Buildings with o floor area lesy than 300 square feet may be exempr, as determined

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 8



by the Fire Chief, or histher duly awthorized representative, based on bullding conspruction
malterials and features, location, occupancy type, and distance 1o exposures.

- 907.2.c Monitoring shall be added as follows: AN fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected

directly through and monitored by a UL approved central, propriciary or remote station service,
which gives audible and visual signals ot a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings
shall be monitored,
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Oceupancies and other ocoupancies classified
as U,

b

Agriculturad buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

- 907.2.d Tvpe I Hood Installations shall be added as follows: The requiremem of installation, or

replacement, of @ Type I Hood Svstem shall require a fire alarm/sprinkier monitoring system (o be
installed, or for the hood system to be connected 1o an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring
system for that building.

-~ 907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply shall be added as follows: Jr accordance with NFP4 72, the

secondary power supply providing o minimum 24-howr power capacity under guiescent loud
{sustent apergiing in o hron-alarm condition) shall be amended 1w o minimum 72-hour power
cupaciiy,

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed the

requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12,

Chapter 12

- Bection 1203 Fmergency and Standby Power Systems

- 12683.1.3 Installation shall be amended as follows: Emergency power systems and standby power
systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the Califomia Electric
Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 11, All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not wsed for commercial purposes, with stendhy power, shall have a shunt
irip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code official.

Existing installations shull he maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
- Bection 3310 Access for Firefighting

- 3310.3 Premise Identification shall be added as follows: Prior 1o and during consiruction, an

approved address sign shall be provided et each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry imo

the profect.

Ordinance 2019-02 Page @



- Section 3312 Wadcer Supply for Fire Protection

- 3312.1 When Required shall be amended as follows: Prior to combustible materials arriving on

site, the fire hydrant water system shall be instatled and maintained in continnous operation. The

cmnount of water supplivd shall meet the required fire flow for the project,

Chapter 49
- Bection 4903 Pians

- 4903.1 Where Required shall be added as follows: The fire code official of the Ef Dorado County

Fire Protection District may requive development projects located in Moderate, High and Very-High
Five Hazard Severity Zones to submit fire protection plan. This plan shall be approved by both the
Jire code official and the anthorized representative for the local CAL FIRE Unit Chief (if located in
the State Responsibility Area (SRA]) prior to the recording of the final map for the project by the

County af £t Dorado.

- Bection 4905 Wildfire Protection Building Construction

- 49054 Rool Construction Requirements shall be added as follows: Al mew construction,

ncluding additions, requires a Class A roof covering or assembly. All re-roofing requires Class 4
roof covering or assembly as « minimum. Re-roofing in excess of 50% of an exisiting structure
within any one year period will necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roof covering or
assembly as o minimum, Class B or C fire retardeant treated and or non-treated wood shake or

shingles are not approved as a roof covering material for Class A assembly.

Chapter 50

«  Section 5008 General

- 8001.7 Liability for Damages shall be added as follows: Any dumages or cost resulting firom the
careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materiols shall constituent debt against any
such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire
Chigf, or histher duly authorized representative, in the same manner as in the ease of an abligation
under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56

- Section 5601 General

- 20601.2 Permit Regutired shall be amended as follows: Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105.6 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where explosives permits are required,
they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or histher duly awthorized representative, and the El Doveado

County Sheriff's Department or the Plaeerville Police Department. Where fireworks permits are

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 10



required, they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized vepresentative, and the
El Dovado County Board of Supervisors,

- 5601.2.1 Documentation shall be added as follows: The 4HJ shall have the authority 1o request

documerdation regarding all aspects of the fireworks presentation.

- 8601.2.2 Proprictary Information shall be added as follows: The AR will protect all proprictary

informeation,

Chapter 57

Section 5704 Storage

- 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as

follows: Storage of Class 1 and Class it flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings
is prohibited wnless approved by the Fire Chief, or histher duly cuthorized representative, When
permitted by the Fire Chief, or hissher duly authorized represemative, all above ground tenk(s) or
vault installations for the storage of Class 1 Hl or I flammable and combustible liquids shatl comply
with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The Californiu Fire Code shall also
apply te installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations wheve above-ground storage is

reguired.

- Bection 5706 Special Operations

- 5706,2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited shall be amended as follows:

Storage of Class | and Class H flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited wunless approved by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative. When
permitted by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative, all above ground rank(s) or
vault installations for the storage of Class 1 1 or I flammable and combustible liquids shall
comply with those reguirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code
shall also apply to installations other r.hcm motor vehicle fuel dispensing starions where above-

ground storage is required,

Chapter 58

- Section 5806 Flammable Crvogenic Fluids

- 5806.2 Limitations shall be amended as follows: Storage of flammable ¢ryogenic fluids in
stationary containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the Fire Chief, or histher
duly authorized representative. When permitted by the Fire Chief or histher duly awthorized
representative, all stationary containers for the storage of flammable crvogenic fluids shall comply

with those requirements as set forth by the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code shalfl

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 11



also apply w installations other than motor vehicle fuel dispensing stations where above-ground

storage iy reguired.

Chapter 61

- Bection 6104 Location of LP-Gas Containers

- 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits shall be amended as follows: The storage

of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at
least one-half (1/2) mile from praperty zoned or designated for residential use and wt least one-half
(1/2) mile from existing residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit
per acre and al least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHT approved,
und a special/conditioned use permil is issued by the County of El Dovado or the City of Placerville,

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the dispersion
of liquefied perroleum gas for the protection of keavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate
capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a watgr capacity of 2,000 gallons. The dispensing
of liquefied petroleum gus in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located

at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-
half (1/2) mile from existing residentiod development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling
wnit per acre and at least one-half (172) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJI
approved and g special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of EI Dorado or the City of

Placerville,

- Section 6112 Hizh Elevation Liguefied Petrolenwm Gas Installations (5,000-foot elevations and
ghove) shall be added as follows;

- 6112.1 Regulators shall be added as follows;

- Two-stage regulator system shall be installed in accordance with mamifacturer requirements.

= Two-stage regulator systems shall be instalied on all LPCG installations,

- The first stage regulator shall be installed under the hinged gauge cover supplied with the tank,
The atmospheric pressure aperture of the regulator shall be pointed downward,  The first stage
regulator shall be plumbed 1o the riser of the yard piping with soft copper tubing to allow flexibility
should tank shifting occur. The riser from the yard piping shail he located not more than 3 inches
(horizontally) from the walls of the tank.

~  The second stage regulalor and riser pipe shall be installed under the eave of the building, as close
as practicable to the building wall.  This riser shall be securely supportedibraced v the wall
approximately 10 inches below the regulator so as to prevent bending of the pipe by lateral

snewiee loads.

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 12



= A protective cover, approved by the gas supplier and Building Official, shall be installed aver the
second stage regulator and securely supported to the ground or diagonally to the wall,

- The riser pipes fov the yard piping shall not be embedded in conerete. Concrete placed around
such riser shall be held back at least I inch from all sides of the pipe.

- Al the time of application for any building permit, which involves the installation of an LPG system,
the applicant shall submit an LPG system plot plan in 3 coples (or digitally as PDF). The LPG plot
plan shall include, but not be limited to, the wank location, proposed tank capacity in US. gallons,
route of yard piping, location of the riser pipe of the building, property boundavies, and an outling
of all existing/proposed buildings vn the lot and a depiction of the ridgeline of any building 10 be
supplied with LPG.  This shall also be forwarded o the appropriate fire district to serve as a
locator map in event of ain emergency.

- Lovation of the cemterling of LPG tomks shall be permanertly marvked by the use of snow stakes, one
al each end. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height 1o be visible through anticipeated maximum
snow depth at the respective location.  Installation and maintenanee of these snow stakes are the
responsibility of the LPC user,

- Propane appliances and aecessories shall not be pervtiited in any new installcnion below the first
Hoor or below grace, whichever Is morve restrictive,

- 61122 Vertical Riser Piping shall be added as follows:

- Minimum of Schedule 80 - iron piping.

~  The riser shall be within 3 inches horizontally of the tunk,

«  Swing joims shall be installed above and below tank level to provide for the tank movement (Street
elbows shell not be wsed),

- A listed flexible viser constructed of copper or stainless-steel tubing and protected by steel covered
sheathed material may be wsed instead of swing joints. The flexible alternative shall provide

sufficient slack 1o allow for tank movemen,

- 6112.3 Marking and Locations shall be added as follows:

- An approved sign shall be located directly above the riser shut off valve on the building in a visible
location.

- The liguefied petrolewm gas supplier shall affix a weatherproof identification rag 1o the inside of the
tank valve protecting caver. This tag shall contain the supplier's name and emergency telephone
number.

-~ Tank installation shall be permanently marked by a metal or wood material snow marker, with a
minimum dimension of 2 inches by 2 inches. The snow marker shall be of sufficient height (o rise
above the annual snow depth and shall be a minivnm of 1 feet in height. The snow markers shall

be painted yellow and located on opposite ends of the tank.

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 13



Section 6113 Undecpround LPG Tanks Instaliations and Ownership shall be added as follows:

61131 Permits and Plans shall be added as {ollows: Permits shall be required, and plans shall be

submitted for all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ.

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Qwnership shall be added as follows:  Undergrowsd LPG tarks

shall be prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company under a

lease-tvpe system to ensure proper annnal maintenance requirements are met and recorded.

Chapter 80

Section 80, NFPA, 131-16 - Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two

Eamily Dwellings and Manufactured Homes as amended 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5
NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add Section 4.7 to read as follows:

Chapter 80. NFPA 13 4.7 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-ond hwo-family
dwellings shall utilize a “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the Fire Code
Official,

Exception: Manufacrured home installed, tested and approved by the California Deparmment of
Housing ond Commnumity Development,

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 to read as follows:

Chapter 80, NFPA 13D, 5.1.1.2 4 supply of of least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used

within the premises shall be maintained on the property ar an approved location. Stock sprinklers shall
be kept in a mounted and accessible cabinet.
Revise Section 7.6 to read ns follows:

Chapter 80, NFPA 13D, 7.6 A local water flow alarm shafl be provided on all fire sprinkler systems in

homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.
Revise Section 11.2.1.1 to read as foilows:

Chaoter 80, NFPA 13D, 11.2.1.1 Where a fire department putnper connection is not provided, the

system shall be hydrostatically tested at a minivnon pressure of 130 pounds per square inch gauge for
no less than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage, Such test shall be wimessed by the fire

cade official.

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 14



Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

- Table B105.1(1) Required Fire Flow for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, Group R-3, and R-4

Buildings and Townhouses shail be amended as follows for elevations below 3,000 feet:

Code or  Scction
3133 of the CA
Residential Code

BIOS D)
frin, {10086
GPAM)

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FLOW
CALCULATION SPRINKLER FIRE- DURATION
AREA 5YSTEM FLOW {hours)
(square feet) (Design {gallons per
Standard) minnte)
(- 3.600 No autommatic },000 |
‘ sprinkler system
3,601 and greater Mo automatic Vatue in Table Duration in
sprinkler system BIQ3.0(2) Table
BII5.1(2) at the
recuired  fires
‘ flow rate
0 3,600 Seclion 903.3.1.3 A0 ¥
of the CA Fire 16000 ]
Code or Section
333 of the CA
“ Residential Code
360 and greater Section  903.3.1.3 172 wvalue of 4
of the CA Fire Table 2

- Table B1052 Required Fire Flow for Buildings other than One- and Two-Family

Dwellings, Group R-3, and R-4 Buildings and Toewnhouoses shall be amended as

follows:
AUTOMATIC  SPRINKLER MINIMUM FLOW DURATION
SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours)
{Design Standard) (gallons per
minute)

No automatic sprinkler system

Value in Table
B105.1(2)

Duration in Tahle
B1O5.H2)

Section 903311 ol the CA Fire
Code

%% 3085 of the value
it Table BI0S. 1(2) b

Duration in Table
B105.1(2) at the reduced
How rate

Section 903.3.1.2 of the CA Fire
Code (Onlvy applies (o locations
below 5, 000-foor elevation)

25084 304 of the value
in Table B103.1(2)

Duration in Tahle
B103.1(2) at the reduced
flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2019-02




Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Roads

- Section DY03 Minimum Specifications

12103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrapt shall be amended as follows, adding the exception:

- Exception: Driveways
- D103.2 Grade shall be amended as follows: Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not
exceed [3.9% in grade wnless approved by the AHJ or by the El Dorado County amended
California Public Resource Code Title 14/ Design and Improvement Standards Manual,
Exception: Elevation above 5,000 feer shall not exceed 12%.

- D103.3 Turning Radius shall be amended as follows: The minimum turing radivs shall be

determined by the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

- D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates shall be amended as tollows: Subsecrion (1), Where o

single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not lesy than 20 feet (6096 mm). Where a fire
apparatus road consisis of « divided roadway, the gate width shall not be less than 13 feet (4572
mni).

- D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as specified in

Section [2103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 10 29 fest
wide (6096 to 8534.4 mm).
Exception: Elevations above 5,000 ft. as determined by the AFHJ.

- D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width shall be amended as follows: Fire lane signs as

specified in Section D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29
feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).
Exception: Elevations above 3,000 fi. as determined by the AHJ.
- D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall be added as follows: When required
by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed 1o encompass the entively

of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2016-02 of the E] Dorado County Fire Protection District, and all other ordinances or parts

of ordinances herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 3: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, semence, clause or phrase of this code, or
any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid portions
and, therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The El Dorado County Fire Protection District

hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 16



subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them

is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The El Dorado County Fite Protection

District Board Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the
District. [n lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, & summary of the ordinance may be published
by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15} days after its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in

the office of the El Dorade County Fire Protection District pursuant to Government Code Section 369331c) (1),

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire
Protection District on October 17, 2019, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the

Ordinance to be read for the second time on November 21, 2019 and approved by the following vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District this, 21
day of November, 2019,

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

Mark Brunton, Board President

ATTEST:

Kathleen Freeman, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2019-02 Page 17



American River Fire Protection Listrict

P.O. Box 408, 4860 Marshaoll Rd. »« Garden Valley, CA 25633  Phone: { '
Webs www . arfod.org

240 » Fax: (530} 333-2023

Plan for Service

Exhibit B — December 17, 2019 (mdp

Background;

The American River Fire Proteéli istri - verned by a five member Board of
Pirectors elected at large from distri ies. ARFPD currently staffs one full
n engine company and one (1)
Duty Chief. An organization charn station locations has been included.

re Protection District has six Chief Officers, which
t Chiefs (Training Academy/incident Management
., and twa Buﬁulion Chiefs (Operations). All located ot

Administratively Amercan

District coverageteriaigascal @rpergenc:y scene management. The Fire Ch|ef maintains
full-lirme, ; Oong with the District Administrative Assistant, who makeup the

ih River Fre Protection District has a diverse response District ranging from
ral non-hydrant areas to semi-urban areas with hydrants, The District also
includessections of the American River, automatic-aid areas with lakes, multiple wildiand
urban interface threats, heavily used highways and roadways, a number of industrial facilities
and a high school.

Over the years we have developed our performance standards, policies, procedures,
personnel and equipment fo meet these diverse challenges. it is anficipated that our
Adminisirative, Line and Volunteer experience will allow us o blend the newly combined
district info one cohesive fire district.

Once annexation is complete, current ARFPD performance standards, policies and
procedures will be sufficient o operate safely and enable the combined agency to provide
an increased tevel of service to the Lotus/Coloma and Pilot Hilt area residents. Please see the
following "Service Agreement” that has been reviewed and agreed o by both American
River FFD and Bl Dorado County FPD Boards.



Proposed Staffing Services:

1. Garden Valley/Kelsey/Greenwood Community Staffing Upon Annexation

a. Through an "Amador-Plan” contract, CAL FIRE Station 50 in Garden Valley wil
be staffed 24 hours a day, 365 days per year with a migiitium staffing level of
two firefighters, Station 50 will be equipped with a Typ.

b. The Garden Valley area will receive responsé:from “¥plunteers, Resident-
Firefighters at Station 51, and the closest staffedresource, ‘€AL FIRE Station 50.
Equipment assigned to Station 51 will be a pe 1 engine, a 2100-gallon water
tender and three light vehicles. k-

c. Station 52 in Kelsey shall not change its st
Kelsey area will continue to receive res
Frefighters, and the closest staffed resource,
assigned to Station 52 includi % fon “patrof
compliment of hose and equi

fowing an annexdation. the
from Volunteers, Resident-
FIRE Station 50. Eguipment
3 a water tank, pump, a

following an annexation.

with after hour response from Volunleers, Resident-Firefighters,
ffed resource, most likely CAL FIRE Station 50.

d. Station 74 shall be designated as the ARFPD Water Rescue siation, equipped
with a watler rescue boat and personnel trained to a minimum level of Water
Rescue Technician.



e. Through an "Amador-Plan” confract, CAL FIRE Station 50 in Garden Valley shall
be the designated engine company to respond to the Lotus/Coloma area
during hours that Station 74 is unstaffed, Response time from Station 50 o Lotus
is ¥ minutes per Google Maps.

f. The American River fire Protection District headquartersishiall be relocated fo
Station 74 where the offices of the Fire Chief, Deput

the Administrative Assistant will be assigned.

a. Station 72 in Cool shall be staffed 24 ho ear with a
minimum staffing level of two firefighters, e trained
as a Paramedic licensed by the State of Call nd accredited in Bl Dorado

Counly. Additional statfing at Station 72 ab

utilized through the Volunteer-Firefighter and Re f-Firefighter program.

scue station, supported

FPD Technica
sment and bersonnel frained at a

with @ compliment of rope re ue ey

minimum level of Rescue System

service Areas:

a. Populationi=]
b. Businesses -3 ifctuding Kelsey)
ot including Kelsey)

3, Kelsey
a. Pop
b, Busine Unknown
c. Residential Structures — Unknown
d. Square Mileage - Unknown

4. Greenwood
a. Popuiation — 1,691



o

Businesses — 39
Resiclential Structures — 732
. Square Mileage — 282

a0

5 Cool

Population — 3,851
Businesses— 114

Residential Structures - 1,633
. Square Mileage — 252

oo oo

6. Lotus

Population - 888

Businesses ~ 51

Residential Structures - 418
Square Mileage - Unknown

QoTa

7. Coloma
d. Population - 61
b. Businesses - 27
c. Residential Structures - 32
d. Sguare Mileage - Unknown

8. Pilot Hill

dministrative staff supported by two (2) parl-time chief officers with
hours limited to 960 or less per year

d. The two (2) part-fime chief officers may be CalPERS Retired Annuitant
employees in compliance of per Government Code section 7522.56, 21220,
21224, 21227, and 21229.



e. Career staff will fall under labor negotiated contracts and MOU's with the LA F.E
Local 4691 tabor group

f. Existing volunteer and resideni-firefighters will be ulilized throughout the newly
formed agency providing additional stoffing and resotrces fo the Lotus,
Coloma, Cool and Pilot Hill areas.

Beoard of Directors:

The American River Fire Prolection District shall mo by divisichjdistrict if o

majority of voters approve (Health & Saf, Code, § 1 . The election shall be
within two (2} years following the completion of the propo
1. The District Board can submit the pr ‘ ' i ng a resolution fo place

the question on the ballot. {Health
submit the proposal fo voters at a
conducts elections for the Distnct, so
the County elections offic:lol in time

g (b).} The District can
{lbid.) The County
ide the ballol question to
e notice of the guestion.
sheral elections for special districts], 12112
120 days before the election].)

as one of the qu
subd, {d}; see tlec.

oard must "promptly” divide the district into divisions of
number fo each, taking into consideration fopography;
. iguity, integrity, and compactness of teritory; and
the divisions. (Health & Saf. Code, § 13844, subd. (e}.)

division as th rrent, al-lorge Board members' terms expire. Voters will then fill those
vacancies af the general election for the districh. (Health & Saf. Code, § 13844, subd.

(f}.}



Transition Pian:

The American River Fire Protection District will work with the Bl Dorado County Fire Protection
District to ifransfer funds that are sourced from the annexed areas from the point the
annexation is completed until the California Beard of Equalization geassigns the fax base
allocation with a projected date is July 18, 2021,

Equipment located at Stations 72, 73 and 74 shall be negotiat
will remain following the annexation.

DCFPD as to what

Rele of the American River Firefighters Association:

The American River Fire Protection District's Firefighter Ass
confinue fo operate as the newly formed districts assoc
avents and fundraisers.

ton, a 501(C) non-profit shall
o that conducts community

Operations, Training, & Fire Prevention;

The American River Fire Protection District
account for the District’s new daries, reso

entire District boundaries, The American
orado County ordinances consistent with
Pilot Hill areas, eliminating any changes in

The Fire Prevention dutie
River Fire Protection [
the existing fire codes ofikpius, Coloma, Cool and
reguirements,

Station 72 Forian Court, Cool, CA 954614
«  Stotion 73 - 4302 State Highway 49, Pilot Hill, CA 95664

« Station 74 - 5122 Firehouse Road, Lotus, CA 95651



Equipment;

The American River Fire Protection District curent inventory of equipment and projected
location assignment:
» Light Vehicles
o 2018 Chevrolet 2500 Command Vehicle — Assigned o
v Station 74
o 2019 Chevrolet Tahoe ~ Assigned to Fire Chief
= Station 74
o 2018 Chevrolet 2500 EMS Vehicle
n Station 74
o 2006 Ford Crown Victoria
» Station 53
o 2005 Chevrolet 2500
» Station 51
o 2005 Chevrolet 2500
v« Station 74
o 2004 ford Expedition
= Station 72

-time chief officer

e Appardtus

movedto §tation 74 when new Type 3 is delivered)
ngine, 750 gallons, 1,000 gpm pump

¢  Miscellaneous:
o Rescue Boagt

Station 74



Amarican River Fire Protaction Qlatjel
Fire Districi Budget - Fiscal Year 2020-2021

Dopartment - BOB56 2020-2021 2078-2020 Percent
index Code -855500 Fises) Year Fisoat Yoar Diffsrance  incresse
Salaries & Benefits
30600 Ragular Employess 547 008,80 537,068,44 10,844 46 2%
3001 Butra Help 82, 720,00 T1.584.66 513634 T%
3002 Ovartirme 252,504.00 373916.61 -121,414,61 W32%
3004 Other Compenssation 2141138 880,928.7%|  -B40.527.40 “3B%
3020 Retiremant 170,912 .56 182,000,060 -3,087.44 -3%
3021 Suciat Sacunty 75,0686.38 112,744 6819 -3B,078.23 -344%
3022 Medicars 1Y 663,65 26,479 54 -B,016.66 -33%
3040 Health nsurance 143,840.00 172,048,00 20,852.00 17%
3041 Linemplayrnent Insurance 25,000.00 7140587 ~4,453 87 -G5%
3044 Vislon nsurance 0.00 5§,250.00 -5,250.00 =100%
3060 Warkmans' Compangalion 73,427.55 88,000.00 -14,572.45 ~17%
3080 Flaxible Benafita 12,000.00 12,000.00 .08 0%
Satartes & Wepges Total: 1430, 45448 2,490,823.82 1,060 369 08 A%%,
Services & Supplies
4020 Clathing B.050,60 8,050 00 0.00 o
4070 Fire Tumouts V5000 25 Qo000 v24,260.00 -B7%
4040 Communications 3,718.00 4,806.00 ~1,082.00 “23%
4042 Radio Eguipment/active 531" 400.00 2989 .16 -3,.580.18 BT%
4043 Dizpatch Foes 7.000.00 6,000.00 1,000.60 17%
4060 In-service Food 350.00 a61.96 -311.48 A%
4080 Household Expenaa 3,B50.00 4,500.00 -B50.60 ~td%
4085 Refuse Disposal 3,000.00 231,83 2,168.17 261%
4100 Insurance 18,000,00 22,918.00 «4 918 00 -24%
4740 Zeyuigsrient Maintenance 3.300.00 2,587.49 T12.51 28%
4143 Telephone/Radio Maintenznce 2.500.00 1,500.00 1,000,G0 7%
4145 Equipment Maintenance 1,000.60 1,500.00 -500.00 23%
4160 Vehlcle Service 10,100.00 20,000.00 -9,860.00 ~50%
4161 Vehicle Parta & D00.GG §,500.00 -2.500.00 -5
4180 Maintenance of Structuras 16,500,003 55 000.00 -38,500.00 -70%
4197 Maintenance of Buildings 5.000.00 25,000.00 «20.000.00 -B0%
4200 Medicsl Supplies 400,00 3,500.00 «3,100.00 B3
4230 Memberships 1,143.00 3.t00.00 -1,857.00 “B2%
4240 Mise, Expense 1,000.00 0.60 1,000.00 Q¥
#4260 Office Expense 200.00 2 500.00 -1,600.00 Hadh
4261 Poslage 65000 BOR.OG -150.00 -18%
4283 Gubstription 150,00 1,700,600 «1,5E0.00 -51%
4266 PHrting 500.00 1,500.00 -1,000.00 -87%
4300 Prafassional Servicos (CAL FIRE) 287,200.00 T000.60|  2B0,200,00 4003%
4304 Agency Adminialestion [LAFCO) 588.00 1,000.00 -412.00 -41%
4305 Audit and Accounting 2.000,00 0.00 2,060.00 %
4313 Legal Services 10,000,00 10,000 .00 0%
4324 Medical/Dental/Lab 12,000.00 12.000.00 .00 0%
4400 Publications & Legal Notices 3.000.00 500.00 7.500.00 A00%
4420 Rantz & |eases/Equipmant 5,050.00 5,000.00 50,00 1%
4450 Emall Tonla 1,118.00 5,000.00 -3,285.00 -FBY%
#4461 Fire Equipment 1.823.00 §,500.00 -3,677.00 -67%
4500 Special Department Expense B.700.00 25.000.00 «1%6,300.00 -65%
4503 Educational Training 3,500,00 1,112.93 2368087 2123%
4607 Firg Prévenlion _— 3%0.00 1,000,00 -B50.00 BE%
s 0.00 0.00 0.00 0%
4540 Stafl Development £,000.00 £,500.00 -1,500.00 ~23%
4506 Fuei Purchases 20,000.00 15,500.00 4,500.00 28%
4600 Transportation & Trave Q.00 50,000.00 -50,000.00 -400%
4620 LHilities 20 500,00 14.006.00 &,500.G0 AB%
Services & Supplies Total 475,087.00 R261,957.89 13 129.41 e
Other Chargas
BO&EQ Principal Payments 0.04 0.0a .00 0%
5100 Intero Pavments 0.00 0.00 0.00 D%
Other Charges Tatal: 0.t 0.00 0,00 Q%
fFinad Assnts
6020 Struclures & Improvernents Q.00 1,056.00 -1,056.00 -T00%
8040 Eguipment 94,860.20 §1,541.400  33,318.80 5444
Fixed Assets Total: 84,880,20 62,597.40 32,282.80 S29%
Budget Totals
Salaries & Bonefits +,430,454.46 2.4580,823,52| -1,060,369.08 42 8%
Servites & Bupplies 475,0687.00 361,957.58 113, 100.41 31.3%
Oihet Charges .00 0.00 0.00 D.0%
Fixed Assets 94 880.20 &2 597 40 32 262 .80 51.5%
Sub Tatak 2,000,401.86 29183785 -B14.976.8Y 31.4%
7200 Contingency 4,381.50 .00 4,381.50 Q.0%
7400 Raberva 0.00 0.00 o Do 0.0%
Grand Total: 1,004,783.16 2815378.5% .810,585.36 3. 2%



Amerlcan Blver Flre Protection District
Fire District Budget - Fiscal Year 2021.2022

Depariment - BOASE 20012022 2020-2021 Percen!
ingex Code -BSE500 Fiscal Yaar Fiscal Year —  Differenee Inerense
Sataties & Bangfits
3300 Regular Emptoyees G4R,733.80 £47 909,90 104,823.80 16
0 Extra Help 84,384.00 B2 72000 1,6864.00 2%
3002 Quertime 120,000.00] RS ENA NG 132.504.00 -52%
3004 Other Componsation 27,784,890 21,411.39 B,373.51 0%
3020 Retiremant 193,612.96 178,942.56 14,700,40 %
3021 Soclai Serily 72.800.01 75,066.38 -2 466,37 3%
3022 Medicare 17,082 .38 17.662.68 -580.32 -3%
3040 Haalth tnsurance TS A ED 143,840.00 35,500.60 25%
| 3041 Unemployment Insurance 26.000.00 25,000.00 0.00 0%
s s3] 0 G0 0%
305Q Workimans' Compaensation 73.427.55 13,427.85 .00 0%
|.3080 Fleible Benefits 12, 00000 L12000.00 0.00 %
Salariee & Wages Total; 1,454 966,38 1,430,454 46 24,511,92 2%
Services & Supptles
4020 Clathing BORQO0 B,G50 00 0.00 0%
4020 Fire Tumaouts 70,00 T2 0.00 ik
4040 Communicetions 3,718.00 3.718.00 0.00 0%
4042 Radit EquipmentActive 11" 400.00 400 000 %
4043 Rigpatch Foes 7.000.00 1.600.00 0.00 %
ADGQ In-gervice Faod 350.00 350 0.q0 %
4080 Houaehald Expanse 3,850.00 3,850.00 g.00 0%
4085 Refuse Dispasal 3,000.00 3,000.00 0.00 0%
4100 Insurance 18,600.00 18,000.00 .00 Bk
4140 Equipment Maintenance 3,300.00 3,300.00 Q.00 0%
4142 Telephone/Radio Maintenanca 7,500,00 2,500,00 0.00 Q%
4146 Equipment Maintenance 1,000.00 3,000,00 Q.00 %
4180 Vehicle Sorvice £7.500.60 10,160.00 17 400,00 17H%
4181 Vehicle Parls £,000.00 6,000.00 0.00 Q%
4180 Maintenance of Sfruttures 16,500.00 16,500.00 4.60 %
4187 Maintenance of Buitgings 5,000.00 5,000.00 0.60 %
#200 Medical Supplies 400,00 400 0.00 0%
4220 Memberships 1,143,00 +,143.00 Q.60 0%
4240 Misc. Expensa 1,000.00 1,000,060 Q.06 favN
4280 Dffics Expunse 200.00 800 0,00 0%
4261 Postage 850.00 680 .40 %
4283 Subseription 150.00 150 0.00 0%
4266 Printing 500,00 SO0 0.040 0%
4300 Professional Services (CAL FIRE) 2B7,200.00 2R7,200,00 0.00 0%
4304 pgeacy Administration (LAFCO) 488.00 588 0.08 %
4305 Audit sl Accourting 2,000.00 2,000.00 0.00 0%
4313 Lagal Services 10,000.00 10,000.G0 0.00 O%
4324 MadicaliDentavl.ab 12,00000 12,000.00 0.00 0%
4400 Publications & Legsal Motices 3,000,080 3,000,006 Q.00 0%
4420 Rents & Leases/Equipmant 5,050.00 £,050.00 0,00 0%
4460 Ermadl Tools 1.115.0¢ 1.115.00 0,00 0%
4461 Fite Equiprnuent 1,823.00 1,823.00 0.00 0%
4500 Special Rapanment Expense 8,700.00 8,700.00 0.00 0%
4503 Educationa Training 3500.00 3.500.00 0.00 0%
4807 Fira Praventlon ] 350,00 350 0.00 0%
] 0.00 a o.0g 0%
4540 Btalf Development 1,000.00 5,000.00 «d 0G0 110 BO%
4606 Fuel Purchases 20,000.00 20,000.00 4,00 0%
4600 Transporiation & Travel 0.00 ] .00 0%
4820 Lllitey 20,500.00 20,500.00 G400 ]
Fervices & Supplies Total: A88,487.00 475,087 .00 13,400.00 3%
Cther Gharges
5060 Erinclpat Payimenta .00 0.00 .00 0%
5100 Interaat Payments 2.00 0.00 0.00 0%
Other Charges Total 0.0 a.00 0.00 0%
Fixed Apsets
B0ZD Biruciures & Improvemants 0.00 1,056.00 -1,056.00 -100%
B40D Eeutipment 10%, 360.20 94 860.20 £ 500.00 teg,
Fixed Astats Total: 103,360.20 25,516.20 T.d44._00 Bo%
Burigot Totals
Salarles & Benefits 1,454.0560.368] 1,430,454 48 24,511 .92 1.7%
Services & Supplies 488 487,00 475,087.00 13,40000 2.8%
Othar Charges 0.00 0.00 0,09 0%
Fingd Aszots 103,360.20 asoteanl o Tadd 00 7 8%
Sub Total 2,046 813.58 2,001,457 68 45,356 82 2.3%
7300 Contingency 1,557.82 0.00 1,5657.82 0.0%
7401 Reserve 2.00 .60 Q.00 2.0%
Grand Totat: 2.048,371.40 2,001,457 66 48,813,74 2.3%




Amarican River Fire Protection District
Flre District Budget « Flsesaf Year 3022.2022

Deparimont - 80856 PORI-ZORG 20212022 Pascent
Index Codde -BES500 .. Elscal Yesr Figeal Year Difference  ineroase
Salaries & Benellts
2000 Reguter Employees 46%,422.55 B48,733.80 3,6088.75 1%
2001 Extra Help 24,384,00 84,384 00 0.00 0%
3002 Overime 120,000,00 129,000.00 0.00 0%
3004 Other Compensation 27.068.40 A7.784.80 21450 1%
070 Retirement 204,014,122 19581296 10,401, 25 5%
3071 Secial Seourity 72,913.568 72,600.01 313.56 %
3022 Meditire 17,1586.13 17,082.36 1347 D%
3040 Health Insurange 197,076.80 174,340,080 17,736.00 10%
1, 3041 Unemployment lasurancs 25,000,00 25,000.00 0.00 b%
] 000 0 0.00 a4
3060 Warkmans' Compengation F3.427.55 73,427.65 0.0 0%
3000 Flexible Benefils 12,000.00 12,000,60 L.G0 Q%
Salarles & Wages Totak: 1,487,384,21 1,454,8B6,38 32,427,823 2%
EBervices & Supplies
4020 Clithitg §.050.00 8,080.00 0.00 0%
4020 Fira Tupmouts TE0.00 750 a.00 2%
4040 Communicaliong 3.718.00 71800 0.00 %
4042 Radio Equipment/Active 911" ANQ.00 400 0.00 0%
4043 Dispatch Faas 7,000.00 7.000.00 .00 0%
4060 tn-service Food 340,00 350 .00 O
40080 Household Expansa 3.850.00 3,850.00 0,00 0%
4085 Refusée Dispasal 3.000.00 300000 0.00 0%
4300 [nsuranee 18.000.00 18 000.04 0.00 o
4140 Equipimant Maintenancy 3,300.00 3,300.00 0.00 0%
4142 Talaphone/Radio Malmenance 2,500.00 2,500.00 0.00 0%
4145 Equipment Majntepance 1,000,00 1,000.00 0.00 0%
4160 Vehicle Sarvice 27,500.00 27.500,00 0.00 0%
4167 Vahicle Paris 6,000.00 B,000.00 0.00 1L
4150 Maintenance of Structures 16,800.00 16,500.00 0.00 0%
4187 Maintenance of Buildings 500G 5.800.00 .00 0%
4200 Meditat Suppliss 400.00 AG0 0.00 %
4230 Memberships 1,143,008 1.143.00 0.00 G%
AZ40 Miec. Expansa 1.000,00 1.0600,00 0.00 U%
4260 Dffice Expense BOO,00 a0a 0.00 0%
4261 Postage 650.00 650 0,00 0%
4263 Bubgription 150.00 180 o.to %
4266 Printing 500.00 500 0.00 %
4300 Professlonal $ervices (CAL FiRE) 287,200.00 287,200.00 0.00 0%
4304 Agency Adminlstratlon (LAFCCH 588,00 588 n.Oo 0%
4305 Audit and Accounting 2.400.00 2.000,00 o.00 Q%
431% Legal Services 10,000.00 10,000.00 G.00 0%
4324 MedicaDansl/Lab 12,000.00 12,000.00 0.00 0%
4400 Publicatiang & Legal Notices 300000 3,000.00 0.00 0%
4420 Rents & Leases/Equipment 5.080,00 5,060.00 .00 0%
4460 Small Faols 1,115.00 1.415,00 Qoo 0%
44571 Fire Equipmesnt 1,823.00 1,823.00 0,00 0%
4300 Spacinl Department Expense §,708.00 8,700.00 0.00 0%
4503 Educational Tredning 3.500.00 3,600.00 .00 [1e
4507 Flre Preventian 350.00 350 6.00 1%
- i 0.00 0 000 0%
4540 Statf Davetopmeant 5,000.00 1,000.00 4.000.00 400%
4805 Fuel Purchagses 20,000.00 20,000,00 .00 0%
4600 Transportation & Travel 0,00 0 0aa I
4620 Litities 20,500.00 20, 500.00 0.00 0%
Services & Supplies Tolat: 492 487,00 488 487,00 4,000.04 1%
Gther Charges
5060 Principal Payments a.ao 0.00 0.60 %
5100 Interest Paymunis Q.00 0.00 0.00 0%
Qther Charges Tatal; 0.00 &.00 .00 0%
Fixnd Assols
6020 Structures & tmprovements 0,00 0.00 0,00 Q%
@040 Equiprnent — e lm3 360,20 103 260.20 0.00 0%
Fixed Aszats Total: 103,360.20 103,360.20 n.oo 0%
Budget Yotalg
Balaries & Benafils 1,487,384.21 1,454,966.38 x2.427.83 2.2%
Farvices & Supplies 432 487,00 46B,487.00 4.000.00 0.5%
Cther Gharges 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
| Fixad Assats 103, 360,20 103,380.20 0.00 0.0%
Sub Totai: 083,241,471 3,048,013.68 38, 427.83 1.8%
T300 Contingency B,091.46 0.00 6,091.46 0.0%
7400 Resrve 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
Grand Totak 208533288  2,046,013.58 42,519.20 21%



American River Fire Protection Bistrict
Fire Bistrict Budget - Fiscal Year 2023.2024

Depariment - 80856 2032024 Z0Z2-7023 Percent
Index Code -B55500 Fiscat Year Fiscal Year — Oiffersnce  lntreagse
Halatias 8 Bonofits
2000 Regular Empioyees G36.485,77 553,422 55 308322 0%
3001 Extra Help 84,384.00 B4.384.00 .00 0%
3002 Overtimo 120,000.00 120,000,0¢ 0.00 %%
3004 Other Compensation 27 698,40 27,689.40 0.00 0%
3070 Retirermen 195,825,368 204,014.22 -3,188.86 i
3021 Social Sty 7317393 72.913.56 260.37 %
3022 Medicare 17.217.40 17.156.13 &6+.27 0%
304 Heakh Insurance 216,586,480 197,076 .60 19,512.00 1044
| 2041 Unamployment insurance 24,000.00 A5.000,00 0.00 0%
M | a,00 a 0.00 0%
08¢ Workmans' Compansatior 1348155 ¥3,427.55 .00 %
300 Flexibiy Borefits 12.000.00 12 06800 e .00 0%
Salaries & Wages Total: 1,502, 402.20 1,487 35424 14,707.89 1%
Bervices & Supplles -
AU20 Clothing B,050.00 8.050.00 G.00 0%
A020 Fire Turnouts T50.00 760 .00 0%
4040 Communications 3,718,00 3,718,00 Q.00 0%
4042 Radic EquipmantActive B11" 400.00 200 .00 0%
4043 Dispatch Fees 7.000.00 1.000.00 0.00 0%
4060 ih-servicn Food 250.00 350 0.00 0%
408C Househokd Expansy 3,850.00 3,850.00 .00 0%
4085 Refuae Dispognt 3,000.00 3,000.00 .00 0%
410 tnsurance 18,000.00 18,000.00 0.00 b
4140 Equipmant Maintenance 3,300,00 3,300.00 0.00 0%
4142 Telephens/Radio Mainienance 2,500,00 2,500,00 0.00 0%
414% Equipment Maintanance 1,000.00 1.000,00 0.00 0%
4160 Vehicte Servico 27,500.00 ¥7,500,00 0,00 %
4181 Vehicle Parls &,000.00 6,000t 0.00 0%
418C Maintennnes of Strutiures 18,500.00 16,500.00 0.00 15
4187 Maimenance af Bisldings 5,000.00 5,000.00 0.00 0%
A200 Madical Supplies 400,00 400 0.00 0%
4220 Memberships 1,143,00 1,143,00 0.00 0%
4240 Misc. Expanse 1,b00.00 1,000.00 0,00 0%
4260 Office Exponse 0000 o0 .00 0%
4261 Posnge GE0.00 550 b.00 0%
4263 Subaeription 180.00 150 0.00 0%
A266 Printing £00.00 G0N 0.00 0%
4300 Professional Services (CAL FIRE) 287,200.00 237,200.00 0.00 Q%
4334 Agency Adminisiration (LAFCO) £48.00 588 0.00 0%
4305 Audit dnd Accounting 2,000.00 2,000,800 .00 0%
4313 Legal Gevices 10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 0%
4324 Medical/Dantali at: 12,000.00 12,600,680 0.00 0%
4400 Publicetions & Legal Maticea 3,000,00 A,000.00 2.00 0%
442 Rents & Leazes/Equipment 5,05G.00 5,050.00 0,60 0%
4460 Smatl Tools 1,115.00 111500 0,00 0%
4481 Firg Equipmont 1.823.00 1.823.00 0.00 0%
4500 Spacial Depatment Expense B,700.40 B,700.00 0.00 0%
4503 Educational Training 350000 3,500.00 2.00 0%
4507 Fire Pravention 35040 350 0.00 0%
mum Q.00 0 0.00 0%
4545 Statf Development 5,0466.00 5,000,00 0,00 0%
4806 Fuel Furchases 2000000 20,000.00 0.00 0%
4G0% Transporation & Travel .00 Q 0.00 %
ABZ0 Utitities 20, 500.08 20,500.00 0.00 U4
Services & Supplies Total: 45248700 492,487 00 0.00 0%
Other Charges rmm———
5060 Principal Paytients 240 0.00 000 0%
5100 interest Payments @20 0.00 0.00 0%
Other Charges Total: 0.00 0.00 .00 0%
Flxad Aty
F320 Structures & improvements 0.00 0.00 0.00 0%
BO40 Equiprnent 103,360C. 20 103, 360.20 0.00 0%
Fingsd Assots Totak 103.360.20 103, 360.2¢ o.o0 sk
Budget Totala
Salarler & Benefity 150210R.20) 148739421 14,707.99 1.0%
Sarvicas & Supplies 492,457.00 402 467,00 G.00 0.0%
Other Charges 0,00 0,00 .00 0.0%
Fined Assets 103,360.20 103 360.20| 0.0 0.0%
Sub Total: 4,097 Bdu.4tr  2,083,241.41 14,707.98 0.7%
7300 Continganty 33,184.41 Q.00 33,164.41 0.0%
7400 Reserye G.o0 0.00 o.4a0 0.0%
Grapd Total: FARIA KRR ] 7,083,241.41 47,872.40 A%




Amarican River Fire Protection Distrled
Fire District Budget - Flscal Year 2024-2028

Department - 80856 2024-2025 2023-2024 Peateent
Index Code -BS5400 Fiscal Yo Fizzal Year Increase
Salaries & Benefits
3000 Regular Erfgrioyess 673,031.42 BY5,485.77 16,545,756 3%
3001 Extia Help 84,384.00 84,384.00 Q.00 1%
3602 Overtima 120,000.00 120,000.00 Q.00 %
3004 Other Compenaation 28 628.80 27.999.40 B28.4D0 3%
3020 Ratirament 232 502 60 195,825.36 6.677.14 2%
3021 Social Security 74,580.32 72,173.93 1.406.3% 2%
022 Mudicare 17,548,311 17.217.40 33061 2%
304G Healh Insurance 238,054,40 216,588.80 21,466 60 1%
3041 Unernploymant Insurance 25,000,006 25,000.00 0.00 0%
3 o — 0.6¢ 8] 0.00 %
060 Warkmans' Cotpensalion 73 427.55 73,427.55 0.00 0%
2080 Flexible Banefita 12,000.00 12, 000,64 0.00 0%
Sataries & Wages Tatal; 1,645,38T7.40 1,802,102 47,25513 3%
Sarvices & Supplies
4020 Clething B.050,00 8,050,00 0.00 G%
4020 Fité Turmouls 50,00 780 GO0 0%
4040 Comimunications 3. 18.00 3,118,000 .00 Q%
4042 Radio EauiprmentActive 911" 400.00 400 0,00 0%
#043 Dizpalch Fees 7.000.00 7.000.00 0.00 Q%
#4060 In-servica Faod 250.00 350 040 %
4080 Househoid Expense 3,850.00 3,850.00 0.00 0%
4085 Refuse Disposst 3,000.00 3,000.00 0.00 0%
4100 Irsurance 18,000,00 18,000.00 0.00 0%
4140 Equipment Maintenance 3,200.00 3,300,00 .00 0%
4142 Telephong/Radio Mainlenance 2,500.00 2,500.00 0,00 0%
4145 Equipment Maintenance 1,000.00 1,060.00 0,00 0%
#4160 Venicle Service 27 .500.00 27 500.00 0.3a 0%
#4161 Vehicle Parts 6,000.00 B,000.00 0.00 0%
4180 Maintenence of Sinuciuras 16.500.00 16,500.00 0.00 0%
4197 Maintenance of Biidings 5,000.00 £,000.00 0.00 0%
4200 Medical Supplies 400.00 400 0.00 0%
4220 Memberships 1,143.00 1,143.00 0,00 0%
4240 Miag, Expense 1,600.00 1,000.00 0.00 0%
4260 Office Expange 50000 0 0.0 0%
4261 Postege BER0D B50 0.00 D%
4263 Subscription 150,00 150 0.00 e
4266 Printing 500.00 500 .00 0%
4300 Professivonal Services (CAL FIRE) 28720000 287,200.00 0,00 0%
4304 Agency Administration (LAFGO) 588.00 585 0.00 0%
4305 Audit Bnd Accaunting 2,000.00 2,000.00 ike)s} 0%
4313 Legal Sarvicaes 10,000,00 149,000.00 0.00 0%
4324 Medical/Dantal/Lab 12,800,00 12,000.00 Q.00 0%
4400 Pybtications & Legal Notices 3,000.00 3,000.00 0.00 0%
4420 Rentz & Ledasas/Equipment 5,050.00 5.0580.00 .00 %
4480 Small Tools 1,115.00 1,115.00 0.00 0%
4481 Flra Equipment, 1,823.00 1,823.00 0.00 0%
4500 Special Department Expensa B,700.00 4,700.00 0.00 0%
4503 Educattonal Training 3,500,00 3,500.00 0.00 0%
4507 Fire Prevantion 350,00 350 0.00 0%
i usvala 0.60 o 0.00 0%
4540 Stalf Developrsnt &.000.00 5,000.60 0,00 %
4608 Fuel Purchases 20,000.00 20,000.00 0.00 %
4600 Transporkation & Travel 0.00 V] .00 [0
4620 Ltliues j £0,500.00 20,600.00 .00 O%
Services & Supphes Total: 497 487 .00 A92,487.00 0.00 0%
Dther Charges
8060 Principal Paymants Q.00 0.0 40 0%
5100 Interest Payments o.00 0.9¢ oan 0%
Cther Chargaes Total: 0.00 0,00 .60 0%
Fixed Assets
BOR0 Struciurss & Improvermants 0.0e 1.0568.00 -%,056.00 -100%
LEB040 Equipment 03 360,20 £1,541.40 49,818.80 1
Fixed Asgats Total: 103,360,20 B2,857.40 40,762.80 65%
Bunget Totyls
Salaries & Benefits 1,549,357,40 1,502,102.21 47,785.19 3%
Sarvites & Supplies 482 487.00 442 457,00 0.0 Q.0%
Qiher Charges 0.00 0.0 0.00 0.0%
Fixed Assels 303, 380,20 62 567 40 40 762 .80 E5.1%
Sub Total: 2,145,204.60 2,057,186.61 BH, 017 84 A%
, 7300 Contingent 78 524.57 0.00 78,574.52 0.0%
7400 Reseiva o b 8.00 0.00 0.9%
Grand Tatal: 2,473,728.12 2,057,186.81 118,542,561 B.T%



EOE Diwtries

manafit Getwd PY 18/20 F

ek e I

-I.

A manis)

3000 Eaiaries {includes time In serwce Iongevtty pay} Budgeted Actual

3002 Overtlme Budgeted Actua!

$133 71l4 00

Sick Leave Goverage

Vacatmn Leave c:werage

3004 Add:tinnal Compensation Budgemd Actual

FLSA - $48,285.90.

Unffcrm Anuwance . §16,800.00:

Employee 457 euntnbutmns

" $zs worez

A i s oo

559,428.80 ;

'
RS S

Hollday Pay

3020 Retlrernent

Safety “NOrmai Cost"

Safety FY 19/20 "JPA" portion of UAL payment

Page Total -‘33 362,215. 21




A

P L
inal) LIPS Gosisl

3021 Somai Security N Budgeteci Actual

Boclal Security

L
Ot
=
o
‘o
=3

3022 Medware Budgeted Actuai

MEleafE

A ey L L

3040 Haa!th insuranee Budgeted Actual

Current Emp!uyea Health " $53:L 640 00
Retirer’nent Healthcare .

Budg&ted Actual

e A 8 e

; $$.000.DO !

3060 Wt)rkem Compensatmn Budgated Actua!

$.‘169 og2, DD !

ﬁOOO l{.ti._liFEQS/lT/SuppiiE$ & Maint./Admin. Eupport Budgeted Aatual




Allocation Basis: JPA Employees as a % of Total Employees

Allocation Caleulation:

JPA Employees 24
Total Employees 75
% Allocation 32.0%
Utilities: | Total District | JPA Allocation |
Electricity 62,000 18,840
Natrural Gas/Propane 30,000 8,600
Water/Sewer 15,000 4 800
$ 107,000 §$ 34,240
Information Technology:
IT Support/implementation 70,000 22,400
Target Solutions Subscription 8,000 2,560
Office 365 Subsription . -
Telestaff Subscription 10,000 3,200
Network/Connectivity 10,000 3,200
$ 98,000 % 31,360
Housekeeping Supplies $ 40,000 $ 12,800
Station/Facilities Maintenance  $ 24,000 § 7,680
Administrative Support:
Finance 185,950 59,604
Deputy Chiefs 654,750 209,520
Battalion Chiefs - -
Fire Chief (1/2 year) 110,423 38,215
Administrative Assistants 200,000 £4,000

Training Captain - -
Operations Support Specialist - -

% 1,160,123 § 371,239




L2

fElpn

#®o0aL ELLT

Sei'fl  SEBUI0 fSISSY dgang

WA Sivd jeusee: B

TS Eapap B

RETL sau 1y @

g SAU| f AUMArIEE

Wl saa 4 Sap BB g

528 A FRAQ S0
| sisissy aggnd

sal 4 wapang

ad A1 Juspiosu] ; SJUSPISU] JO JoqLuny

N@_ 201 iz ' sov o z o L oy
'z f o 0 0 o o iz 82¢3 |
fezt ez E I z € 8z3
b ) p N z R | e r z223
| ose 0g & vz o 8 ¢ sza
sel , ‘ez ¥ 9L N 8t g g o 123

89 m n Ly ok s BE 613

bLL i;ﬁ v - g7 1z z 0 443

. sewp |
0L | /SISISSYOHAnG | SW4/iEWZeH | [eOpely | SSMZOIC | Sedid amonas sail Bap

6102/1LS/01 01 610Z/L/0L
1oday AJIAIIOY 821N0SaYy

SL107 ‘DL ISQUEIBA0N "AEDSSUDOAN



58

e

| 255

BYE'l

oz

m

lejoy,

ove

o&l

S8

€52

oet

S8\

€91

€6

o

Lo

| pie

g5z

¥

GLE

= |

P PPE

' ggz

' ey

L1

BZH

ST

Gl

5¥2

%)

LEN

SIBHG0

leor | /sisissy oldnd

S fiewtzey

sEolpa

s344 13410

S&dl4 Njondig

6102/L€/0L O3 610Z/L/0}
Joday ANIAOY 921N0Say

610Z 'Ci 8quisnop ‘Aepssupspy




L)

ol BTN

WOEE SEI0 FSISesy dghg
%0 Sisd reure; B
=] Eopayy B
e sal 4 Jay B
%l S8 f BUNANUS

A 1] s34 Bay BE

B J SFHHIRS

adAj Juspiau] j SJUsPISY JO J8qUWNN

610Z/LE/0L 03 6102/L/0L
1oday] AJIAOY 821N0SaY

G102 ‘£1 JeguEaaoy ‘ARpsSaupags




P . - G
RESOLUTION NO. 152-2019
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO
Snyder Annexation to the £l Dorado Irvigation District Service Area; LAFCO Profect No. 2018-05,

WHEREAS, request has been made to the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado for
negotiations with respect to property tax revenue in accordance with Section 99 and 99.01 of the Revenue and
Taxation Code; and

WHEREAS, this request related to the annexation of one parcel, Assessor’s Parcel Mumber 006-011-022
{60 acres), namely LAFCO Project Mumber 2019-03, to be annexed to the El Dorade brrigation District; and

WHEREAS, negotiations Tor a redistribution of property tax inerements have been concluded, and the El
Dorade Irrgation District has adopted ity resolution accepting the annexation and property tax increment -
distribution plan,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors that the property
tax increment with respect to parcel 006-011-022 to be annexed to the El Dorado hrigation Districs witl be
distributed as shown on Exhibit A.

RE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that El Dorado County authorizes an exemption from the requirement for
LAFCO to hold an additional information bearing 60 days before the regular hearing to consider the proposed
annexation. For purposes of Government Code Section 56857(e), the County supports the annexation of Parcel
Mumber 006-011-022 to the El Dorado Trrigation District, LAFCO Project No. 2019-05.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Clerk to the Board of Supervisors is hereby directad to transmit

notice of this resolution to the affected agencies and the El Dorado County Local Agency Formation
Commission.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of Bl Dorado at a regular meeting of said

Board, held the _22nd day of October , ZOJM?, by the following vote of said Board:
Ayes: Frentzen, Hidahi, Parlin, Veerkamp

Attest; Noes: None

Kimberly Dawson Absent; Novasel

Clerk of fhe Board of Supervisors é/é‘/
L . YiN L 1 (& Ah RF ﬁ\ ,//

Vice-Chair, Board of Supuwmrs
Brian K, Veerk amp

ATTEST: Kim Dawson
Clark pof th{, Boerd of Supervisors

W\ &dg Muty Ciﬁ ?5

19-1273 A2 {of 2



PROPERTY TAX DISTRIBUTION FUTURE INCREMENT
EXHIBIT A

LAFCO Project #:

Project Name:

Annexativn Per R&T Code Section;
Existing Tax Rate Area # {TRA):
Nat Assessed Value Per Aasessor:
HiG Exermnption Assessed Value:

Total Assessed Value Subject to AB-8;

Estimated 1% Property Tax Revenue:

Agency
County General Fung
County Capitat Dubiay Fund
Road District Tax
County Waler Agency
Et Dorado County Fire
E!l Dorado irrigation District
CSART

Total Local Agencies:

Gold Trait Elerentry

El Dorado High

County School Senvices

Los Rios Jt Community Collage
Total School Agancias:

Grand Totalk

2019-05
Snyder Annexation to EID
99.01

072036

238,685

§7.000

§$231,685

§2.317

SRE

County Ristrict
Agency Code
Number Number

00001 nla

0ooo7 nia

0001 nia

30645 207

30095 055

80011 a7

o281 122

20370 e

20320 046

Esfimated Estimated
Portion of Current Share
Currentl Tax  of Tax Levy in
Revenue  Existing THA

{note 1) {pote 1}

3845 36.4545%
£18 0.7561%
$85 31.6583%
$28 1, 1936%
5228 9.8348%
30 2.8000%
8687 2 A557%
21258 §4.3534%
5475 20.5060%
5393 16.9519%
$49 2.1313%
5140 8.0574%
1008 43.8468%

2317 100.0000%

Froposad
Exchange of

Praposed
Fufure

Tax Increment Tax tncrement

1. 7886% 34.6663%
0.0371% 0.7190%
DA795% 3.4788%
-.0586% 1.1350%
-0.4825% 8.3523%
2.6667% 2.6667%

-0.1205% 2.3352%
{LOG00% 84 3534%

0.0000% 20.5060%

0.0000% 16.9519%

0.0000% 2.1315%

0.0000% 6.0574%

0.0000% A5 5466%
100.0000%

Note 1: Revenue eslimalas shown are PRE: SDAF, ERAF | ERAF i, ERAF I, VLF Swap, and/or Triple Flip,

19-1273 A2 20f 2



