EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
BOARD MEETING

AGENDA

City of Placerville
Town Hall
549 Main Street
Placerville, CA 95667

October 20, 2022
12:30 Closed Session
1:00 P.M. Open Session

Join Zoom Meeting
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/88937879063?pwd=ajJ1NzV1RWp3dVJIyWFkyam8wNHg2U
T09

Meeting ID: 889 3787 9063
Passcode: 289203

One tap mobile
1(669)900-9128

Fire Chief, Tim Cordero

Mark Brunton (Div. 1) Ken Harper (Div. 4)
Mickey Kaiserman (Div. 2) Paul Gilchrest (Div. 5)
Chris Swarbrick (Div. 3) -Chair

12:30 P.M. OPEN SESSION
PUBLIC COMMENT:

Any person wishing to address the Board on any item on the closed session
portion of the agenda may do so at this time.

12:35 P.M. CLOSED SESSION
A. Meeting with designated representatives of the EI Dorado County Fire
Protection District regarding employee salaries, salary schedules, and/or
other compensation in the form of fringe benefits pursuant to Government

Agenda Page 1 October 20, 2022, Mtg.


https://us02web.zoom.us/j/88937879063?pwd=ajJ1NzV1RWp3dVJyWFkyam8wNHg2UT09
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/88937879063?pwd=ajJ1NzV1RWp3dVJyWFkyam8wNHg2UT09

Code Section 54957.6. The El Dorado County Fire Protection District’s
designated representatives are Fire Chief Tim Cordero, Director Chris
Swarbrick, Director Ken Harper and Patrick Clark.

El Dorado County Professional Firefighter Union Local 3556

1:00 P.M. OPEN SESSION

1. CALL TO ORDER:

2. ROLL CALL:

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:

4. APPROVE AGENDA:

o. CONSENT CALENDAR:
(All items approved on a single vote except those pulled for individual
discussion and action).

A. Minutes: September 30, 2022, Board Meeting
B. Standard Operating Guideline: Article 10 — Section 3
C. Claim Payments/Deposits:

District Claims: District Deposits & JE:
$189.33 $4,425.00

$20,113.17 $3,247.00

$115,453.68 $13,175.00

$1,285.17 $13,435.18

$3,062.10

$2,623.72

$11,390.00

$1,845.00

$15,936.16

$119,836.13

$18,672.30

$59,642.39

$16,489.52

$119,905.61

6. COMMENDATION AWARDS:
e Captain Jacob Poganski
e Firefighter Paramedic Shane Galbraith
e Firefighter Paramedic Hunter Simons

7. PUBLIC COMMENT:
(Any person wishing to address the Board on any item that is not on the agenda
may do so at this time. Public comments are limited to three minutes per person.)

8. REPORT OF ACTION TAKEN IN CLOSED SESSION:
A. Meeting with designated representatives of the EI Dorado County Fire
Protection District regarding employee salaries, salary schedules, and/or
other compensation in the form of fringe benefits pursuant to Government

Agenda Page 2 October 20, 2022, Mtg.



Code Section 54957.6. The El Dorado County Fire Protection District’s
designated representatives are Fire Chief Tim Cordero, Director Chris
Swarbrick, Director Ken Harper and Patrick Clark.

El Dorado County Professional Firefighter Union Local 3556

9. DEPARTMENTAL MATTERS:
A. Administrative — Fiscal Year 2022/2023 ISU Atwood Insurance Renewal
B. Operational - Shared Service Agreement with Diamond Springs — El
Dorado Fire Department.
e Discuss and Approve.
C. Administrative — Ordinance 2022-02 — California Fire Code
e Second Reading — Adoption.
D. Administrative — Fiscal Year 2021/2022 Year End Report
e Michael Ocenosak

10. BOARD MATTERS:

11. COMMITTEE REPORTS:

Standing Committees:

A. Strategic Planning

B. Budget and Finance (Kaiserman, Gilchrest)

C. Communications & Outreach (Brunton, Gilchrest)

Ad-hoc Committees:

A. Operational Strategic Planning. (Swarbrick, Kaiserman)
B. Facilities & Equipment (Brunton, Kaiserman)

C. Human Resources (Swarbrick, Harper)

12. CORRESPONDENCE AND COMMUNICATION:
e Fire Engine Response Statistics.
e Medic Unit Response Statistics.
e Thank you letter from the Mountain Democrat

13. FIRE CHIEF’S REPORT:

14. BOARD COMMENTS:

15. EUTURE AGENDA ITEMS:

Next regularly scheduled Board Meeting, November 17, 2022.

16. ADJOURNMENT:

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you are a disabled person and you need a disability
related modification or accommodation to participate in this meeting, then please contact Fire Chief Tim
Cordero by telephone at 530-644-9630 or by fax 530-644-9636. Request must be made as early as possible
and at least one full business day before the start of the meeting.

Agenda Page 3 October 20, 2022, Mtg.



EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
BOARD MEETING

September 30, 2022

1:00 P.M. Open Session

Join Zoom Meeting

https://us02web.zoom.us/j/85334689160?pwd=NTJwSnhwb1FGVWhnT3IScFFIWGprUT09

Meeting ID: 853 3468 9160
Passcode: 907880

One tap mobile
1(669)444-9171

Fire Chief, Tim Cordero

1:00 P.M. OPEN SESSION

1.

CALL TO ORDER:

Director Swarbrick called the meeting to order at 1:06 P.M.

ROLL CALL:

Present:  Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Absent:  None

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

APPROVE AGENDA:

It was moved by Director Kaiserman and seconded by Director Harper to approve the agenda
as presented. The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Absent:  None

CONSENT CALENDAR:

(All items approved on a single vote except those pulled for individual
discussion and action).



https://us02web.zoom.us/j/85334689160?pwd=NTJwSnhwb1FGVWhnT3lScFFlWGprUT09

A. Minutes: August 18, 2022, Board Meeting
B. Ratify Board Action from June 23, 2022
C. Claim Payments/Deposits:
District Claims: District Deposits & JE:
$6,600.00 $600,000.00
$16,283.87 $160,631.98
$35,662.63 $3,401.00
$7,820.50 $4,539.00
$14,565.01 $600,000.00
$2,100.00
$2,215.00
$1,702.27
$29,955.68
$17,453.16
$1,200,000.00
$3,974.00
$19,574.92
$122,518.29

It was moved by Director Harper and seconded by Director Brunton to approve the Consent
Calendar with corrections as mentioned. Director Kaiserman abstain from item 5A, Director
Gilchrest to abstain from item 5B. The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Absent:  None

6. OATH OF OFFICE:
o Firefighter Paramedic Traci Kroll

7. PUBLIC COMMENT:

(Any person wishing to address the Board on any item that is not on the agenda may do so at
this time. Public comments are limited to five minutes per person).

No Public Comment

8. DEPARTMENTAL MATTERS:

A. Administrative — Payroll Software Upgrade
e Discuss and Approve.

It was moved by Director Gilchrest and seconded by Director Brunton to approve
the Fire Chief to enter into an agreement with Workforce Ready with a one-time set
up fee of $3,500.00 and a yearly cost of $9,828.00. The motion was passed by the
following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None



Absent: None

B. Administrative — Resolution 2022-07 Fiscal Year 2022-2023 Final Budget
e Review and Adopt

It was moved by Director Kaiserman and seconded by Director Harper to approve
Resolution 22022-07 Fiscal Year 2022-2023 Final Budget in the amount of
$13,871,817.00. The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None
Absent:  None

C. Administrative — Resolution 2022-08 — Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to
the California Fire Code.
e Ordinance 2022-02- 2022 Fire Code Adoption — First Reading.

It was moved by Director Brunton and seconded by Director Kaiserman to approve
Resolution 2022-08 — Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to the California
Fire Code. The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None
Absent:  None

D. Operational - AFG Grant — Self Contained Breathing Apparatus
e Discuss and Approve

It was moved by Director Harper and seconded by Director Kaiserman to approve
the Fire Chief and Staff to enter into a contract with Fire Grant Experts. The
motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None
Absent:  None

E. Operational — Utility Apparatus Purchase
e Discuss and Approve

It was moved by Director Kaiserman and seconded by Director Brunton to approve
the purchase of two Utility Vehicles in the amount of $56,000 and $12,000 for light
and radio console. $72,000 of TOT funds to be used. The motion was passed by
the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None



9.

10.

Absent: None

F. Operational — Mobile Radio

It was moved by Director Kaiserman and seconded by Director Harper to approve
the purchase of five Kenwood TK-5710 mobile radios from Silverado Avionics for
the cost of $11,446.79. The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None
Absent:  None

G. Facilities — Station 16 Roof Replacement

Discuss and Approve

It was moved by Director Harper and seconded by Director Kaiserman to approve
entering into a contract with ElI Dorado Roofing for the replacement of the roof at
Kyburz Station 16. The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None
Absent:  None

H. Operational — Medic Unit Staffing Model

Discuss and Approve

It was moved by Director Gilchrest and seconded by Director Kaiserman to
approve further exploring and implementation of the Medic Unit Staffing Model.
The motion was passed by the following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None
Absent:  None

Administrative — Special Tax Annual Report

Review and File

BOARD MATTERS:

COMMITTEE REPORTS:

Standing Committees:

A. Strategic Planning

No Report



B. Budget and Finance (Kaiserman, Gilchrest)
a. Transition from monthly to quarterly meetings.

It was moved by Director Kaiserman and seconded by Director Harper to approve
the transition from monthly to quarterly meetings. The motion was passed by the
following vote:

Ayes: Swarbrick, Brunton, Harper, Kaiserman, Gilchrest
Noes: None
Abstain: None

Director Kaiserman provided an overview of the items discussed at the last Budget and
Finance meeting.

C. Communications & Outreach (Brunton, Gilchrest)
Director Gilchrest stated they will be meeting the 2" Friday of October.

Ad-hoc Committees:

A. Facilities and Equipment (Brunton, Kaiserman)
No Report
B. Human Resources (Swarbrick, Harper)

Director Swarbrick stated the HR Committee has received the exit interviews from Chief
Cordero.

11. CORRESPONDENCE AND COMMUNICATION:

e Fire Engine Response Statistics.
e Medic Unit Response Statistics.
e Thank you letter from Royal Equestrian Estates.

12. FIRE CHIEF’S REPORT:

JPA:

e The JPA Board and EMSOC are monitoring call volumes on a weekly basis, EMSOC
looking for opportunities to adjust the system.

e The JPA staffing ad hoc committee continues to meet to explore various options for JPA
staffing models, the JPA will consider proposals from members for staffing of the 8™
medic unit.

e The JPA has received the Power Load systems for the medic units, they are in the process
of installation. All of the front-line units should have the system within the next week and
then the backup units will begin the installation process.

City of Placerville



The City is continuing with their Trip to Green program, one additional weekend in
October. We have been involved in the planning and review of the pilot program. From
a fire service perspective, the program has been working very well.

The Joint City Council / Fire Board meeting had to be rescheduled for October 11™, 1500.

¢ District information

On September 17, the IAFF held their Fallen Firefighter Memorial in Colorado Springs.
Our Union President Jacob Poganksi, Vice-President Jamie Preston, Honor Guard
Member Josh Land, Captain Shepard, and | were in attendance. Firefighter Brandon
Hustrei was recognized and placed on the wall, his widow, daughter, and parents were in
attendance.

The station 17 project continues to move forward. The plans have been approved by the
County and Chief Williams is working with our CM for going out to bid.

Engine 328 was hired locally as a Cal Fire resource. Through our partnership with Cal
Fire during draw-down, Cal Fire will reach out for assistance in staffing their stations
with local agencies. Engine 328 was staffed out of Station 43, until assigned to the
Mosquito Fire. We submitted through OES for a “pre-position” of two water tenders in
the County during the heat wave. OES approved our request, locally we were only able
to staff one water tender, WT-21. Our requests were approved for a total of 8 days.

The County Board of Supervisors approved our request for the additional $119,836.13
from our Development Impact Fees for the new ladder truck. The payment has been
sent to Pierce Manufacturing, fully paid, and securing the pre-payment discount for our
taxpayers.

We received funding from the EI Dorado Community Foundation for Firefighter Caleb
Melton’s paramedic school tuition. Firefighter Melton is enrolled in NCTI and will
begin school late October.

Retired Engineer Campbell is continuing to work on developing his Peer Support
program, several groups have committed grant funds to his program, and he is working
with the ElI Dorado Community Foundation for fiscal sponsorship.

As a follow up to the last Board meeting, Kathleen was able to enroll in a CSDA
sponsored Board Clerk training seminar in Monterey the first week of November. We
also received a $750 grant for the training which covers the majority of the tuition.
Chief Lilienthal, Chief Stephens and | met with the LAFCO Ad-Hoc committee
regarding the Fire MSR’s and proposed Summit. We will be scheduling a workshop for
the Fire Chiefs in November and then reporting back to the Ad-Hoc committee.

| was invited to sit on two separate hiring panels at the County level, the CAO position
and the Deputy CAO Office of Wildfire Preparedness and resilience.

Update on the Shared Services with Diamond Springs Fire, we have had several
meetings, internally and with DSP. The Firefighters Union from Diamond Springs
sent a letter of unanimous support to Chief Gallagher for the proposed shared

service agreement. We are planning another meeting with both locals and Chiefs,
before bringing it to our Board for consideration.



o | will be out of the area October 14 thru October 17; Chief Lohan will have District
operations in my absence.

13. BOARD COMMENTS:

Brunton: No Comment

Swarbrick: No Comment

Kaiserman: No Comment

Harper: No Comment

Gilchrest: Director Gilchrest stated he wanted to thank Division chief stirling for the
work he has been doing with the Firewise Communities and Fire Safe
Councils.

14. EUTURE AGENDA ITEMS:

Next regularly scheduled Board Meeting October 20, 2022.

15. ADJOURNMENT: At 3:02 P.M. it was moved by Director Brunton and seconded by
Director Kaiserman to adjourn; all in favor.







EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

STANDARD OPERATING GUIDELINE

ARTICLE 10: EQUIPMENT PROCEDURESE FFECTIVE DATE: 04-12-2006
SECTION 3: ROUTINE MAINTENANCE REVISED: 06-01-2022
10.3.1 PURPOSE: To assure the following procedures will be followed regarding Equipment

10.3.2

10.3.3

10.3.4

10.3.5

10.3.6

10.3.6.1

10.3.6.2

10.3.7

10.3.7.1

Maintenance:

All major repairs to Fire District equipment are to be made by, or under the direction of

the Buty-Chief-Officer. Maintenance Division Chief.

All modifications or additions to Fire District equipment are to be cleared by the Fire-
chief: Maintenance Division Chief.

For the purpose of this guide, “On duty shift personnel” shall pertain to the
assigned apparatus Engineer.

Minor repairs such as replacing light bulbs, windshield wipers, fan belt tightening,
replacing loose screws, nuts and bolts, minor wiring problems, cleaning battery
terminals, replace as necessary, etc. are to be done by on- duty shift personnel at each
station.

Preventive Maintenance:

Oil and filter changes, air filter replacement, chassis and drive line lube, add or
change lube oil in gear cases when necessary, clean and lube external pump valves,

lube pump, adjust pump packing, elean-batiery-terminals;-erreplace-asneeessary,
will-be-dene-by-the-on-duty-shift persennel-at-each-station.

scheduled through District Mamtenance D|V|5|on

Minor repair and preventive maintenance items that have been done are to be noted
on equipment repairs forms and sent to the Maintenance Division.

Reporting Problems:

fefwaFded—te—t-he—Mam%eﬁaHee—Dhﬁsreﬁ— AII minor repalrs as outllned in 10. 3 5
do not require a repair order and shall be documented in the 1401 maintenance
log. All other repairs and/or services must be documented through district
Repair Order form (1402) and sent to Maintenance Division.

10.3.8 Apparatus:

10.3.8.1

10.3.8.2

10.3.8.3

The District’s “"Mobile Equipment Inventory” ranges from utilities to water tenders.
Each station is assigned a number of these vehicles.

The District maintains a reserve fleet. If a piece of mobile equipment must be taken
“out of service” for a period of time, then a piece of equipment from reserve fleet will
take its position. Reserve apparatus are not equipped to the District’s standard for
front line equipment.

Service Area 7 mobile equipment is assigned to the District. The procedure for

equipment checks and the reporting of mechanical preblems-is-the-same-as-other



Bistriet-equipment: Problems must follow Service Area 7s guidelines.



EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE
FINANCE REPORT

1. Fire Operations Budget Summary
2. District Claims Submitted for Payment

District Claims:
$189.33
$20,113.17
$115,453.68
$1,285.17
$3,062.10
$2,623.72
$11,390.00
$1,845.00
$15,936.16
$119,836.13
$18,672.30
$59,642.39
$16,489.52
$119,905.61

District Deposits/Journal Entries:
e $4,425.00

e $3,247.00

e $13,175.00

e $13,435.18




10/12/2022 8:46 AM

EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Final Fire Operations Budget Summary 2022-2023
July 1, 20201 Through September 30, 2022 25% Expended

Final
Sub Revenues / Sources Budget 535;2%32 Oveél?églir:der Pce:cr:l:li T:ttigde
2022-2023
Carry-over funds from previous year
100 |Property Taxes-Secured (current year) $10,596,087.00 ($10,596,087.00) 0%
110 |Property Taxes-Unsecured (current) $204,304.00 $154,047.43 $0.00 75%
140 |Supplemental Property Taxes-Current $296,130.00 $70,452.21 ($225,677.79) 24%
174 |Tax: Timber Yield $35.00 $0.00 ($35.00) 0%
342 |Fund Balance (Measure S Fund Transfer St. 28) $0.00 $0.00 0%
820 |State Homeowners Property Tax Relief $72,628.00 $0.00 ($72,628.00) 0%
Prior Years Property Taxes
120 |Property Taxes-Prior Secured $4,385.00 $0.00 ($4,385.00) 0%
130 |Property Taxes-Prior Unsecured $6,169.00 $2,328.57 ($3,840.43) 38%
150 |Supplemental Property Taxes-Prior $18,164.00 $3,384.81 ($14,779.19) 19%
360 |Taxes-Penalties $10,957.00 $844.18 ($10,112.82) 8%
Voter Approved Special Taxes
175 |Direct Assessment $517,231.00 $1,545.50 ($515,685.50) 0%
1310 |Fire Suppression (Shingle Springs) $5,214.00 ($5,214.00) 0%
Other Fees & Service Reimbursements
880 |[St: Other $0.00 $0.00 100%
881 |Federal/State Reimbursements $861,795.00 $10,096.46 ($851,698.54) 1%
400 |Interest $25,308.00 $6,881.13 ($18,426.87) 27%
420 |Rent: Land & Building $25,969.00 $16,969.47 ($8,999.53) 65%
1100 |Other Federal Revenue CARES Relief Funds $0.00 $0.00 0%
1200 |Temporary T.O.T. Reimbursement $68,000.00 ($68,000.00) 0%
1400/140] Inspection Fee's - Prevention - Plan Review Fees $141,125.00 $38,724.07 ($102,400.93) 27%
1403 |Development Fees Trust Fund $0.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 0%
4304 |Ambulance Admin Reimbursement (1686) $304,328.00 ($304,328.00) 0%
1744 |[Misc: Inspection or Services VHR $0.00 $0.00 0%
1940 |Miscellaneous $5,462.00 $2,059.34 ($3,402.66) 38%
1942 [Misc: Reimbursement $0.00 $0.00 0%
1947 |Insurance Refunds & Safety Funds $6,466.00 $141,497.07 $135,031.07 2188%
2000 [Sale of Fixed Assets $2,880.00 ($2,880.00) 0%
1207 |Shingle Springs Rancheria $654,000.00 $600,000.00 | ($54,000.00) 92%
1800 Interfund Rev: Service Between Fund Types $138,040.00 ($138,040.00) 0%
| Total Revenue $1,648,830.24 | ($12,127,550.19) #VALUE!
lof5

Fire Operations Summary



10/12/2022 8:46 AM

EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Final Fire Operations Budget Summary 2022-2023
July 1, 2021 Through September 30, 2022 25% Expended

Sub Salf’alries & Benefits BE'S;L,( Expended Over or Under Percentage
Expenditures / Uses: Class | 2022-2023 2022-2023 Budget Expended
3000 [Salaries and Wages $5,311,165.00 $1,240,357.93 ($4,070,807.07) 23%
3001 |Directors/Apprentice FF/Prevention Consultants $15,000.00 $1,140.00 ($13,860.00) 0%
3002 [Overtime $1,597,515.00 $498,701.28 ($1,098,813.72) 31%
3004 ([Other Compensation $301,024.00 $100,663.01 ($200,360.99) 33%
3020 [Retirement $2,553,894.00 $2,642,783.02 $88,889.02 103%
3021 |[OASDI $6,279.00 $70.68 ($6,208.32) 1%
3022 |Medicare $97,638.00 $26,596.84 ($71,041.16) 27%
3040 [Health & Dental $1,201,023.00 $452,956.37 ($748,066.63) 38%
3041 [Unemployment Insurance $2,986.00 $0.00 ($2,986.00) 0%
3042 |Long Term Disability & Volunteer Program $21,387.00 $2,784.00 ($18,603.00) 13%
3043 [Defer Comp Enployer Share $76,485.00 $18,092.64 ($58,392.36) 24%
3044 (Vision $12,228.00 $4,036.92 ($8,191.08) 33%
3060 |Workman's Compensation Insurance $508,128.00 $127,032.00 ($381,096.00) 25%
Total $11,704,752.00 $5,115,214.69 ($6,589,537.31) 43.70%

20of5

Fire Operations Summary



10/12/2022 8:46 AM

EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Final Fire Operations Budget Summary 2022-2023
July 1, 2021Through Septebmer 30, 2022 25% Expended

Final
Sub Expenditures / Uses: Class Il Budget 535;2%32 Oveél?églir:der PEe):;E:La;gde
2022-2023

4020 |Clothing $15,000.00 $5,235.37 ($9,764.63) 35%
4021 |Safety Equipment $13,000.00 $399.90 ($12,600.10) 3%
4022 |Uniforms $5,000.00 $41,178.52 $36,178.52 824%
4040 |Communications $149,400.00 $39,210.25 ($110,189.75) 26%
4044 |Cable/Internet Service $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%
4060 |Food $5,200.00 $1,147.57 ($4,052.43) 22%
4080 |Warehouse Expenses $25,000.00 $6,541.10 ($18,458.90) 26%
4085 |Refuse Disposal $19,000.00 $4,711.20 ($14,288.80) 25%
4087 |Extermination $1,000.00 $325.00 ($675.00) 33%
4100 |Insurance Premiums $91,000.00 $1,221.85 ($89,778.15) 1%
4140 |Maintenance - Equipment $9,750.00 $4,678.06 ($5,071.94) 48%
4142 |Maintenance - Radios $8,000.00 $1,009.93 ($6,990.07) 13%
4145 |Maintenance - Equipment Parts $16,500.00 $819.45 ($15,680.55) 5%
4160 |Maintenance - Vehicles $70,000.00 $28,670.27 ($41,329.73) 41%
4162 |Maintenance - Vehicle Supplies $70,000.00 $37,851.76 ($32,148.24) 54%
4164 |Maintenance -Tires & tubes $30,000.00 $7,640.28 ($22,359.72) 25%
4180 |Maintenance - Buildings & Improvements $10,000.00 $1,004.00 ($8,996.00) 10%
4197 |Building Supplies $15,000.00 $4,043.35 ($10,956.65) 27%
4200 |Medical Supplies $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%
4220 |Memberships $10,000.00 $135.00 ($9,865.00) 1%
4260 |Office Expense $10,000.00 $2,131.00 ($7,869.00) 21%
4261 |Postage $3,000.00 $198.96 ($2,801.04) 7%
4263 |Subscriptions $200.00 $0.00 ($200.00) 0%
4300 |Professional & Specialized Services $217,600.00 $31,758.89 ($185,841.11) 15%
4304 |Agency Administration $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%
4313 |Legal Services - Being Paid out of 4300 $50,000.00 $0.00 ($50,000.00) 0%
4324 |Medical, Dental, & Lab Services $20,000.00 $42,717.24 $22,717.24 214%
4400 |Publications & Legal Notices $500.00 $135.00 ($365.00) 27%
4420 |Rent & Leases Equipment $18,300.00 $2,210.88 ($16,089.12) 12%
4440 |Rents & Leases $500.00 $0.00 ($500.00) 0%
4461 |Minor Equipment $92,700.00 $9,889.77 ($82,810.23) 11%
4462 |Equipment: Computers $4,000.00 $7,206.09 $3,206.09 180%
4500 |Special Departmental Expense $34,950.00 $1,270.68 ($33,679.32) 4%
4503 |Educational Training $5,000.00 $0.00 ($5,000.00) 0%
4507 |Fire & Safety Supplies $25,000.00 $9,854.09 ($15,145.91) 39%
4529 |Software License $30,625.00 $3,986.81 ($26,638.19) 13%
4536 |Retirement Benefit $0.00 $10,894.00 $10,894.00 100%
4617 |Staff Development $40,800.00 ($2,925.54) ($43,725.54) 7%
4600 |Transportation & Travel $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%
4606 |Fuel Purchase - Bulk $130,000.00 $33,517.10 ($96,482.90) 26%
4620 |Utilities $97,000.00 $20,677.02 ($76,322.98) 21%

Total $1,343,025.00 $359,344.85 ($983,680.15) 27%

30of5

Fire Operations Summary



10/12/2022 8:46 AM

EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Final Fire Operations Budget Summary 2022-2023
July 1, 2021 Through September 30, 2022 25% Expended

Final

. Expended Over or Under Percentage
Sub Expenditures: Class IlI Budget
2022-2023 2022-2023 Budget Expended
5060 |Retirement/Interest of Other Long Term Debt $99,204.00 $107,186.81 $7,982.81 108%
5100 |[Interest $38,836.00 $0.00 ($38,836.00) 0%
5142 [Audit Findings $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%
Total $138,040.00 $107,186.81 ($30,853.19) 78%
Final Expended Over or Under Percentage
Sub Fixed Assets - Class IV Budget 2052 2023 Bud £ d gd
2022-2023 g udget XDEUCE
6020 |[Fixed Assets - Structures & Improvements $175,000.00 $8,608.89 ($166,391.11) 5%
6023 [Fixed Assets - Construction Services - Station 17 $0.00 $6,660.00 $6,660.00 0%
6040 [Fixed Assets - Apparatus/Equipment $503,500.00 $1,421,146.85 $917,646.85 282%
6042 |Fixed Assets - Computer Systems $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%
Total $678,500.00 $1,436,415.74 $757,915.74 212%
4 0of 5

Fire Operations Summary



10/12/2022 8:46 AM

EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Final Fire Operations Budget Summary 2022-2023
July 1, 2021 Through September 30, 2022 25% Expended

Final

Budget Expended Over or (Under) Percentage
2022-2023 2022-2023 Budget Collected
Final Expended Over or Under Percentage
Expenditures: Class IlI Budget 20’232 2023 Bud - d gd
2022-2023 i ek H{Eme
Class |I: Salaries/Benefits $11,704,752.00 $5,115,214.69 ($6,589,537.31) 44%
Class Il: Service & Supplies $1,343,025.00 $359,344.85 ($983,680.15) 27%
Class lll: Long Term Debt $138,040.00 $107,186.81 ($30,853.19) 78%
Class IV: Fixed Assets $678,500.00 $1,436,415.74 $757,915.74 212%
TOTALS $13,864,317.00 $7,018,162.09 ($6,846,154.91) 51%

50f5

Fire Operations Summary



Outside District Claim Form

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
- PROCESSOR USE ONLY
District: El Dorado County Fire R USE ONLY METHOD IN THE SPACE BELOW:
Date: 9/1/2022 —
US MAIL: Return 1o District:
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT: CaIVEmal for pickup: 530-644-9630 # 104
B Document Total:
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 Ao
28 2022-23 9-1-2022 EDCF Biils [ Date: $189.33
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESGRIBED BY THE IN VOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPR

NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DIS

AND HAVE B, DEI

OVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE

SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
QUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).

R PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR
DIRECTORS TO APPROVE PAYMENT RE:

Authorizing signatures:

LIVER
N =7 3
< W
//%m Y;\-\J A

Do

MRS | VENDOR | sueeix _Ipvdice Number (imit o) ¥ amount FILE NAME DATE Avs | ore | omsect DESGRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATECHECK |

1553 0 A1033623 3.74 EDCF09012022 9/1/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1033623 St-17 3.74 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 (4] A1034603 2.58 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1034603 St-17 2.58 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 4] A1034609 18.21 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 [EDCF Inv. A1034609 St-17 18.21 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1036140 5.89 EDCF08012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 [EDCF Inv. A1036140 St-17 5.89 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 B740486 -1.61 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF inv. B740486 Credit -1.61 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 Q A1036320 48.22 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1036320 St-17 48.22 Pollack Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1036408 25.27 EDCF09012022 08/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1036408 St-17 25.27 Pollack Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1038834 7.50 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1038834 St-17 7.50 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 o A1039983 18.04 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 [ 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1039983 St-17 18.04 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 (] A1040284 0.82 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1040284 St-17 0.82 Pollack Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1040349 11.88 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1040349 St-17 11.88 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1040360 7.99 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1040360 St-17 7.99 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A140955 2.95 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 [EDCF Inv. A140955 St-17 2.95 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1040957 11.79 EDCF08012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1040957 St-17 11.79 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 ¢} A1040991 20.89 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1040991 St-17 20.89 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1041179 6.91 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1041179 St-17 6.91 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1041186 -1.74 EDCF08012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1041186 Credit -1.74 Pollock Pines True Value




Outside District Claim Form

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
District: El Dorado County Fire WO PACE BELOM: PROCESSOR USE ONLY
USE ONLY
Date: 91112022 US MAIL: Retumn to District: =
Prepared By: Kathlesn Freeman
DEPT: all for pickup:
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 N Total:
29 2022-23 9-1-2022 EDCF Bills e - $20,113.17 =
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
N M _DIRECTORS TO APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).
= D e
Authorizing signatures: SR, A
A | vewoor | auex [ Aveice Numberid.imit 20) V amdunt FLENAME DATE MWAYS | ore 0BJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK |
1 514 0 PT186691 -188.49 EDCF09012022 9/1122 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. PT186691 Credit -188.49 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 PT196080 -455.81 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. PT196080 Credit -455.81 L.N. Curtis & Sans, Inc.
1 514 0 PT197909 -55.62 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. PT197909 Credit -55.62 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 PT201897 -710.13 EDCF08012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. PT201897 Credit -710.13 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 CM32476 -13730.15 | EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF inv. CM32476 Credit . -13730.15 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 CM32484 -4081.94 | EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. CM32484 Credit -4081.94 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV609446 1518.36 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV609446 Nomex Pants 15618.36 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 4] INV610643 3300.00 EDCF08012022 08/01/22 2 8561000 | 4140 |EDCF Inv. INV610643 Hurst eDraulic Service 3300.00 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INVE610015 5212.05 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV610015 Nomex Pants 5212.05 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV615234 5810.08 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV615234 Nomex Pants 5810.08 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV615271 1678.89 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4507 |EDCF Inv. INV615271 Foam 1678.89 L.N. Curlis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV616402 949.27 EDCF09012022 08/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV616402 Nomex Pants 949.27 L.N. Curtis & Sons, inc.
1 514 0 INV616502 3135.85 EDCF09012022 08/01/22 2 8561000 | 4020 |EDCF Inv. INV616502 Boots 3135.85 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 [ INV617332 2453.32 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 6040 |EDCF Inv. INV617332 PPE - Gloves 2453.32 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV618672 9036.27 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV618672 Nomex Pants 9035.27 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV620234 447.29 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV620234 Nomex Pants 447.29 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV620184 1135.22 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV620184 Nomex Pants 113522 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 (4] INV620166 3042.97 EDCF08012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4507 |EDCF Inv. INV620166 Foam 3042.97 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INVE22316 385.63 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV622316 Nomex Pants 385.63 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV626354 571.11 EDCF03012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. INV626354 Nomex Pants 571.11 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 0 INV627966 660.00 EDCF09012022 09/01/22 2 8561000 | 4140 |EDCF Inv. INV627966 Hurst eDraulic Service 660.00 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.




Outside District Claim Form

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
PROCESSOR USE ONLY

District: El Dorado County Fire METHOD iN THE SPACE BELOW:

AUDITOR USE ONLY
Date: 9/612022 US MAIL: Retum to District:
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman

DERT |CaluEmail for pickup: 530-844-9620 8 1

. Document Total: Entered by
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 ——
30 2022-23 9-6-2022 EDCF Bills pro. ) = $11 5,453.68 =
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS

NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAKE
e

BEEN DELIVERED OR,
DIRECTOR:

T

=4

Authorizing signatures: # =
ALWAYS | vENDOR | suerx Involce Number (Limit 20) AMGUNT FILEAAME  |Xa  pate L ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARAGTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE c"‘ﬂ%

1 559 0 241969 63.10 EDCF09062022 9/6/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 241969 O-Ring 63.10 - AllStar Fire Equipment Inc.
1 559 0 241819 4801.90 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4507 |EDCF Inv. 241819 Wildland Hose 4801.90 |- AllStar Fire Equipment Inc.
1 559 0 242037 998.77 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 242037 998.77 1~ Alistar Fire Equipment Inc.
1 12416 0 09012022-20 149.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4536 |EDCF Inv. 09012022-20 Retiree Opt-Out Sept. 202] 149.00 L Arellano, Vergit
1 3200 ¢} 92764-1 52.50 EDCF08062022 08/06/22 2 8561000 | 4021 |EDCF Inv. 92764-1 FATS Tags 5250 - Arnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3200 0 92764-2 84.24 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4022 |EDCF Inv. 92764-2 Name Tags 84.24 Arnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3200 0 97726-1 42.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4021 |EDCF Inv. §7726-1 FATS Tags 42.00 - Arnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3200 [} 97726-2 67.40 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4022 |EDCF Inv. 97726-2 Name Tags 67.40 - Arnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3200 o} 93028 338.78 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 [ 4300 |EDCF Inv. 93028 Plaque's 338.78 {7  Amolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3235 0 MARO0000020244 540.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4300 |EDCF Inv. MAR0D00020244 2Q22 Administration F|  540.00 _|--AUL Mid America Administrative
1 1483 0 08022022-01 150.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561001 4617 |EDCF Inv. 09022022-01 ACLS Recert Reimbursem| 150.00 «{” Borrego, Tony
1 4934 0 1-755920 860.94 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 1-755920 E-17 960.94 C & H Motor Parts, inc.
1 4934 0 1-758248 203.27 EDCF08062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 1-758248 Maintnance 20327 C & H Motor Parts, inc.
1 4934 0 1-754679 109.43 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 1-754679 Maintnance 109.43 4" C & H Motor Parts, Inc.
1 933 0 13284 662.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4180 |EDCF Inv. 13284 St-72 662.00 - California Overhead Doors
1 544 0 126153 950.90 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 6040 |EDCF Inv. 126153 Wildland PPE 950.90 |~ Cascade Fire Equipment Co
1 544 0 126103 164.43 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 126103 Hose Clamp Holder 164.43. Cascade Fire Equipment Co
1 544 Qo 125511-2 14.42 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 [ 4020 |EDCF Inv. 125511-2 Boots-Credit for Return Appld 14.42 ~' Cascade Fire Equipment Co
1 1491 0 08122022-01 0.37 EDCF08062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4040 |EDCF Inv. 08122022-01 Acct. 8155600520004352 0.37 Comcast
1 1491 0 08252022-01 150.94 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4040 |EDCF Inv. 08252022-01 Acct. 8155600510591228 150,944 Comcast
1 12345 1 07262022-07 350.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561001 4020 |EDCF Inv. 07262022-07 Wildland Boot Reimbursen| 350.00 = Davis, Dakota
1 12345 1 07262022-08 350.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4020 |EDCF Inv. 07262022-08 Structural Boot Reimbursn|  350.00 Davis, Dakota




Authorizing signatures:

1 41 BE0OS5110606-01 7256.75 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 3040 |EDCF Inv. BEOD5110606-01 Dist. Dental Sept, 202] 7256751~ Delta Dental

1 41 0 BE005110608-2 1864.01 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561001 3040 |EDCF Inv. BEOO5110606-2 JPA Dental Sept. 2022 | 1864.01 - Delta Dental

1 1006 0 EDCESA202217 6444.24 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4461 |EDCF Inv. EDCESA202217 AVL Equipment 8444.24« =1 0rado Co. Regional Frencspira
1 1006 | 0 EDCESA202208 23669.97 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000| 4040 |EDCF Inv. EDCESA202208 Q4 FY 21-22 Dispatch | 236699721 DOrado Co. 29 0nalk(eEhospnal
1 367 0 09062022-01 50.00 EDCF09062022 08/06/22 2 8561000 | 4220 |EDCF Inv. 09062022-01 FY 22-23 Membership Dud  50.00 “*| EDC Fire Protection Officer’s Assn
1 21 0 1744401780030 145.08 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF inv. 174440178U030 Acct. 4030-6047719 St| 145.08 |- El Dorado Disposal

1 21 0 1744400910030 143.00 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 174440091U030 Acct. 403-6062081 St  143.00. - El Dorado Disposal

1 21 0 1744400330030 143.00 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 174440033U030 Acct. 4030-6062262 GJ  143.00 ~| El Dorado Dispasal

1 21 0 1744393060030 22899 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 174439306U030 Acct. 4030-30036-001¢  228.99 |- El Dorado Disposal

1 46 0 08192022-01 133.97 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08192022-01 Acct. 118458-001 St-21 133.97 - El Dorado lrrigation District

1 46 0 08152022-01 12817 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF lv. 08152022-01 Acct. 006352-001 St17 | 12847 7| £l Dorado Irigation District

1 46 0 08152022-02 7492 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-02 Acct. 009878-001 St-15 74.92 -|-  El Dorado Irrigation District

1 2654 0 017640/1 3007 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 017640/1 St-28 30.07 |~ 01d Lountry Ace FarGware and
1 2654 0 017656/1 21.55 | EDCF09062022 |  o0o9/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 017656/1 St-28 21.55 4| G0id Country Ace Hafaware and
1 2654 0 017834/1 3666 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 017834/1 St-28 36,66 ~|~ 500 Country Ace Faraware and
1 2654 0 176411 -0.58 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 17641/1 Credit -0.58 | CoW Country 7{"".”““""*'"3 ang
1 3460 0 32177611 123210 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 [ 8561000 | 4420 |EDCF Inv. 32177611 Copy Machine Lease 1232.10 | Oreavmerica | ainancial Services
1 2532 0 69003 61254 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 [ 8561000 | 4140 |EDCF Inv. 69003 St-28 612.54 1" Hangtown Fire Control

1 514 0 743331 21267.68 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 6040 |EDCF Inv. 743331 Structural PPE 21267.68]" LN, Curtis & Sons, Inc.

1 514 0 PINV752100 330.33 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4507 |EDCF Inv. PINV752100 Suction Hose 330.33 7 L. Curtis & Sons, Inc.

1 4984 1 1244679 680.82 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4500 |EDCF Inv. 1244679 St-19 680.82. 1 Life Assist

1 4984 1 1244827 17402 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4500 |EDCF Inv. 1244827 St-72 174.02 7| Life Assist

1 4984 1 1238048 4449 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4500 |EDCF Inv. 1238948 St-19 4449 | Life Assist

1 4984 1 1217697 90.68 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4500 |EDEFinv-1247807-6k47 8088 — il Asslst

1 62 0 08112022-01 757.07 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 4700 |EDCF Inv.08112022-01 Acct 9361049424-2 St-19| 757.07 7  Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 [} 08112022-02 9.97 EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08112022-02 Acct. 8642934189-3 5t-18| 9.97 | Paciic Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 08112022-03 2116 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08112022-03 Acct. 67205342966 St-74| 2116 | Paciic Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 08172022-01 1227.44 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08172022-01 Acct. 2463807959-0 St.21| 1227 .44 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 08162022-01 132521 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 4700 |EDCF Inv.08162022-01 Accl. 9160165239-8 St-25| 132521 | Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 08162022-02 1438.83 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000) 4700 |EDCF Inv.08162022-02 Acct, 0294455775-6 St-72| 1438.83|  Pacilic Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 0818202201 869.34 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EOCF inv.08182022-01 Acct 4198633477-3 St-17| 869.34—|  Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 08242022-01 2017.44 | EDCFO9062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08242022-01 Acct. 9563044298-6 S1-28| 201744  Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 0825202202 103.28 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | BS61000| 4700 |EDCF Inv. 08252022-02 Acct, 4577462625-8 St-16| 10328 -|— Paciic Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 0818202202 9.60 EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8S61000| 4700 |EDCF Inv.08182022-02 Acc. 5707449531-8 St19| 860 | Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 62 0 08182022-03 796.71 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000| 4700 |EDCF Inv. 0818202203 Acct. 7501192011-5 Gold | 796.71 ~|” Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.

1 239 0 14083211 9.21 EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 140832/1 St-19 921 _|~  Pleasant Valley Ace, Inc.

1 239 0 140894/1 1465 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06122 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF lnv. 140894/1 St-19 1465 |- Pleasant Valley Ace, Inc.

1 239 0 140438/4 162.20 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDOFimr440438/Sris—— | sooo0 [ Pieasant Vaiiey Ace. inc;

1 239 0 141265/1 90.70 | EDCF09062022 |  o09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4617 |EDCF Inv. 1412651 st-19 90.70 | Pleasant Valley Ace, Inc.

1 239 0 141383/1 197.76 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 4617 |EDCF Inv. 141383/1 St-19 197.76 <~  Pleasant Valley Ace, Inc.

1 3193 0 11700 9.24 EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDGF Inv. 11700 St-25 9.24 Placerville Hardware

1 3193 0 117144 81.58 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 117144 St-25 8158 4" Placerville Hardware

1 3337 0 18042 7946.26 | EDCF09062022 |  09/06/22 2 ] 8561000 | 4300 |EDCF Inv. 19042 Platinum Service Plan Sept, 2022| 794626 1~ RTS IT




Authorizing signatures:

1 3337 0 19121 318.53 EDCF08062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4462 |EDCF Inv. 19121 Computer Equipment St-21 318.53 RTSIT

1 2737 0 460798 60.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4160 |EDCE Inv. 480798 LaberEdT—— o £0:00 Sisira Nevada Tire & Whsel
1 922 0 3771142-0 642.45 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. 3771142-0 Office Supplies 642.45 1" sierra Office Suppy & Printing
1 922 0 C3770184-0 -47.36 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. C3770184-0 Credit -47.36 | Sierra Office Suppy & Printing
1 922 0 C3768974-0 -31.85 EDCF08062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. C3768974-0 Credit -31.85-"1" Sierra Office Suppy & Printing
1 922 1] 3769683-0 23.85 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. 3769683-0 Office Supplies 23.85.~" Sierra Office Suppy & Printing
1 922 1] 3768974-0 304.59 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. 3768974-0 Office Supplies 304.59--17 Sierra Office Suppy & Printing
1 11258 0 08252022-03 350.00 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4020 |EDCF inv. 08252022-03 Duty Boot Reimbursement 350.00_~ Spiegeiberg, Ryan

1 9786 4] 08152022-03 416.25 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4100 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-03 Life Insurance March 2022 416.25 2| Texas Life Insurance Company
1 10402 1 160574096-0 1475.02 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 160574096-0 Fiber 1475.02 4 TPX

1 434 0 9913602272 51.24 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 9913602272 iPad Data 51.24 |~ Verizon Wireless

1 434 0 9913602271 229.20 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 9913602271 iPad Data 229.20 | Verizon Wireless

1 434 0 9913602270 925.92 EDCF08062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv, 9913602270 Cell Service 7/16-8/15/22 92592 |~ Verizon Wireless

1 1353 0 83514450 17168.94 | EDCF09062022 08/06/22 2 8561000 | 4606 |EDCF Inv. 83514450 Fuel Aug. 2022 17168.9471 WEX

1 822 1 229355 472.40 EDCF09062022 09/06/22 2 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 229355 St-28 472.40 A" JS West




Outside District Claim Form

District: El Dorado County Fire
AUDITOR USE ONLY
Date: 91712022
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT:,
Contact Phone: 530-844-8630 # 104 it i

31 2022-23 9-7-2022 EDCF Bills

PROCESSOR USE ONLY

) $1,285.17 ——————————
E]m!‘l’ Date Data:
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTR AND HAVE BEEN DEU'UER@D OR PERFi ED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS TO AP PAYM, QUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).
/ =
Authorizing signatures: VZ A{‘ /L'- (
ALWAYS | vEMDOR | s Invalce Numbee (Limit 26) AMOUNT FILE NAME T Bate g 1o ORG OBUECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME seamATE Check |
1 g7 1 nona 4668.83 EDCF08072022 a2 2 BS61000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv.75394 Supplies St-17 456.93 Wesl Coasl Janitorial Supply
1 3197 1 75392 231.68 EDCFO2072022 09722 2 B561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 75392 Supplies 51-28 231.68 West Coast Janitorial Supply
1 3187 1 75391 231.98 EDCF08072022 08107122 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 75391 Supplies St-18 231.98 West Coasl Janitorial Supply
1 397 1 753g7 354.58 EDCF08072022 0s/oT22 2 B561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 75397 St1-25 354.58 West Coast Janitorial Supply




Outside District Claim Form

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
= PROCESSOR USE ONLY
District: El Dorado County Fire UsE Ny METHOD IN THE SPACE BELOW:
- BATCH:
Date: Blfi2022 US MAIL: Return to District:
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT; Cal all for plckup: 530-844-9630 # 104
. Document Total; Entered by:
Contact Phone: 630-644-9630 # 104 i AN
33 2022-23 9-7-2022 EDCF Bills gy \ Date: $3,062_1 0 =
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTAGHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HA

NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED

ORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS B,

S BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE

EEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
Y. DJEECTQﬁE PPROVE PAYME| EQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).
2
Authorizing signatures: e (A P %
ALVAYS | VENDOR | suerx Invoice Number (Limit 20) AMOUNT FILE NAME \ DATE aLs ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK

4366 1 0C-1711671 14.15 I=DCF0907202 917122 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. OC-1711671 14.15 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534919 350.13  EDCF09072024 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 534919 350.13 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535004 81.70 =DCF03807202 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535004 E-25 81.70 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535017 161.69  [EDCF0907202 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535017 7703 161.59 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 471552 64.67 =DCF0907202 09/07/22 2 8561000 ( 4162 |EDCF Inv. 471552 OES 64.67 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535186 247.48 FDCF0907202 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535186 E-17 247.48 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535261 37.26 PEDCF0907202‘ 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535261 E-17 37.26 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 472018 60.12 EDCF0907202‘ 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 472018 E-25 60.12 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 527797 335.64 EDCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 527797 OES 335.64 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535479 547.64 |EDCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535479 E-317 547.64 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535518 18349 |EDCF0907202% 08/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535518 183.49 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535543 57.19 ZDCF0907202] 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535543 E-17 57.19 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535572 128.11 =DCF09072024 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535572 128.11 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 473716 33.59 =DCF09072024 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv, 473716 E-23 33.59 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 535679 62.23 =DCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 535679 62.23 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 536126 14.27 IEDCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 536126 14.27 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 530102 265.10 EDCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 530102 E-28 265.10 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 536229 17.57 i=DCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 536229 E-21 17.57 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 536253 286.07 [EDCF0907202) 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 536253 286.07 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 476262 25.18 ;=DCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 476262 7702 25.18 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 530673 38.47 =DCF0907202; 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 530673 3847 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 536531 50.45 =DCF0907202/ 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 536531 E-17 50.45 Napa Auto Parts




Outside District Claim Form

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
District: El Dorado County Fire METHOD W THE SPACE BELOW: AROCESSORUSEIgNEY
USE ONLY
Date: 9/7/2022 s AL Rotmato Dl BATCH:
Pr.par.d By: Kathives Froemiy DEPT: Call/Email for pickup: 520, -9630 # 1
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 ¥ 104 FILE MAME: Document Total: B
32 2022-23 9-7-2022 EDCF Bills —) = $2,623.72 —
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED [ED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. I FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
/‘J\ DIREC 3 VE PAYM, EQUESTS 7O THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).
7. 7 7
~7, / / / Ve 7///{,,,,
Authorizing signatures: {/ o= LA
AWAYS | veNDOR | suer Invoice Number (Limit 20) AMOUNTY FILE NAME L_ | pate s ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK |
1 4366 1 0C-1690640 13.79 EDCF09072022 97/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. OC-1690640 13.79 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 464082 357.94 EDCF09072022 08/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 464082 357.94 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 533063 128.66 EDCF08072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 533063 E-17 128.66 Napa Auto Paris
1 4366 1 464304 -357.94 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 464304 Credit -357.94 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 464791 24.68 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 464791 OES 2468 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 533324 23.92 EDCF05072022 08/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 533324 E-17 23.92 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 533411 38.47 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 533411 E-17 38.47 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 533473 -68.18 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 533473 Credit -68.18 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 465594 16.98 EDCF08072022 09/07122 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv, 465594 7702 16.98 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 465838 644.08 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 465838 E-25 644.08 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 465883 -108.00 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 465883 Credit -108.00 Napa Auto Paris
1 4366 1 466642 298.76 EDCF09072022 09/07/122 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 466642 298.76 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 533915 366.74 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 533915 E-72 366.74 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534013 -35.59 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv, 534013 Credit -35.59 Napa Auto Paris
1 4366 1 467344 2.90 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 467344 E-19 2.90 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534068 6.69 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 534068 S-21 6.69 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 524331 1062 EDCF09072022 08/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 524331 10.62 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 468711 12.59 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF inv. 468711 12.59 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 468716 17.44 EDCF08072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 468716 E-19 17.44 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534622 2144 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 534622 7721 21.44 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 525745 512.87 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 525745 e-28 512.87 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 525747 8.14 EDCF08072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 4162 |EDCF Inv. 525747 E-28 8.14 Napa Auto Parts




Authorizing signatures:

1 4366 1 525812 -172.39 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 525812 Credit -172.39 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534733 37.40 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF inv. 534733 37.40 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 470242 288.76 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 470242 298.76 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534813 55.26 EDCF09072022 08/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 534813 55.26 Napa Auto Parts
1 4366 1 534867 467.69 EDCF09072022 09/07/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 534867 467.69 Napa Auto Parts




Outside District Claim Form

District:

El Dorado County Fire

USE ONLY

Date:

9/19/2022

Prepared By:

Kathleen Freeman

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION

PROCESSOR USE ONLY
METHOD IN THE SPACE BELOW:

DEPT: | Call/Emall for pickup: 530-644-9630 # 1
d ¥ Document Total:
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 FILE .
34 2022-23 9-19-2022 EDCF Bills B . . $11 ,390.00

BATCH:
us MAaIL: Return to District:

THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS
DIRECTORS TO APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AU

BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES.
IDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).

ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
1 FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF

Authorizing signatures: /V%{-b

() Wy~

ALWAYS
1

VENDOR

SUFFIX Invoice Number (Limit 20)

AMOUNT

FILE NAME

DATE

£

T ALWAYS
2

ORG

OBJECT

DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS)

AMOUNT

VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK

2873

1 #MeltonPRSV210

11390.00 | EDCF09192022

911927

8561000

4500

EDCF Inv. #MeltonPRSV210 - Melton Medic Tuition

11390.00

NCTt




Outside District Claim Form PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
e = PROCESSOR USE ONL
District: El Dorado County Fire METHOD IN THE SPACE BELOW:
USE ONLY
Date: 9/19/2022
US MALL: Return to District:
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT: CalVEmall for pickup:
. P Document Total: Entarndty
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 L RAME:

35 2022-23 9-19-2022 EDCF Bills

D BY: Date: $1 ’845‘00 |Date:
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS TO APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).
Is
Iy
Authorizing signatures: ﬁb % %J’L/
ALWAYS | VENDOR | sueex Invoice Number (Limit ;( ~amount | FILE NAME DATE e ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK |
1 6542 1 08302022;@{ 325.00 EDCF09192022 9/19/22 2 8561000 4617 |EDCF Inv. 08302022-01 Class A Reimbursement 325.00 Simons, Hunter
1 11445 1 09022022-02 800.00 EDCF09192022 09/19/22 2 8561000 | 4617 |EDCF Inv. 09022022-02 River & Flood Rescue 800.00 Matthews, Kyle
1 11445 1 090220022-02 325.00 EDCF09192022 09/19/22 2 8561000 4617 |EDCF Inv. 090220022-02 Class A Reimbursement 325.00 Matthews, Kyle
1 11166 1 09192022-01 395.00 EDCF09182022 09/19/22 2 8561000 4617 |EDCF Inv. 09192022-01 NCTI Class Reimbursemel| 395.00 Melton, Thomas




Qutside District Claim Form

NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DE|

OF DIRECTO

OR PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN
TO APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CON

PRES

D BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
ENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD
TROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).

PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
= PROCESSOR USE ONLY

District: El Dorado County Fire \

Y AU USE ONLY METHOD IN THE SPACE BELOW:
Date: 9/20/2022 BATCH:

US MAIL: Return to District:
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT: Call/Email for pickup: 530-644-9630 # 1
: 2 Document Total: Entered by:
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 e
36 2022-23 9-20-2022 EDCF Bills \— o $15,936.16 i
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTE|

ALWAYS

Authorizing signatures: {l’flu_(/ ) / % g&{:‘ﬁ/

" VENDOR | suerix Invoice Number (Limit 20) -amount & " FILE NAME DATE A ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK
1 8094 0 10012022-02 / ' 149.00 EDCF09202022 9/20/22 2 8561000 4536 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-02 Retiree Opt-Out Oct. 2022 149.0Q.~ i 2 Steele, Phillip

1 12416 0 10012022-03 (‘:_,/ 149.00 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 4536 [EDCF Inv. 10012022-03 Retiree Opt-Out Oct. 2022 149.00 - Arellano, Vergil

1 5145 0 10012022-04 625.00 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 4536 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-04 Retiree Opt-Out Oct. 2022| 625.00 d Campbell, Mike

1 7828 [¢] 10012022-05 625.00 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 4536 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-05 Retiree Opt-Out Oct. 2022| 625.00 ¥ Lewis, Scott

1 6306 0 10012022-06 625.00 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 4536 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-06 Retiree Opt-Out Oct. 2022 625.00 -1~ > Littlejohn, Alan

1 1633 0 10012022-07 625.00 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 4536 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-07 Retiree Opt-Out Oct. 202 625.00;/‘,— Hunt, Bradley

1 3235 0 11012022-01 11424.00 | EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 3040 |EDCF Inv. 11012022-01 Retiree Health Nov. 2022| 11424.00,, /AUL Mid America Administrative
1 4725 00 10012022-08 1076.80 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 3044 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-08 Dist. Vision Oct. 2022 1076.80 FDAC EBA

1 4725 00 10012022-09 205.20 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561000 4100 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-09 Dist. Life Oct, 2022 205201 FDAC EBA

1 4725 00 10012022-10 41.60 EDCF09202022 08/20/22 2 8561000 4300 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-10 Dist. EAP Oct. 2022 41,60 ™ FDAC EBA

1 4725 00 10012022-11 372.33 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561001 3044 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-11 JPA Vision Oci. 2022 372.33 7 FDAC EBA

1 4725 00 10012022-12 223 EDCF09202022 09/20/22 2 8561001 4100 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-12 JPA Life Oct. 2022 223 _{»r FDAC EBA

1 4725 00 10012022-13 16.00 EDCF09202022 08/20/22 2 8561001 4300 |EDCF Inv. 10012022-13 JPA EAP Oct. 2022 16.00 A FDAC EBA




‘N PRESENTED FOR
DIRECTORS TO APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FO

R THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).

RD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE

Outside District Claim Form PLEASE INDICATE CHECK DISTRIBUTION
x n PROCESSOR USE ONLY
District: El Dorado County Fire I——— METHOD IN THE SPAGE BELOW:
Date: 9/20/2022
US MAIL: Retur to District:
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT: Call/Emal for plckup: 530-644-9530 # 104
2 Document Total:
Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 L ERANE:
37 2022-23 9-20-2022 EDCF Bills - e $119,836.13 —
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOA
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTR, 'D HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEE;

SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF

M

Authorizing signatures: \
ALWAYS | VENDOR | surex —Atfvolce Number (Lim ;0) AMOUNT FILENAME DATE o ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK ||
= e —
1 3434 0 746035 119836.13 | EOCF09202022 9/20/22 2 8561000 | 6040 |EDCF Inv. 746035 Balance Due for Ladder Truck | 119836.13| @0den S Sasmergencyivenicle
4 =




Outside District Claim Form

District: El Dorado County Fire
USE ONLY
Date: 8/29/2022
Prepared By: Kathleen Freeman
DEPT;
Contact Phone: 530-844-9630 # 104 S A

41 2022-23 9-29-2022 EDCF Bills

THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED B
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND

PROCESSOR USE ONLY

$18,672.30

ay:
Y THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND
HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR {RMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS
'pg APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AU

!M |Data:
ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE

BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
DITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).

= ~ >
Authorizing signatures: w M = N 2 X
MNYE | venDoR | sue involce Number (Limit 20) amount™ | FiLe name RS TN PR p— ESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 Tens) VENDOR NAME sEPARATE G [ 0
1 1080 0 07292022-01 85.72 EDCF09282022 9/2822 2 8561000 2 EDCF Inv. 07292022-01 KF St-74 65.72 US Bank
1 1080 0 08012022-25 30,00 EDCF09292022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. DBO12022-25 KF SI-72 30.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 08012022-26 579.55 EDCF08292022 0s8r28/22 2 B561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 08012022-26 KF Dumpster St-23 579.55 US Bank
1 1080 ] 08012022-27 06.64 EDCF08282022 08/29/22 2 B561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 08012022-27 KF S1-72 96.64 US Bank
1 1080 1] 08012022-28 142.70 EDCF09292022 0s/28/22 2 B581000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 0B012022-28 KF SI-74 142.70 US Bank
1 1080 | o 08022022-01 29400 | EDCF09292022 |  o8r29/22 2 | 8561000 | 4300 |EDCF Inv. 08022022-01 KF Employes Backgroun| 294,00 US Bank
1 1080 0 0B042022-01 27.50 EDCF09292022 08/29/22 2 B561000 | 4281 |EDCF Inv. 0B042022-01 KF Postage 27.50 US Bank
1 1080 ] 08062022-02 1499 EDCF09292022 09428422 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08062022-02 KF Zoom 14.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 08072022-01 14.98 EDCF09292022 ogr2ar22 2 8581000 | 4538 |EDC'F Inv. 0BO72022-01 KF Adobe 14.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 0804222-02 107.72 EDCF09202022 082022 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 0B04222-02 KF 5t-21 107.72 US Bank
1 1080 0 08072022-02 T4.49 EDCF09202022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4280 |EDCF Inv. 08072022-02 KF Office Supplies T74.48 US Bank
1 1080 | o 0811202204 309.37 | EDCFosze2022 |  osrzerzz 2 | 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 08112022-04 KF Badge Pinning 300.37 US Bank
1 1080 0 08112022-05 64.29 EDCFO8292022 0942822 2 8561000 | 4606 |EOCF Inv. 08112022-05 KF Fuel U-21 64.29 US Bank
1 1080 0 08162022-03 16.08 EDCFog292022 Osv28/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv, 08162022-03 KF Prime 16.08 US Bank
1 1080 1] 08152022-04 336.55 EDCF09282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-04 KF PO Close Out 338.55 US Bank
1 1080 0 08182022-04 4391 EDCF09202022 08/28/22 2 B561000 | 4700 |EDCF inv. 08182022-04 KF St-21 4291 US Bank
1 1080 0 08182022-02 137.94 EDCFQ9282022 0928122 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08182022-02 KF S1-21 Supplies 137.94 US Bank
1 1080 o 07282022-02 2285 EDCF09282022 08128122 2 8561000 | 4261 |EDCF Inv. 07282022-02 E17 Postage 22985 US Bank
1 1080 0 08062022-03 127.82 EDCF08292022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. DB062022-03 E17 S1-18 Air Filiars 127.82 US Bank
1 1080 | o 08112022-06 6494 | EDCF08292022 | 09720722 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EOCF Inv. 08112022-06 E17 St-19 64.94 US Bank
1 1080 0 07282022-03 117.56 EDCF08292022 o8r29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 07282022-03 E28 St48 117.56 US Bank
1 1080 0 0804202203 187.69 EDCF09202022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 0B042022-03 E28 E-28 Cooler 187.68 US Bank




Authorizing signatures:

1 1080 o 08092022-01 229.16 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08092022-01 E28 St-48 229.16 US Bank
1 1080 0 08092022-02 138.35 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF inv. 08092022-02 E28 Cooler 138.35 US Bank
1 1080 0 08162022-04 37.53 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 08162022-04 E28 E-28 37.53 US Bank
1 1080 o] 08042022-04 37.15 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08042022-04 E72 St-72 37.18 US Bank
1 1080 Q 08142022-01 11.79 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08142022-01 E72 St-72 11.78 US Bank
1 1080 0 08152022-05 13.28 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4261 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-05 E72 Postage 13.28 US Bank
1 1080 0 07312022-01 69.20 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 07312022-01 E25 E-25 69.20 US Bank
1 1080 0 08122022-07 9.81 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08122022-07 E25 St-25 9.81 US Bank
1 1080 0 08122022-02 146.11 EDCF09292022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08122022-02 E25 St-25 146.11 US Bank
1 1080 0 08022022-02 0.99 EDCF09292022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF inv. 08022022-02 PM 0.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 08152022-06 160.85 EDCF09292022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4500 |EDCF inv. 08152022-06 PM Training Guide 160.85 US Bank
1 1080 0 07302022-01 20.98 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 6020 |EDCF Inv. 07302022-01 TW Facilities 20.98 US Bank
1 1080 0 08042022-04 9.99 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08042022-04 TW Spotify 9.99 US Bank
1 1080 Y 08112022-08 76.13 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 08112022-08 TW St-23 76.13 US Bank
1 1080 0 08122022-03 -75.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 08122022-03 TW Credit -75.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 07272022-01 252,23 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 07272022-01 WS Work Gloves 252.23 US Bank
1 1080 0 07292022-02 51.36 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 07292022-02 WS Supplies 51.36 US Bank
1 1080 0 08082022-01 65.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 08082022-01 WS Coffee 65.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 08082022-02 65.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 08082022-02 WS Coffee 65.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 08082022-03 65.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 08082022-03 WS Coffee 65.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 08082022-04 65.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 08082022-04 WS Coffee 65.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 08112022-10 427 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv, 08112022-10 SA St-21 4.27 US Bank
1 1080 0 08102022-02 79.99 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF !nv. 08102022-02 WS Coffee 79.99 US Bank
1 1080 Y 08202022-01 305.40 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4021 |EDCF iInv. 08202022-01 WS Hose Clamp Pouch 305.40 US Bank
1 1080 0 07282022-04 244.44 EDCF08292022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 07282022-04 LL Water Blades 244.44 US Bank
1 1080 0 07312022-03 1009.93 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4142 |EDCF Inv. 07312022-03 LL. Radio Straps 1009.93 US Bank
1 1080 0 08022022-03 116.07 EDCF09292022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08022022-03 LL Filter 116.07 US Bank
1 1080 0 08032022-02 134.04 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08032022-02 LL St-21 Supplies 134.04 US Bank
1 1080 0 08052022-03 2159 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 08052022-03 LL St-21 Supplies 21.59 US Bank
1 1080 0 08092022-03 167.24 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. 08092022-03 LL Office Supplies 167.24 US Bank
1 1080 0 08092022-04 202.69 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. 08092022-04 BS Prevention Chair 202.69 US Bank
1 1080 0 08122022-09 14.99 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08122022-09 GA Adobe 14.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 08192022-03 273.48 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4260 |EDCF Inv. 08192022-03 GA Chief File Cabinet 273.48 US Bank
1 1080 0 07272022-02 34.24 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv, 07272022-02 SA St-23 34.24 US Bank
1 1080 0 none 1891.01 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 6020 |EDCF Inv.07292022-03 SA Training Ground Materi{ 1891.01 US Bank
1 1080 0 08152022-07 -494.70 EDCF09292022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 6020 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-07 SA Credit -494.70 US Bank
1 1080 0 08152022-08 2637.44 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 6020 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-08 SA Training Ground Mater| 2637.44 US Bank
1 1080 0 08172022-02 477.29 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 6020 |EDCF inv. 08172022-02 SA Training Ground Mater] 477.29 US Bank
1 1080 0 08102022-03 42.27 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 08102022-03 LS Charger 42.27 US Bank
1 1080 o] 08132022-01 114.39 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 08132022-01 MO Filter 114.39 US Bank
1 1080 0 08132022-02 114.39 EDCF09292022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 08132022-02 MD Filters 114.39 US Bank
1 1080 0 08122022-04 77.50 EDCF(09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 08122022-04 MD Polaris Oil Change Kit|  77.50 US Bank
1 1080 0 08132022-03 97.60 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 08132022-03 MD Fleetguard Fuel Kit 97.60 US Bank




Authorizing signatures;

1 1080 0 08142022-02 140.44 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 08142022-02 MD Polaris Maint. Kit 140.44 US Bank
1 1080 0 07232022-07 384.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv, 07232022-07 TC Website 384.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 07262022-09 2911.83 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4462 |EDCF Inv. 07262022-09 TC PIO Equipment 2911.83 US Bank
1 1080 0 08022022-04 600.00 EDCF09282022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08022022-04 TC Programs 600.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 08042022-06 83.88 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08042022-08 TC Software 83.88 US Bank
1 1080 0 08042022-07 14.99 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08042022-07 TC Adobe 14.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 08062022-04 1.99 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv. 08062022-04 TC 1.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 08132022-04 1252.37 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 08132022-04 TC Admin Phones 1252.37 US Bank
1 1080 0 0819202204 90.00 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561001 | 4539 |EDCF Inv, 0819202204 TC Active 911 JPA 90.00 US Bank
1 1080 0 07262022-10 70.23 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4461 |EDCF Inv. 07262022-10 PL DCE 70.23 US Bank
1 1080 0 08082022-02 751.29 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4145 |EDCF inv. 08082022-02 PL 751.29 US Bank
1 1080 0 none 219.43 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Nv. 08132022-05 PL 219.43 US Bank
1 1080 Q 08152022-08 54.95 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 08152022-08 PL 54.95 US Bank
1 1080 g 08152022-09 12.99 EDCF09292022 08/29/22 2 8561000 | 4539 |EDCF Inv, 08152022-09 PL Adobe 12.99 US Bank
1 1080 0 08202022-02 83.73 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4461 |EDCF Inv. 08202022-02 PL Sirius 83.73 US Bank
1 1080 0 07232022-08 86.94 EDCF09292022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 6020 |EDCF Inv. 07232022-08 TW 86.94 US Bank
1 1080 0 08092022-05 20.37 EDCF09292022 09/29/22 2 8561000 | 4080 |EDCF Inv. 08092022-05 WS Supplies 20.37 US Bank




Outside District Claim Form
District: El Dorado County Fire
USE ONLY
Date: 9/28/2022
Prepared By: Kathiesn Freeman i -
Contact Phone: 530-644-5830 # 104 — Document Total:
40 2022.23 EDCF Bills ; . $59,642.39
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES Waﬂm%m LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE CT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR PERFORMED AND THAT NO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES. I FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUT, HORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
= DIRECTORS TO APPROVE PAYMENT REQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED INVOICE(S).
\ d/
Authorizing signatures: % "-;ﬂ(/ > /-I\_
MYAE | venoom | mems A avoice Number (Unht 20) amoult " mie name DATE e ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME SEPARATE CHECK
1 558 0 242283 1621.62 | EDCF08282022 912822 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 242283 Seals 1621.62 AllStar Fire Equipment Inc.
1 2580 0 D485185 4768.70 | EDCF09282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 3040 [EDCF Inv. D485165 Aug. 2022 Premiums 4768.70 American Fidelity
1 2580 0 D486174 4539.62 EDCF08282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 3040 |EDCF Inv. D496174 Sept. 2022 Premiums 4539.62 American Fidelity
1 241 o 805465806 471.28 EDCF08282022 os/28/22 2 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 805465806 Acct. 200737467 St-25 471.28 Amerigas, Inc.
1 3200 0 931841 21.00 EDCF08282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4021 |EDCF Inv. 93184-1 FATS Tags 21.00 Amnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3200 0 93184-2 33.70 EDCF08282022 08/28122 2 8561000 | 4022 |EDCF Inv. 93184-2 Name Tags 33.70 Arnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 3200 o 83248 257.40 EDCF09282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4142 |EDCF Inv. 93248 Radio Tags 257 40 Arnolds For Awards, Inc,
1 3200 0 98764 338.78 EDCF098282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4300 |EDCF Inv. 98764 Plaques 338.78 Arnolds For Awards, Inc.
1 604 1 287312327106%8102022 433.41 EDCF09282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 287312327106X9102022 Cell Service 433.41 AT&T Mobility
i 1965 1 10333 85.00 EDCF09282022 0g/28/22 2 8561000 | 4324 |EDCF Inv. 10333 DMV Physical - Slirling 85.00 ADM Screening
1 4934 0 757613 274.45 EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 757613 E-28 27445 C & H Motor Parts, Inc.
1 4834 (1] 757913 1206.05 EDCF09282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 757913 1206.05 C & H Motor Pars, Inc.
1 4834 1] 758137 15.44 EDCF08282022 os/28/22 2 8561000 4162 (EDCF inv. 758137 E-17 15.44 C & H Motor Parts, Inc.
1 4934 0 758248 203.27 EDCFp8282022 092822 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. 758248 E-17 203.27 C & H Motor Parts, Inc.
1 487 0 1737071 113,34 EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF inv. 1737071 113.34 Capitol Clutch And Brake, Inc.
_1 544 0 126678 3321.70 EDCF08282022 08r28/22 2 8561000 | 6040 |EDCF Inv. 126678 Wildland PPE 3321.70 Cascade Fire Equipment Co
1, 544 0 1264586 BB.73 EDCF08282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 6040 |EDCF inv. 126456 Wildland PPE 88.73 Cascade Fire Equipment Co
1 72 0 08142022-01 687.25 EDCF08282022 oer28r22 2 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09142022-01 Acct. 8987-5172 5t-25 697.25 City Of Placerville
1 1481 0 08172022-01 a7.52 EDCF08282022 os/z28/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF inv. 09172022-01 Accl.8155600520004352 ¢ 87.52 Comcast
1 1491 0 08232022-01 236,19 EDCF08282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 4040 |EDCF Inv. 09232022-01 Acct.8155600510102943 ¢ 236.19 Comcast
1 1481 o 09062022-03 146,19 EDCFo08282022 0a/28r22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF inv, 09062022-03 Acct.8155600510591210 ¢ 146.19 Comcast
1 1491 1] 08032022-03 146.09 EDCF09282022 08/28/22 2 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 09032022-03 Acct.8155600520285746 § 146.09 Comcast




Authorizing signatures:

8765 0 2202117 7016.88 EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 8561000 4300 |(EDCF Inv. 2202117 First Responder Fee 7016.88 DTA
1 8765 o 2205138 5306.77 | EDCF09282022 | og/z8/22 2 [ 8561000| 4300 |EDCF inv. 2205138 First Responder Feg 5306.77 DTA
1 21 0 1744393260030 132.24 | EDCF09282022 |  osrzerzz 2 | 8561000 4085 |EDCF Inv. 1744383260030 Acct 4030-300213 Si1 132.24 EI Dorado Disposal
1 21 0 1744393270030 198.35 | EDCF09282022 | oorzera2 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 174439327U030 Acot, 4030-300214 st 198.35 El Dorado Disposal
1 21 0 174438789U030 23228 | EDCF09282022 |  oor2ai22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 1744387890030 Acct, 4030-30030858 q 23228 El Dorado Disposal
1 21 0 1744389620030 23459 | EDCF08282022 | 0sor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF Inv. 174438862U030 Accl, 4030500428 St-{  234.59 El Dorado Disposal
1 21 0 174439305U030 198.35 | EDCF09282022 |  os/z8/22 2 | 8561000 | 4085 |EDCF inv. 1744393050030 Acct, 4030-300308 St4 198.35 El Dorado Disposal
1 46 [} 09032022-02 132.60 | EDCF09282022 | ooraiz2 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 03032022-02 Acct, 039078001 St-19 | 13260 El Dorado Irrigation District
1 46 [ 09032022-03 365.55 | EDCF09282022 | oorz8r22 2 | 8961000 | 4700 [EDCF Inv. 0903202203 Acct. 065026-001 5t.23 365.55 Ei Dorado Irrigation District
1 46 0 09212022-01 266.15 | EDCF09282022 |  o09/28/22 2 | 8561000 4700 [EDCF Inv. 0921202201 Acct. 033143-001 5028 266.15 El Dorado lIsrigation District
1 46 0 09212022-02 450.28 | EDCF09282022 | o09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09212022-02 Accl. 033142001 S1.28 450.28 E1 Dorado Irrigation District
1 46 o 09082022-01 11042 | EDCF09282022 |  oor28/22 2 | 8561000| 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09082022-01 Acct. 053692.001 Goid 1l 110.42 EI Dorado Irrigation District
1 a7 1 0167353-IN 253.83 | EDCF09282022 | o9r28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4500 [EDCF Inv. 0167353-IN - Badge - Danal 253.83 Entenmann-Rovin Co.
1 11446 | 9 09202022-01 350.00 | EDCF09282022 | o09r28/22 2 | 8561000| 4617 |EDCF inv. 09202022-01 Class A Uniform Reimburs|  350.00 Galbraith, Shane
1 103 0 09302022-01 56347 | EDCF09282022 | o9r2a/22 2 | 8561000| 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09302022-01 Acct, 060-2920-001 St-72| 563.47 A gL
1 103 0 09302022-02 93.05 | EDCF09282022 | 092822 2 | 8561000 | 4700 [EDCF Inv.08302022-02 Acct. 060-1030.007 St73| 9305 eorgetown Livias Pubic Uiy
1 4660 [} 4396 1898.00 | EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4300 [EDCF Inv. 4396 Legal Services Aug, 2022 1898.00  Fawards, Stevens & Tucker
1 3434 [} Cl035578 23185 | EDCF09282022 | o0sr28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. CI035578 E.25 231.85 | 06N Slale Emergancy Vehicie
1 3434 0 Cl033757 465.09 | EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000| 4162 |EDCF Inv. CI033757 Cab Bushings 465.09 | ©Goiden Slale tmargency Venicie
1 3434 0 CI034982 565.00 | EDCF09282022 | oor28r22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv, Ci034982 E-19 56500 | ©owen Staie ﬁﬁﬁ, foency Venicie
1 3434 0 C1035734 17821 | EDCF09282022 |  oor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDGF inv. Cl035734 OES 178.21 olaen State tmergency Venicie
1 3434 0 1035736 618.82 | EDCF09282022 |  oor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. CI035736 £-25 618.82 | Soiden mmﬁ*ﬁ gency Vericle
1 3434 0 Cl035419 1162.89 | EDCF09282022 |  ogr28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. Cl035419 E25 1162.89 \den-Sisis Ll
1 3434 0 Cl035148 154.09 | EDCF09282022 |  o0g/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. CI035148 E-17 154,09 M State cmergency Ven:
1 3434 0 Cl035221 312.70 | EDCF09282022 |  o9/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. C035221 E-28 312,70 | GoldenSlaie crmergency VeNicie
1 3434 0 Cl034987 156.90 | EDCF09282022 |  o09r28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. Cl034987 E-19 156.90 | Golden ey Vehicle
1 3434 [ Cl034890 16349 | EDCFO8282022 |  gorzer22 2 | 8561000 | 4162 |EDCF Inv. Cl034890 E-17 153.49 | “olden State Emerg o)
1 3460 0 32375761 120074 | EDCF09282022 | 0o/zeraz 2 | 8561000 | 4420 |EDCF Inv. 32375761 Copy Machine Loase 1290.74 | ®realimenca Financia
1 1680 0 81749 502.50 | EDCF09282022 | oorzsizz 2 | 8561000 | 4300 |EDCF Inv. 81748 7515 Green Valley Road 50250 | Interwest Cansulting Group Inc.
1 11917 | 1 1441 205224 | EDCF09282022 | ooreaiz2 2 | 8561000 | 6023 |EDCF Iny. 1441 St17 2052.24 John Kristedja Architect
1 822 1 229355-1 258.94 | EDCF09282022 | oorzeia2 2 | 8561000 | 4700 [EDCF Inv. 2293551 St2s 258.94 JS West
1 822 1 229355-2 1595 | EDCF09282022 |  oorze/z2 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF inv. 2293552 St.28 15.95 JS West
1 822 1 738934-1 363.32 | EDCF09282022 | osrze/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF inv. 738934-1 St17 363.32 JS West
1 822 1 738934-2 1595 | EDCF09282022 |  o09r28/22 2 | 8561000| 4700 |EDCF Inv. 738934-2 St17 15.95 JS West
1 822 1 746098-1 450.02 | EDCF09282022 |  0g9/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF inv. 746098-1 St.21 450,02 JS West
1 822 1 746098-2 15.95 | EDCF09282022 | oor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 746098-2 St.21 15.95 JS West
1 2519 [} 11965670 53.08 | EDCF09282022 | os/z8/22 2 | 8561000 | 4040 |EDCF Inv. 11965670 Telestat Linas 53.08 Kronos
1 2519 0 11957341 70535 | EDCF09282022 |  09r28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4040 [EDCF Inv. 11957341 Telestal Linos 705.35 Kronos
1 2519 1] 11953357 4411 EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 8561000 4040 |EDCF Inv. 11953357 Telestaff Lines 4411 Kronos
1 514 0 INV629760 330.33 | EDCF09262022 |  oorzerz2 2 | 8561000 | 4507 |EDCF inv. INV629760 Fire Hose 330.33 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc.
1 514 [ INV752625 165.17 | EDCF09282022 | o9r28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4507 |EDCF Inv. INV752625 Hose 165.17 L.N. Curtis & Sons, Inc,
1 4974 [} 10872 45.80 | EDCF09282022 |  o9r28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4400 [EDCF Inv. 10872 Pubfic Notice 45.80 Mountain Democrat
1 4974 [ 10873 56.00 | EDCF09282022 | ogrzer22 2 | 8561000 | 4400 |EDCF Inv. 40873 Public Notice 56.00 Mountain Democrat




Authorizing signatures:

1 4974 0 10842 56.00 | EDCF09282022 | oor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4400 [EDCF inv. 10842 Public Notice 56.00 Mountain Democrat

1 4974 0 10843 45.50 | EDCF09282022 |  o09/28/22 2 ] 8561000 | 4400 [EDCF Inv. 10843 Public Notice 45.50 Mountain Democrat

1 62 [} 0915202-01 1278.32 | EDCF09282022 | osrze/zz 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDGF Inv. 0915202-01 Acct, 24638079580 St.27 1279.32 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 0915202202 1476.02 | EDCF09282022 |  ooiz8/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 0915202202 Acct. 02044557756 St72 1476.02 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09152022-03 1307.17 | EDCF09282022 |  oor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 [EDCF Inv. 09152022-03 Acct. 9160165239-6 525 1307.17 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09192022-02 9.61 EDCF09282022 |  o09r28/22 2_ | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09192022-02 Acct, 5707449531.8 st19|  9.61 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09192022-03 834.53 | EDCF09282022 | o09i28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF inv.09192022-03 Accl 41966334773 o147 834.53 Pacific Gas & Elscric, Inc.
1 62 0 09192022-04 740.94 | EDCF09282022 |  09r28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF inv. 0915202204 Accl 750119201415 Gok| 740.94 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09222022-0+ 1946.51 | EDCF09282022 |  osr28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 [EOCF Inv. 0922202201 Accl. 95630442956 528 1946.51 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09142022-02 4.74 EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09142022-02 Acct. 50579940524 Stig 4.74 Pacific Gas & Elactric, Inc.
1 62 0 09122022-01 2112 | EDCF09282022 |  o0or28r22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 0912202201 Accl. 67205342006 St-19| 21.12 Pacific Gas & Electric, inc.
1 62 0 09122022-02 81093 | EDCF09282022 | owrzerzz 2 | 8961000| 4700 |EDCF Inv, 0912202202 Accl. 9361049424.2 St1g 810.93 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09122022-036 1051 | EDCF09282022 |  ogr28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09122022036 Acct. 8542934160.3 St.1 10.51 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09072022-01 197.91 | EDCF09282022 |  oor28/22 2 | 8561000| 4700 |EDGF Inv. 09072022-01 Accl, 37524865641 st-23| 197.91 Pacific Gas & Eleciric, Inc.
1 62 0 09072022-02 58.06 | EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv.09072022-02 Accl, 9575072740.6 St-23| 58.06 ‘Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 62 0 09162022-01 10.05 | EDCF09282022 |  og/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4700 |EDCF Inv. 09162022-01 Acct, 17556025169 st-28|  10.05 Pacific Gas & Electric, Inc.
1 3193 0 117167 3025 | EDCF09282022 |  oorzai22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDGF Inv. 117167 St25 30.25 Placerville Hardware

1 3193 0 117168 3552 | EDCF09282022 |  oorzai22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 [EDCF inv. 117168 St.25 35.52 Placervifle Hardware

1 3193 [} 117163 1.99 EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. 117163 St.25 1.99 Piacerville Hardware

1 1553 o A1042024 2571 | EDCF09282022 |  oor2er22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1042024 st-17 25.71 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1042229 31.03 | EDCF09282022 |  oor28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1042229 St-17 31.09 Pallock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 B740831 49.32 | EDCF09282022 |  o0g/28122 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. B740831 St17 49.32 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1563 0 A1042496 4501 | EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1042496 St-17 45.01 Pollock Pines True Valus
1 1553 [ A1042504 8466 | EDCF09282022 | oorazz 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF inv. A1042504 St-17 84.66 Poliock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1043862 16.06 | EDCF09282022 |  09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1043862 S117 16.06 Poliock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1044315 81.39 | EDCF09282022 | 09/28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 [EDCF Inv. A1044315 St-17 81.39 Pollock Pines True Valye
1 1553 0 A1044598 15.00 | EDCF09282022 |  osr2s/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1044598 St-17 15.00 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1044662 5231 | EDCF09282022 | oorzsr22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. A1044662 S1-17 52.31 Pollock Pines True Valus
1 1553 0 A1044705 1836 | EDCF0s282022 |  oos28/22 2 | 8561000 | 4197 [EDCF Inv. A1044705 St-17 18.36 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1045429 1521 |EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 |8561000 | 4197 |EDCF inv. A1045429 St17 15.21 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1 0 A1045472 26.04 _ |EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 18561000 | 4197 [EDCF I, A1045472 St-17 26.04 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1 0 A1046168 15 EDCF09282022 05/28/22 2_ 18561000 | 4197 |EDCF inv. Atods 168 St-17 15 Pollock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1046434 31.09 _|EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 lsse1000 | 4197 |epcr i A1046434 St-17 31.09 Paliock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 B741026 11.87 _ |EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 18561000 | 4197 |EDCF Inv. B741026 St-17 11.97 Pollock Pines Trus Value
1 1553 0 B7410605t-17 491 |EDCF09282022 05/28/22 2 18561000 | 4197 |EDGF Inv. B7410605t-17 491 Poliock Pines True Value
1 1553 0 A1047484 4.08 |@Faeeaznzz 09/28/22 2 18561000 | 4187 |EDCE nv. A1047484 St-17 4.06 Pollock Pines True Value
1 2317 0 0176188-IN 52 EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2_ lss61000 | 4324 |EDCE 10y, 0176188-IN 52 Proferred Alliance, Inc.

1 922 0 3777224-0 774 |EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 Jes61000 | 4280 |EDCF Inv. 3777224-0 Office Supplies 77.4 Sierra Office Suppy & Printing
1 1778 i $D3552 76523 |EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 |sse1000 | 6020 |EpcF Inv. SD3552 St-28 765.23 Ski Air

1 9786 0 09142022-03 290.75 _|EDCF09282022 09/28/22 2 I8561000 | 4100 |EDCF Iy, 0914202203 Life 290.75 | Texas Life Insurance Company
1 11994 | 4 09302022-03 350 |EDCF09282022 00/28/22 2 561001 | 4020 |EDCF 1w, 09302022-03 Duty Boot Reim aso Thompson, Tayler

1 434 0 9915951502 5124 |EDCF09282022 0s/28/22 2 18561000 | 4040 |EDGE v, 991595150m-m1751.24 Verizon Wireless

1 434 0 9915951500 92448 |EDCF05282022 09/28/22 2 18561000 | 4040 |EDCF inv. 9915951500 Cell Service 8/16-0/15 924.48 Verizon Wireless




1

Aulhorizing signatures:

438

0

9915951501

409.2

EDCF092820:

09/28/22

S81

4040

EDCF Inv. 9915951501 iPad Data

409.2

Verizon Wireless




Oulside District Claim Form ’ OCESBOR USE ONL
| District: El Dorado County Fira METHOD I THE BPACE BELOW: e s N
[AUDITOR USE OMLY
Data: 9/28/2022
Prepared By: Kathlsen Freeman
DEPT:_
|Contact Phone: 530-644-9630 # 104 p——
39 2022-23 9-28-2022 EDCF Bills o - $16,489.52
THE ARTICLES FOR SERVICES DESCRIBED BY THE INVOICE(S) ATTACHED AND LISTED BELOW WERE APPROVED AND ARE INCLUDED IN THE DISTRICT BUDGET THAT HAS BEEN ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS AND WERE
NECESSARY FOR USE BY THE DISTRICT AND HAVE BEEN DELIVERED OR AND THATNO PRIOR CLAIM HAS BEEN PRESENTED FOR SAID ARTICLES OR SERVICES, | FURTHER CERTIFY | AM AUTHORIZED BY THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS TO APPRO PAYME] EQUESTS TO THE AUDITOR-CONTROLLER FOR THE ATTACHED mvmcgg&
-~
T A
V3
Authorizing signatures: il : e}
AT | venoor | s involca Number (Limit 20) AMOUNT ,nfuuns DATE it ORG OBJECT DESCRIPTION (LIMIT 50 CHARACTERS) AMOUNT VENDOR NAME —— §
__CHECK looc;
1 8131 1004275327 14234.48 | EDCF09282022 9/28/22 2 B561000 | 4507 |EDCF Inw. 1004275327 Disposal of Foam 14234.48 Clean Harbor
1 8131 1004200525 2255.04 EDCF08282022 082822 2 B561000 | 4507 |EDCF Inv. 1004280525 Disposal of Foam 2255.04 Clean Harbor




EL DORADO COUNTY
AUDITOR-CONTROLLER
ELECTRONIC FUNDS TRANSFER

MEMORANDUM
TO: K.E. Coleman, Treasurer/Tax Collector
FROM: Department/District: El Dorado_County Fire District
Authorized Signature: ;{

Joe Harn, Auditor-Controller

Authorized Signature:

DATE:
RE: AUTHORIZATION TO ELECTRONICALLY TRANSFER FUNDS

This is my official warrant to pay via electronic transfer on _9/26/2022 , as described below:

METHOD OF TRANSFER: |- ACH WIRE TRANSFER
AMOUNT: $119,905.61
BANK NAME: Union Bank

BANK BRANCH: 400 California Street

San Francisco. CA 94104

ABA NUMBER/ROUTING NUMBER: 1220200496

BANK ACCOUNT NUMBER: 0050206971

BANK ACCOUNT/PAYEE NAME: CalPERS Fiscal Services Division

PAYEE INVOICE NUMBER (if any): 100000016938648

FENIX DOCUMENT NUMBER:

I hereby certify that the above ACH/Wire transfer instructions and account
information has been confirmed by me.

7‘(»\4’\\«6?)\ e ennan S 9 M/ﬂ/ﬂ ﬂ/jt ,

Print name of employee responsible Date
for accuracy of wire instructions

Treasury Use Only

PAYMENT # DATE TIME INITIAL

APPROVED RELEASED TIME INITIAL




19'S06'61TS V101

1€'820°0€S 7207 13G0320 Y¥eaH vdf 0v0€ 1001958
0£ 778689 2207 1940320 yiean 1sig ovog 0007T9S8
LNNOWNYV (XYW S¥3LOVEVHI 08) NOILJIYISIA ONIYLS 123r0Yd 123rgo 3A02 Y0

€202 4240120 swinjwaid YieaH vdr/193s1a ‘NOILVIIRILSAT YIISNVHL FHIMux

IVILINI
11va
AYNSYIYL OL IDILON z2/9z/60
SYH 87 GIWYHIINOD Y3IJISNVYL a3L1S3N0D3Y
(NOLLYDIJILSNC SIUINDTY) (03Y #100v/vay)
ot wm"_mzwmﬁ uaucﬂ O ¥34SNVAL HoY (] MVYEQHLIM OLNY HOV []
. . (S¥3.10oVvHVHDI0Z)
T9°S06°6TTS INNOWY 8¥98€69T000000T Y3SNAN IDIOANI
x_n_u_Dw
IFNNAN UOISIAIQ S921AIBS |BISI4 SHId|eD
4 Y44 d3gnn

FNVN YOAN3IA
HOGN3A XIN3J

QIVS 404 3AVIN N338 SYH LNIWISYNESIa HOIYd ON LVHL ONV "JOAN3A A8 Q3LVOI180 SV Q3y3AN3a

38 1M HO SYH LVHL 3DIAY3S V YOS HO AIAIITY SWALI 34Y ‘SSINISNE ALNNOD 19NANOD OL AYVSSIDIN
JHIM 'IACYAAY OL ALIYOHLNY AN NIHLIM 138V SINIWND0A ONILYOJdNS QIHIVLLY JHL HLIM ONOW
LNIWISYNESIA IYIM A3LSIND3IY SIHL 40 STVLIA IHL LVHL AJILNED AGYAH | NOILVZIMOHLNY INJWIYVJ3a

JUNLVYNDIS QIZIBOHLNY

v

INVN G3ZIMOHLNY INIYd

SUOTIOTY Wy

{(¥3annn Lisia v)

S ~ ¥3I8AINN PIsIg 3414 Ayuno) opeloq |3 VN
INIWLYVdIq ININLYVdIa
. Q33IN03Y JANVN LNI¥d
e/ 7  YINTYS
= ) 3lva uewsaal4 usasuiey
| _A< JUNLYNOIS 4 IYIBN  :Ad Q3¥vdlyd

1S3IND3Y YIASNVYHL JYIM/HOV

‘S310N

ilva
#IVNYNOS L

ilva
# IVNYNO( ddVv

ONISS3ID0Ud

—

A8 A3AOYddY

A8 GIMIIATY

ilva
A9 J343LIN3T

‘NOILdI¥4DS3a ¥3aviIH

31vd NOILLY
# I/
#20da
02166 102V HSVYD
# HOLlvg
AINO 35N s, yolLany



P.0O. Box 942715, Sacramento, CA 94229-2715

A\\\W/’é | CalPEI{S 888 CalPERS (or 888-225-7377) | TF1§\>(< gggg gigzgﬁg

www.calpers.ca.gov

California Public Employees’ Retirement System

Tim Cordero @3 Business Unit: 1800

El Dorado County Fire Protection District q %\/l , CalPERS ID: 4388508673
PO BOX 807 ) 3y P\ statement Date: 09/14/2022
4040 CARSON ROAD o S Ve

CAMINO, CA 95709-0807 AT 520,

A@“

Health Premium Statement - PERS

: = Billing
Receivable ID Description Month Amount
100000016938648 |Total Active & Retired Premium: $167,942.72 10/2022
PA Billing Active Premium $111,007.40
PA Billing Employer Share of Retired Premium $8,344.00
Admin Fee for Active: (0.33% of Total Active Premium) $366.32
Admin Fee for Retired: (0.33% of Total Retired Premium) $187.89
Subtotal $119,905.61
100000016905112 |Previous Payment Due 09/2022 $122,518.29
Payment Applied ($122,518.29)
Subtotal $0.00

Total Payment Due 10/10/2022: $119,905.61

v WHNCETRMAMIVAIOR



Retain this Statement for your records.

Health Premium payments are to be paid in full by the 10t of each month. Payments which are not
received in full on or before this date will be assessed interest on the next month's statement (California
Code of Regulations §599.515) and may be subject to the delinquency process. Please note that this
monthly statement is a demand for payment in accordance with the Public Employees’ Medical and
Hospital Care Act, and failure to timely remit health premium payments in full by the 10th of each month
may result in the termination of health care coverage for your agency pursuant to Government Code
§22939 and collection of any outstanding amounts, including, but not limited to, all outstanding health
premium payments/contributions, interest, penalties, and the costs of collection, including reasonable

legal fees, when necessary to collect the amount due.

Please pay this statement using Electronic Funds Transfer (EFT) debit or Automated Clearing House

(ACH) credit method. Please visit my.calpers.ca.gov to schedule a debit EFT payment or call our
CalPERS Customer Contact Center at 888 CalPERS (or 888-225-7377) for information regarding EFT
ACH credit payments. Please allow two banking days prior to the due date for payments to be received at

CalPERS on time.
To view the Monthly Employer Billing Roster, please log on to my.calpers.ca.gov and select the
Download Roster option that is located within the Billing and Payment Summary section. If discrepancies

are discovered when reconciling the Statement to the Roster or the Roster to your internal records,
please contact us. The Health Premium Billing should be reconciled on a monthly basis.

If you have questions, please contact the CalPERS Customer Contact Center at
888 CalPERS (or 888-225-7377).

ows ETORUTAAERMAT

P



EL DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE 952022
2 DORAGO COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT PREPARED BY Kathiesen Freaman
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (including division) Phone # 5305429830
DEPOSITOR NUMBER 208554
ENTER GO AND CURRENCY (auto ponulates Total Deposit section) Total Deposit Section
|8 001]x] 0 |3 - |3 1.00 (x| 0 |s - COIN 0.00
5|$ 005|x|] o |s - |$ 500 x| 0 |s - CURRENCY 1,103.00
3ls ot0[x| o s - Is 1000lx] o [s - CHECKS 3,322.00
2ls o25[x] o |s - |s  2000fx| o |s OFF - SITE 0.00
£1$ 050|x| o 3 5 $ 5000 x| O |s - DIRECT 0.00
© $ 10000|x| 0 |[s - 9/9/2022
Total Coin: s - Total Currency: s -
TOTAL
Enter Total Checks:[:, Enter Total Qf‘fsztes: DEPOSIT 4,425.00
Enter Total Direct Beposit!‘-./‘!ire:

SENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):

s
F ORG h?:;:g; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (30 CHARACTERS MAX.) AMOUNT
X
1 |8561000] 1401 223 CR#765 CK#10035 3170 Gold Nugget Way 372.00
2 |8561000| 4022 291 CR#766 Cash Duty Attire 40.00
3 8561000 4022 291 CR#767 Cash PT Shorts 15.00
4 |8561000] 1401 223 CR#768 CK#1084 5670 Thompson Hill Road 186.00
5 |8561000f 1401 223 CR#769 CK#105 4921 Rattlesnake Bar 186.00
6 |8561000|] 1401 223 CR#770 CK#10317 4550 Business Drive . 678.00
7 |8561000| 4022 291 CR#771 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
8 [8561000| 1401 223 CR#772 CK#3002 3651 Meder Road 186.00
9 |[8561000| 4022 291 CR#773 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
10 |8561000f 1401 223 CR#774 CK#1256 Incident Report 40.00
11 |8561000{ 1401 223 CR#775 CK#501 3475 Ramada Way 186.00
12 |8561000( 1401 223 CR#776 CK#191 4200 Pine Ridge Court 186.00
13 |8561000| 1401 223 CR#777 Cash 4121 Vega Loop 200.00
14 |8561000( 1401 223 CR#778 CK#226 1930 Hwy 193 186.00
15 |8561000f 1401 223 CR#779 Cash 354 Raben Way 200.00
16 [8561000| 1401 223 CR#780 Cash 3510 Pleasant Road 200.00
JOE HARN, C.P.A. AUDITOR / CONTROLLER ) C.L. RAFFETY, TREASURER/TAX COLLECTOR
BY .. . BY
ATE DATE
P # .. ; e s oaenome | JENUMBER | 2019- -
e T
Updated 1/1/18

RIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR / GREEN - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIP




EL DORADO COUNTY
DEPOSIT PERMIT

PAGE 2 OF 2
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE September 9, 2022
El DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (Including Division) PREPARED BY
PHONE NUMBER: 803561
DEPOSITOR NUMBER
GENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):
S ;
; ORG Nol?n‘n";g; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (50 CHARACTERS MAX.) AMOUNT
17 8561000 1401 223 CR#781 CK#1222 4080 Naturewood 186.00
18 8561000 4022 291 CR#782 Cash Duty Hat 16.00
19 8561000 4022 291 CR#783 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
20 8561000 4022 291 CR#784 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
21 | 8561000 1401 - 223 CR#785 CK#5121 4601 Brookside 186.00
22 8561000 4022 291 CR#786 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
23 8561000 4022 291 CR#787 Cash Duty Shirts 47.00
24 .| 8561000 1401 223 CR#788 CK#7985 2052 Indian Rock 186.00
25 8561000 1401 223 CR#789 Cash 3311 Cascade Trail 200.00
26 | . 8561000 1401 223 CR#790 CK#1028 2103 Cable Road 186.00
27 .| 8561000 4022 291 CR#791 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
28 8561000 4022 291 CR#792 Cash Duty Attire 15.00
29 8561000 1401 223 CR#793 CK#1409 4920 Cameron Road 186.00
30 8561000 1401 223 CR#794 CK#6916 La Caille Estates 186.00
31 8561000 4022 291 CR#795 Cash Duty Attire 50.00
32
33
34
35
36
37
38

JOE HARN, C.P.A. AUDITOR/CONTROLLER
BY

BY
ATE DATE
)
P # COUNTY TREASURY

LCERTIFIED INTO THE

SECTION GOVT CODE

TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIPT

C.L. RAFFETY, TREASURER/TAX COLLECTOR

BATCH
DATE

CODED BY




EL DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE
El DORADO COUNTY FIRE FROTCTION DISTRICT PREPARED BY
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (including division) Phone #
DEPOSITOR NUMBER
ENTER COIN AND CURRENCY {autc populates Total Deposit section)
> $ 001X 0 |3 - $ 100 x| O |s
5|$ 005[x| o |[s - |$  s00f{x| 0 |s
5 $ 010|x] © $ - 3 10,00 [ x| O |s
s o025|x| o |s - |s  2000|x| o |s
S[$ 050 x| o |[s - |$ s5000|x[ 0 |s
© $ 10000 |x| o [s
Total Coin: $ - Total Currency: $

Enter Total Direct Deposit/Wire:

Enter Total Checks: :’ Enter Total Offsitee:

3ENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):

1312022
Kathleen Freeman
530-644-9830
808581
Total Deposit Section
COIN 0.00
CURRENCY | - 336-60-
CHECKS )G) 3:69700 |
oFF-sitE || '] 0.00
DIRECT ‘ 0.00
9/13/2022
TOTAL

DEPOSIT 3,43300

s
F ORG ﬁfn‘n";:; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (30 CHARACTERS MAX) AMOUNT
X
1 |8561000| 4022 291 CR#796 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
2 8561000 1401 223 CR#797 CK#1075 148 Margret Drive 186.00
3 |8561000] 4022 291 CR#798 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
4 |8561000| 4022 291 CR#799 Cash Duty Attire 60.00
5 |8561000| 4022 291 CR#800 Cash Duty Hat 16.00
6 |8561000| 1401 223 CR#801 CK#2279 1601 Shadow Hawk 186.00
7 18561000 1401 223 CR#802 CK#2278 3805 Carson Road 186.00
8 18561000 1401 223 CR#803 CK#9742 6051 Cozy Dell Lane 186.00
9 |8561000] 1401 223 CR#804 CK#1026 2820 Silver Tip Lane 186.00
10 |8561000| 1401 223 CR#805 CK#1296 920 Pacific St 586.00
11 |8561000| 1401 223 CR#806 Cash 912 Lowell Lane 200.00
12 |8561000| 1401 223 CR#807=CK#1136 Dus Vistas-Brive— 15660
13 |8561000| 4022 291 CR#808 Cash Duty Hat 20.00
14 (8561000 1401 223 CR#809 CK#60553 3310 Harris Road 186.00
15 |8561000] 1401 223 CR#810 CK#1125 4875 Mountain View 186.00
16 |8561000| 1401 223 CR#811 CK#6894 212 Armory Drive 186.00
JOE HARN, C.P.A, AUDITOR/ CONTROLLER E C.L. RAFFETY, TREASURER/TAX COLLECTOR
BY ' ‘ BY
ATE DATE
PE cermren ot [ e numser | 201 .
noesseenoteon [ puray

RIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR / GREEN - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIP

Updated 1/1/18




EL DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
PAGE 2 OF 2
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE September 13, 2022
El DORADC COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (Including Division) PREPARED BY
PHONE NUMBER;: 808561
DEPOSITOR NUMBER

GENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):

S

OBJECT

; ORG NUMBER PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (50 CHARACTERS MAX.) AMOUNT

17 8561000 1401 223 CR#812 CK#6114 La Caille Estates 186.00

18 8561000 1401 223 CR#813 ICK#1228 4080 Naturewood 93.00

19 8561000 1401 223 CR#814 CK#2019 4341 Lake Ridge Drive 186.00

20 8561000 1401 223 CR#815 CK#2118 2600 Barkley Road 186.00

21 8561000 1401 223 CR#816 CK#12389 2849 Ray Lawyer Drive 186.00

22 “

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

JOE HARN, C.P.A. AUDITOR/CONTROLLER C.L. RAFFETY, TREASURER / TAX COLLECTOR
BY o BY [
ATE DATE
P # CERTIFIED INTO THE BATCH
- i o COUNTY TREASURY DATE
SECTION GOVT CODE| CODED BY

TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIPT




EL DORADO COUNTY

DEPOSIT PERMIT
TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE
B DORADG GO PROTOTION D PREPARED BY K
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (including division) Phone #
DEPOSITOR NUMBER
3|8 001[x] o |3 - |3 1.00 [ x| 0 |s - COIN 0.00
©|$ 005|x] o |s - |$  s00]x| 0 [s - CURRENCY 0.00
3ls o10[x] o [s - |$ 1000|x| 0 |s CHECKS 13,175.00
Els 025[x| o |s - |8 2000[x| o [s . OFF - SITE 0.00
£ls 050 x| o |3 - |s 5000(x| 0 [s - DIRECT 0.00
© $ 10000|x| 0 |s - 9/19/2022
Total Coin: $ - Total Currency: $ -
TOTAL
Entar Total f:h-evzic5:: Enter Total f as DEPOSIT 13,175.00
Erter Total Direct :}ﬂma;”re

iENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):

)
F ORG Sfﬁjgg; PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (30 CHARACTERS MAX.) AMOUNT
X
1 |8561000| 4500 124 Paramedic Program Grant - Melton 13,175.00
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
6
JOE HARN, C.PA. AUDITOR/ CONTROLLER C.L. RAFFETY, TREASURER/TAX COLLECTOR
BY. BY
TE DATE | o =
T e ooy | vEnummer [ 20t
onozs seoTon o™ [ ipuTeY
Updated 1/1/18

UBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR / GREEN - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIP




EL DORADO COUNTY
DEPOSIT PERMIT .

RIBUTION: WHITE - AUDITOR / GREEN - TREASURY / YELLOW - DEPARTMENT RECEIP

TREASURER HAS RECEIVED A DEPOSIT FROM DATE
El DORADD COUNTY FIRE PROTCTION DISTRICT PREPARED BY
DEPARTMENT OR AGENCY NAME (including division) Phone #
DEPOSITOR NUMBER 04
ENMTER COM AND CURRENCY (auio populates Total Deposit section) Total Deposit Section
>[$ 001]x| o |3 - |3 1.00 x| 0 |s COIN 0.00
8|$ 005[x|] o [s - |8 s00({x| 0 [s CURRENCY 0.00
Sls o10fx] o [s - |s 1000[x| o |s CHECKS 13,435.18
2ls 025)x| o |s - |s  2000]x| o [s OFF - SITE 0.00
£l$ 050 x| o |s$ - |$ s5000|x| o |s ; DIRECT 0.00
© $ 10000 (x| 0 |s - 9/21/2022
Total Coin: s - Total Currency: s -
TOTAL
Enter Total CE‘necks:|:l Enter Total Oi’fsétes: DEPOSIT 13,435.18
Enter Toial Direct Degmsi‘t/‘i‘!ire;
SENERAL LEDGER ACCOUNT LINES (type apostrophe first if there are leading zero):
B
OBJECT
; ORG NtnEER PROJECT STRING DESCRIPTION (30 CHARACTERS MAX ) AMOUNT
1 |8561000| 4022 291 Duty Hat 20.00
2 |8561000| 1940 226 CalCard Rebate 1,480.35
3 |8561000[ 4617 427 Personnel Training Class Reimbursement 5,974.00
4 |8561000] 420 415 St-17 Sidewalk Lease 1,000.00
5 8561000 4140 23 Duplicate Payment 20.37
6 |8561000( 1400 431 Fire Inspection Fee's 932.50
7 |8561000] 881 220 August Move-up 1,124.36
8 |8561000( 1947 227 Insurance Refund 484.00
9 |8561000| 1400 431 Fire Inspection Fee's 2,376.60
10 [8561000| 4022 291 Duty Attire 23.00
1
12
13
14
15
16 y 7@
JOE tiARN," C.P.A. AUDITOR / CONTROLLER C.L. RAFFETY, TREASURER/TAX COLLECTOR
BY Pi% BY
ATE DATE
) CERTIFIED INTO THE
P# CERTTEDINIOME | JENUMBER | 2019 -
UNDER SECTION GOVT
CODE 27008 INPUT BY
Updated 1/1/18




To: Board of Directors
From: Tim Cordero, Fire Chief
Date: October 10, 2022
Subject: Insurance Renewal

The District was informed by our insurance broker, Northern California Fire
District Association Administered by ISU Insurance Services - Atwood Agency,
that our current policy would not be renewed. Our agent has been looking for
alternative insurance coverage, not only for our District, but all districts covered
by NCFDA. A renewal proposal has been secured through California Association
of Mutual Water Companies, Joint Powers Risk and Insurance Management
Authority (JPRIMA).

The new proposal includes several changes from the previous policy such as:
e Significant rate increase to $169,270.00 and renewal date changed to 4/1
from 11/1
e JPRIMA requires a three-year commitment, early exit allowed if rate
increase exceeds 15%
e Terrorism coverage is automatically included
e Earthquake and flood insurance not included

With the change in the renewal date to April 1%, the proposal identifies a pro-rated
cost to cover from November 1% thru April 1*, which will be approximately $70,525.
The renewal of $169,270 would be due on April 1%, bringing the total cost for Fiscal
Year 2022/23 to approximately $239,795.00. Staff reached out to our broker, and
they will allow for quarterly or bi-annual payments. The quarterly payment option
would bring our 2022/23 costs to approximately $112,842 and 2023/24 payment of
$169,270.00.




There are also several other changes to coverages and deductibles and
representatives from ISU Insurance Services - Atwood Agency will be present at
the Board meeting to provide information on these changes.

Staff would recommend the Board approve the insurance quote from JPRIMA as
presented by NCFDA ISU Insurance to include quarterly payments at the April 1%
renewal. Staff would also recommend the Board authorize the Fire Chief to sign
the “Agreement to become party to the amended Joint Powers Agreement creating
the California Association of Mutual Water Companies Joint Powers Risk and
Insurance Management Authority” and associated application for membership at
$100 per year.




To: Board of Directors

From: Tim Cordero, Fire Chief

Date: August 12, 2022

Subject: Shared Services Agreement with Diamond Springs - El
Dorado Fire Department

Staff from El Dorado County Fire (ECF) and Diamond Springs - El Dorado Fire
Department (DSP) have working towards a shared service agreement for the past
few months. The foundation of the shared service agreement before the Board is
consistent with the previous agreement, with some additional clarifications and
responsibilities. Over the past months, staff and the Unions have met to discuss
the opportunities and challenges that are possible with entering into the
agreement.

Both staff and Unions from ECF and DSP support the shared service agreement
and are looking forward to additional opportunities to further collaborate,
improving our service delivery and workplace enhancements for our firefighters.

The shared service agreement was approved by the Diamond Springs Board of
Directors during their October 11, 2022, Board Meeting.

Staff would recommend the Board of Directors approve the Shared Service
Agreement between the Diamond Springs - El Dorado Fire Department and El
Dorado County Fire Protection District.

Attachments:
Support letter from Local 3556
Support letter from Local 4972







El Dorado County Professional Firefighters Association ¢ Local 3556
P.0. Box 1926 e Placerville, CA 95667
iaff3556.org

October 7, 2022

Tim Cordero, Fire Chief
4040 Carson Rd.
Camino, CA 95709

Chief Cordero,

On behalf of our membership and executive board, | wish to express our support for
the Shared Services Agreement between the El Dorado County Fire Protection District
and the Diamond Springs — El Dorado Fire Protection District. We would like to revisit
the agreement and the impacts to our members after a year. We see a tremendous
amount of value in both agencies cooperating in areas where common ground is
shared. We look forward to identifying more ways to work synergistically to
potentiate both agencies’ abilities to serve our communities and meet our missions.

Respectfully,

Jacob Poganski
President

Affiliated with the International Association of Firefighters ¢AFL-CIO



DIAMOND SPRINGS / EL DORADO PROFESSIONAL
FIREFIGHTERS
LOCAL 4972

Locar 4917

September 28, 2022

Chief Gallagher,

The Diamond Springs Firefighters Union Local 4972 met on September 28" 2022 and voted
unanimously to support the proposed Shared Services agreement between Diamond Springs/El
Dorado FPD and El Dorado County FPD. We look forward to this cooperative agreement

between the two departments and support moving forward with the process.

Sincerely,

Spencer Morgan
Vice President Local 4972



AGREEMENT FOR SHARED ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
This Agreement for Shared Administrative Services (“Agreement”) is made and entered this
October 20%, 2022 (the “Effective Date”), by and between the Diamond Springs- El Dorado Fire
Protection District(“DSEDFPD”) and the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (“EDCFPD”)
(hereinafter collectively referred to as “Parties”, or individually as a “Party”), both of which are
public agencies organized and existing under and by virtue of the laws of the State of California.

RECITALS

WHEREAS, DSEDFPD is charged with providing all aspects of fire services delivery within its
jurisdictional boundaries, including by way of illustration and not by limitation, fire suppression,
emergency medical services, fire prevention, and emergency/disaster management as provided for
in the California Health and Safety Code § 13862 and Government Code, § 8550 et seq
(“DSEDFPD Duties”).

WHEREAS, EDCFPD is charged with providing all aspects of fire services delivery within its
jurisdictional boundaries, including by way of illustration and not by limitation, fire suppression,
emergency medical services, fire prevention, and emergency/disaster management as provided for
in the California Health and Safety Code § 13862 and Government Code, § 8550 et seq (“EDCFPD
Duties™).

WHEREAS, the Parties wish to share administrative services, such that the DSEDFPD will assist
EDCFPD in carrying out the EDCFPD Duties as set forth in this Agreement and EDCFPD will
assist DSEDFPD in carrying out the DSEDFPD Duties as set forth in this Agreement.

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises set forth in this Agreement, the
PARTIES agree as follows:

L EFFECTIVE DATE AND TERM

This Agreement shall take effect on the Effective Date set forth above, and the term of
this Agreement shall conclude on November 1%, 2023.

II. SHARED SERVICES.

DSEDFPD shall provide EDCFPD with the services identified in Exhibit A-1 (“DSEDFPD
Services”), and EDCFPD shall provide DSEDFPD with the services identified in Exhibit
A-2 (“EDCFPD Services”) (collectively, the Shared Services”). In providing DSEDFPD
Services, DSEDFPD shall comply with all lawful instructions of EDCFPD, and in
providing EDCFPD Services, EDCFPD shall comply with all lawful instructions of
DSEDFPD.

III. EXCLUDED SERVICES.

All DSEDFPD Duties not described as EDCFPD Services are excluded from this
Agreement and shall remain the sole responsibility of DSEDFPD. All EDCFPD Duties

00146953.6 1



IV.

VL

not described as DSEDFPD Services are excluded from this Agreement and shall remain
the sole responsibility of EDCFPD.

COMPENSATION.

The consideration supporting this Agreement is DSEDFPD’s commitment to provide
EDCFPD with the DSEDFPD Services and EDCFPD’s commitment to provide DSEDFPD
with the EDCFPD Services.

INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR

DSEDFPD, in the performance of this Agreement, is and shall act as an independent
contractor. DSEDFPD understands and agrees that DSEDFPD and all of DSEDFPD’s
employees shall not be considered officers, employees, agents, partner, or joint venture of
EDCFPD, and are not entitled to benefits of any kind or nature normally provided
employees of EDCFPD and/or to which EDCFPD’s employees are normally entitled,
including, but not limited to, State Unemployment Compensation or Worker’s
Compensation. DSEDFPD shall assume full responsibility for payment of all federal, state
and local taxes or contributions, including unemployment insurance, social security and
income taxes with respect to DSEDFPD’s employees.

EDCFPD, in the performance of this Agreement, is and shall act as an independent
contractor. EDCFPD understands and agrees that EDCFPD and all of EDCFPD’s
employees shall not be considered officers, employees, agents, partner, or joint venture of
DSEDFPD, and are not entitled to benefits of any kind or nature normally provided
employees of DSEDFPD and/or to which DSEDFPD’s employees are normally entitled,
including, but not limited to, State Unemployment Compensation or Worker’s
Compensation. EDCFPD shall assume full responsibility for payment of all federal, state
and local taxes or contributions, including unemployment insurance, social security and
income taxes with respect to EDCFPD’s employees.

No Partnership or Joint Venture. Nothing herein contained shall constitute a
partnership, joint venture, or other similar relationship between the Parties hereto or
constitute any party the agent of the other. No Party shall hold itself out contrary to the
terms of this Section. This Agreement is not for the benefit of any third party and shall not
be deemed to give any right or remedy to any such party whether referred to herein or not.

INDEMNIFICATION

To the furthest extent permitted by California law, DSEDFPD shall indemnify, defend, and
hold free and harmless EDCFPD and EDCFPD’s employees, officers, and board members
(the “Indemnified Parties”) from any actions, assessments, counts, citations, claims, costs,
damages, demands, judgments, liabilities (legal, administrative or otherwise), losses,
notices, expenses, fines, penalties, proceedings, responsibilities, violations, reasonable
attorney’s and consultants’ fees and causes of action to property or persons, including
personal injury and/or death (each, a “Claim”) to the extent that the Claim (1) arises out of,

00146953.6 2



VII.

VIIL

pertains to, or relates to the negligent errors or omissions (active or passive, ordinary or
gross), recklessness (ordinary or gross), or willful misconduct of DSEDFPD, its directors,
officials, officers, employees, volunteers, contractors, subcontractors, consultants, or
subconsultants; or arises out of, pertains to, or relates to the DSEDFPD’s breach of this
Agreement. EDCFPD may accept or reject legal counsel DSEDFPD proposes to defend
the Indemnified Parties with, in its sole and absolute discretion, and may thereafter appoint,
legal counsel to defend the Indemnified Parties at DSEDFPD’s expense against a Claim.

To the furthest extent permitted by California law, EDCFPD shall indemnify, defend, and
hold free and harmless DSEDFPD’s and DSEDFPD’s employees, officers, and board
members (the “Indemnified Parties”) from any actions, assessments, counts, citations,
claims, costs, damages, demands, judgments, liabilities (legal, administrative or
otherwise), losses, notices, expenses, fines, penalties, proceedings, responsibilities,
violations, reasonable attorney’s and consultants’ fees and causes of action to property or
persons, including personal injury and/or death (each, a “Claim”) to the extent that the
Claim (1) arises out of, pertains to, or relates to the negligent errors or omissions (active or
passive, ordinary or gross), recklessness (ordinary or gross), or willful misconduct of
EDCFPD, its directors, officials, officers, employees, volunteers, contractors,
subcontractors, consultants, or subconsultants; er arises out of, pertains to, or relates to the
EDCFPD’s breach of this Agreement. DSEDFPD may accept or reject legal counsel
EDCFPD proposes to defend the Indemnified Parties with, in its sole and absolute
discretion, and may thereafter appoint, legal counsel to defend the Indemnified Parties at
EDCFPD’s expense against a Claim.

COMPLIANCE WITH APPLICABLE STATUTES, ORDINANCES, AND
REGULATIONS. As an express covenant of this Agreement, DSEDFPD shall comply
with applicable law in performing DSEDFPD Services. As an express covenant of this
Agreement, EDCFPD shall comply with applicable law in performing EDCFPD Services.

INSURANCE. Each Party shall furnish and keep in full force and affect during all times
of the Agreement the following insurance:

A. Workers Compensation Insurance as required under California law, covering all
employees exercising duties pursuant to the Agreement, and Employer’s Liability
coverage with limits of not less than $1,000,000 per accident or disease.

B. Comprehensive Liability insurance to include general liability, medical
malpractice, automobile liability, and public officials and professional liability for
bodily injury, personal injury, property damage, wrongful acts and/or errors and
omissions arising out of their respective employees’ duties pursuant to this
Agreement, including officers, agents, representatives, subcontractors, or
volunteers. These policies shall provide coverage per one of the following Options
[either Option B(i) or B(ii)], in the following minimum amounts:

Option B(i)
1. Commercial General Liability Limits

00146953.6 3



00146953.6

Limits of not less than $2,500,000 each occurrence
$5,000,000 aggregate

c. Personal Injury

1) Limits of not less than $2,500,000 each occurrence
2) $5,000,000 aggregate

ow

2. Automobile Liability Limits

a. Bodily Injury
1) Limits of not less than $§1,000,000 per person
2) $2,000,000 per accident
3) Coverage to include owned, non-owned and hired autos

b. Property Damage
1) Limits of not less than $1,000,000 per occurrence

3. Public Officials Liability and/or Errors and Omissions

a. To include coverage for the wrongful acts, errors and omissions of
elected and appointed officials, employees and volunteers.
1). Limits of not less than $1,000,000 per claim
2). $2,000,000 aggregate

4. Medical Malpractice Coverage
a. Limits of not less than $1,000,000 per claim or occurrence
b. $2,000,000 aggregate.

3 Umbrella or Excess Insurance

a. Limits not less than $2,000,000 per claim or occurrence

b. Such policy or policies shall include as insured the additional
insured PARTY under the underlying policy(ies)

C. Coverage shall be at least as broad as specified for underlying
coverages, and the full limits of the umbrella or excess coverage
shall be available to the additional insured PARTY

Option B(ii)
1. Commercial General Liability Limits

a. Limits of not less than $1,000,000 each occurrence

b. $2,000,000 aggregate

c. Personal Injury
1) Limits of not less than $1,000,000 each occurrence
2) $2,000,000 aggregate

2, Automobile Liability Limits

a. Bodily Injury
1) Limits of not less than $500,000 per person
2) $1,000,000 per accident
3) Coverage to include owned, non-owned and hired autos

b. Property Damage
1) Limits of not less than $100,000 per occurrence

3. Public Officials Liability and/or Errors and Omissions
a. To include coverage for the wrongful acts, errors and omissions of

elected and appointed officials, employees and volunteers.
b. Limits of not less than $1,000,000 per claim

4



IX.

00146953.6

C. $2,000,000 aggregate
4. Medical Malpractice Coverage

a. Limits of not less than $1,000,000 per claim or occurrence
b. $2,000,000 aggregate
5. Umbrella or Excess Insurance
a. Limits not less than $9,000,000 per claim or occurrence
b. Such policy or policies shall include as insured the additional
insured PARTY under the underlying policy(ies)
¢ Coverage shall be at least as broad as specified for underlying

coverages, and the full limits of the umbrella or excess coverage
shall be available to the additional insured PARTY

Parties shall submit a certificate evidencing such coverage in a form satisfactory to
each Party’s Counsel prior to this Agreement being in force.

Each Party acknowledges that the insurance coverage and policy limits set forth in
this Agreement constitute the minimum amount of coverage and limits required.
The insurance requirements under this Agreement shall be the greater of (1) the full
insurance coverage and limits carried by each Party, or (2) the minimum insurance
requirements set forth herein. It is agreed that these insurance requirements shall
not in any way act to reduce coverage that is broader or that includes higher limits
than the minimums required herein, and no representation is made that the
minimum insurance requirements of this Agreement are sufficient to cover the
respective obligations of each Party.

Each Party shall name the other, its officers, employees, and agents as additional
insured on its liability policies; provided that neither Party shall be required to name
the other as an additional insured on its professional liability (errors and omissions

policy).

Parties shall provide thirty (30) days written notice to the other prior to cancellation
or modification of any insurance required by this Agreement. Parties shall furnish
a certificate for the period covered by this Agreement. Any insurance written on a
claims-made basis is subject to the approval of each Party’s Board of Directors.
Insurance coverage in the minimum amounts set forth herein shall not be construed
to relieve each Party of liability in excess of such coverage, nor shall it preclude
each Party from taking such other actions as are available to it under any other
provisions of this Agreement or law. Any deductibles or self-insured retentions
must be declared on the certificate of insurance and approved by each Party in

writing.

STANDARD OF CARE. In performing DSEDFPD Services, DSEDFPD shall exercise
reasonable care consistent with generally and currently accepted principles and practices
of his/her profession for services to fire protection districts, and in performing EDCFPD
Services, EDCFPD shall exercise reasonable care consistent with generally and currently

5



XI.

XII.

XIII.

XIV.

XV.

XVI.

accepted principles and practices of his/her profession for services to fire protection
districts.

NOTICES. Any required notice may be given either by personal service or by deposit
(postage prepaid) in the U.S. Mail addressed as follows:

A. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Protection District
501 Pleasant Valley Road
Diamond Springs, CA 95619
Attn: Fire Chief

B. El Dorado County Fire Protection District
4040 Carson Road
Camino, CA 95709
Attn: Fire Chief

ENTIRE AGREEMENT; AMENDMENT. Parties agree that this Agreement constitutes
the sole and only Agreement between them representing administrative services and
correctly sets forth their obligations and duties with respect to each other. This Agreement
may only be amended by a writing signed by both Parties.

WAIVER. No provision of this Agreement shall be considered waived by either Party
unless such waiver is set forth in writing.

SEVERABILITY. Should any provision of this Agreement be held by a court of
competent jurisdiction to be invalid, void, or unenforceable, the remaining provisions shall
continue in full force and effect, unless to do so would frustrate the intent and purpose of
this Agreement.

COUNTERPARTS. This Agreement may be executed in identical counterparts, each of
which shall constitute a duplicate original. Each Party shall provide a true and correct copy
of this Agreement to the other Party.

EXECUTION. By executing this Agreement, DSEDFPD and EDCFPD acknowledge that
they have carefully read and agree to be bound by all the terms and conditions contained
in the Agreement.

FORCE MAJEURE. No Party shall be liable to any other Party for any loss or damage
of any kind or for any default or delay in the performance of its obligations under this
Agreement (except for payment obligations) if and to the extent that the same is caused,
directly or indirectly, by fire, flood, earthquake, elements of nature, epidemics, pandemics,
quarantines, acts of God, acts of war, terrorism, civil unrest or political, religious, civil or
economic strife, or any other cause beyond a Party’s reasonable control.

XVII. VENUE/GOVERNING LAWS. This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the

00146953.6 6



State of California and venue shall be in the County and/or federal judicial district in which
District’s principal administrative office is located.

IN WITNESS HEREOF, the Parties have executed this Agreement in the County of El
Dorado, State of California as of the Effective Date first set forth above.

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection

District

7 Matt Gallagher’
Fire Chief

ATTEST:

By: /\Q/-f 49"’/

Peee-ll;dg;ﬂ’ev. G;A? Coop o/~
DSEDFPD Board Difector

00146953.6

El Dorado County Fire Protection District

By:
Tim Cordero
Fire Chief
ATTEST:
By:

Chris Swarbrick
EDCFPD Board Chairman



EXHIBIT A-1
DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

DSEDFPD SERVICES

The following (3) items below will allow for enhanced efficiencies by sharing available
personnel and resources.

e Community Risk Reduction/Prevention:
(Included but not limited to)

1.
2. Plan Review

3.

4. Public Education

Code Enforcement

Fire Investigations

e Duty Officer coverage for emergency scene management:
(Included but not limited to)

1. Provides a second Chief on significant and second/additional incidents.

2. Allows for additional overhead staff when needed on incidents i.e., Safety
Officer, operations Chief, etc.

3. DSEDFPD Chief Officer(s) will be available for response as Primary Coverage
during business hours.

4. DSEDFPD Chief Officer(s) will provide “7709” / backup Chief Officer response
on assigned shift(s).

5. Chief Officer coverage coordinated with EDCFPD Chief Officer(s)

e Training:
(Included but not limited to)

1. Standardized continuity for training between agencies.

2. Maintaining Federal, State, and Local requirements for training standards through
multi-company and engine company trainings.

3. Standardized training to meet all firefighter safety aspects.

4. Enhancing specialized training between agencies on special operations and other
recognized disciplines that are identified as needed.

5. Training requirements and compliance of DSEDFPD staff shall be the

00146953.6

responsibility of DSEDFPD.



EXHIBIT A-2
DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

EDCFPD SERVICES

The following (3) items below will allow for enhanced efficiencies by sharing available
personnel and resources.

e Community Risk Reduction/Prevention:
(Included but not limited to)
1. Code Enforcement
2. Plan Review
3. Fire Investigations
4. Public Education

e Duty Officer coverage for emergency scene management:
(Included but not limited to)
1. Provides a second Chief on significant and second/additional incidents.

2. Allows for additional overhead staff when needed on incidents i.e., Safety
Officer, operations Chief, etc.

3. EDCFPD Duty Chief will provide primary response to emergencies within
DSEDFPD on their assigned shifts, after business hours, on weekends and
holidays.

4. EDCFPD Chief Officer(s), in coordination with DSEDFPD Chief Officer(s) will
provide “7709” / backup Chief Officer response on assigned shift(s).

e Training:

(Included but not limited to)

1. Standardized continuity for training between agencies.

2. Maintaining Federal, State, and Local requirements for training standards through
multi-company and engine company trainings.

3. Standardized training to meet all firefighter safety aspects.

4. Enhancing specialized training between agencies on special operations and other
recognized disciplines that are identified as needed.

00146953.6 9



5. Training Officer will provide EDCFPD module training and training supplements to
DSEDFPD. Training requirement compliance shall be the responsibility of
DSEDFPD.

00146953.6 10



To: Board of Directors

From: Tim Cordero, Fire Chief

Date: October 12, 2022

Subject: California Fire Code Ordinance 2022-02 Adoption

On September 30, 2022 the Board of Director reviewed and approved the first
reading of Ordinance 2022-02, without any changes to the proposed California Fire
Code updates. The second reading has been publicly noticed, as required and is
being brought back to the Board for final review and adoption.

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District Fire Prevention Bureau has
provided information to the proposed changes, which is included in this staff
report.

Staff would recommend the Board of Directors adopt Ordinance 2022-02, adopting
the 2022 Edition of the California Fire Code, repealing Ordinance 2019-o1.

Attachment:
ECF 2022 CFC Adoption PowerPoint




2022 California Fire Code
Adoption

Braden Stirling
Fire Marshal

Model Codes

« International Codes
Building Standards Commissions adopts model codes every 3 years.

+« California Codes
State of California adopts, amends and publishes State code by July.

% Local Ordinance
Local Fire agencies may amend to include more restrictive requirements.
Amendments due climate, topography, and/or geography only.
Regional Fire agencies in agreement

o (El Dorado County, EDHFD, Rescue, Diamond Springs, Pioneer, and
Cameron Park)

FIRE




Major Code Changes

< Added permit and regulations for automobile wrecking yards.
+ Added permit for traffic calming devices.
« Clarified open burning restrictions.

« Clarified sprinkler requirements for existing commercial buildings
with additions and/or increased fire and life safety risk.

+ Changed residential fire sprinkler alarm device from bell to
horn/strobe.

Major Code Changes

% Added commercial fire alarm monitoring company response
requirement

+« Clarified commercial fire alarm requirements for existing
buildings with additions and/or increased fire and life safety risk.

+ Added liability for cost and/or damages due to negligent or
unlawful use of hazardous materials resulting in emergency
response.

+ Removed requirement for property owners to lease propane
tanks.

FIRE




Major Code Changes

«» Removed requirement for pyrotechnic proprietary information.

«»» Reduced required fire flow for new residential developments of
up to 4 homes from 1000gpm to 750gpm.

FIRE




2022 California Fire Code
Adoption

Braden Stirling
Fire Marshal



Model Codes

% International Codes
» Building Standards Commissions adopts model codes every 3 years.

% California Codes
« State of California adopts, amends and publishes State code by July.

% Local Ordinance
* Local Fire agencies may amend to include more restrictive requirements.
 Amendments due climate, topography, and/or geography only.
* Regional Fire agencies in agreement

o (El Dorado County, EDHFD, Rescue, Diamond Springs, Pioneer, and
Cameron Park)




Major Code Changes

% Added permit and regulations for automobile wrecking yards.
% Added permit for traffic calming devices.
¢ Clarified open burning restrictions.

¢ Clarified sprinkler requirements for existing commercial buildings
with additions and/or increased fire and life safety risk.

% Changed residential fire sprinkler alarm device from bell to
horn/strobe.




Major Code Changes

<* Added commercial fire alarm monitoring company response
requirement

% Clarified commercial fire alarm requirements for existing
buildings with additions and/or increased fire and life safety risk.

*» Added liability for cost and/or damages due to negligent or
unlawful use of hazardous materials resulting in emergency
response.

% Removed requirement for property owners to lease propane
tanks.




Major Code Changes

% Removed requirement for pyrotechnic proprietary information.

“ Reduced required fire flow for new residential developments of
up to 4 homes from 1000gpm to 750gpm.




EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2022-02

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE EL DORADO
COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD) adopting the 2022
Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code,
regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and
from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the
ECFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance
No. 2019-01 of the ECFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict
therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD, also known as the El Dorado

County Fire Protection District:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The ECFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022
Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic,

geological and/or topographical conditions. The ECFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section
18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions
by Resolution #2019-10 of the ECFPD dated September 19, 2019.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 1



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The ECFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in_its entirety,

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406,
903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022

California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 “TITLE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of ECFPD, hereinafter
referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246.

SECTION 105.6.25 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the

installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 2



SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or
modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 “PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in the most current
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

SECTION 107.5.1 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to
the scene of an incident.

SECTION 107.7 “ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

SECTION 111.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and
present oral, written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board.

SECTION 112.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 3



or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not
more than $700.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of
the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 780 days, or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and
17995).

SECTION 112.4.2 “CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5¢ (commencing with
Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

SECTION 113.4 “FAILURE TO COMPLY” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 179995).

Chapter 2

SECTION 202 “CAMPFIRE” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes.

SECTION 202 “DISTRICT” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or
hereafter established.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2)
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District.
SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the
Jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 4



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open
burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with safety or
occupational uses typically considered open flames: For the purpose of this definition, a chamber
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts,
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust
gas are open.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.
Exception:

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ’s or gas
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the
following:

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code.

b. Devices shall be used per manufacturer's specifications.

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to all flammable material and vegetation.
d

. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.q.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shall be
issued by the fire code official.

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures:
a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area.

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable material and
vegetation.

An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the burn area.
The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines.

An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished.

™ o Q o

No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 5



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 302.1 “DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.
BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.

HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LATTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the jurisdiction of
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD), including the Local Response Area (LRA),
is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal Fire) issues a
burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be made effective
24-hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on all lands within the jurisdiction of ECFPD at any time the fire
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires hazardous,
including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag
warnings, severe threat of wildland fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, wildlife,
property, or natural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall

be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures.

Chapter 5
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width

of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 6



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed
width of not less than 12 feet wide.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around
fire apparatus.

SECTION 503.2.6 “BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. \Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current EI Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive.
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

SECTION 503.3.1 “NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway,
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking
facility, designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place
is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to,
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height
that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE”, which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words
“FIRE LANE”.

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 503.3.3 “FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 7



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width
as required in Appendix D as amended by the district.

SECTION 503.6 “SECURITY GATES” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION 505.1 “ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of '/2 inch
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 “WHERE REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
(183 m).

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total
usable area of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on
an outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” in letters not less

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 8



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior
side of the fire control room door opening.

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit.
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls.
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any
other storage.

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.
SECTION 510.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours.

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 “WHERE REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction shall be provided in the
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through
903.2.23.

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial
pUrposes.

SECTION 903.2.1.1 “GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following
conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex
SECTION 903.2.1.2 “GROUP A-2” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 9



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.3 “GROUP A-3” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such

occupancies.

SECTION 903.2.3 “GROUP E” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area.

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 10



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable
quantity are used or stored.

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12" grade, see Section 903.2.20

SECTION 903.2.4 “GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.7 “GROUP M” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.7.2 “GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES” SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.8.5 “MANUFACTURED HOMES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 11



Section 903.2.5.2 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 903.2.9 “GROUP S-1” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10 “GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 “COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be

provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 12



SECTION 903.2.22 “GROUP B” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.23 “GROUP F-2” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in
Chapter 11 and as follows:

1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building.

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure
shall be made to conform to Section 903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section
903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

SECTION 907.2. “WHERE REQUIRED — NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2. Where Required — New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.30 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are
provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due
to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a
location approved by the enforcing agency.

Exceptions:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 13



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler
monitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire
code official.

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.q. retail sales, food service,
and/or special events).

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features,
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures.

SECTION 907.2.1.4 “GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.2.3 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.3.11 “GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.4.1 “GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.5.2 “GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 14



SECTION 907.2.6.6 “GROUP | UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
installed in all group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.7.2 “GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.9.4 “GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm
system shall be installed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than
3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.10.1 “GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

907.2.30 “TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.2.30 “Type | Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a
Type | Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for
that building.

907.6.5 “MONITORING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as “U’).

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 15



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

SECTION 907.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended
to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTION 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of
the building or structure is increased

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code
official. EXxisting installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33

SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the
project.

SECTION 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either

temporary or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence,
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge.
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTION 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County
Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of
Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage
of Class | and Class Il liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class
Il liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 58

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 17



SECTION 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 61

SECTION 6104.2 “MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS” SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from existing
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least
one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official,
and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for
residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County
of El Dorado.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 “AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS” IS ADOPTED,
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22.3 as follows:

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code,
Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 18



SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 — “STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES” IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:
Add new Section 4.6 as follows:

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize
a “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development.

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a
mounted and accessible cabinet.

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire
code official.

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1) “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- | FLOW DURATION
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
AREA (Design Standard) (gallons per
(square feet) minute)
0 - 3,600 No automatic sprinkler | 1,000 1
system

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 19



CA Fire Code or Section

3,601 and greater | No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table | Duration in Table
system B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the
required fire-flow
rate
MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (6 PARCELS OR GREATER)
0 - 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 7,000 1
CA Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the |1/2 value of

Table B105.1(2) | 2

CA Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the CA
Residential Code

313.3 of the CA | (min. 1000
Residential Code GPM)

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0 - 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 500 1

3,601 and greater

Section 903.3.1.3 of the
CA Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the CA
Residential Code

1/2 value of Table | 1

B105.1(2)
750 GPM)

(min.

TABLE B105.2 “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,

GROUP R-3,

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

(Design Standard)

(gallons per minute)

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW

(hours)

system

No automatic sprinkler

Value in Table
B105.1(2)

Duration in Table B105.1(2)

CA Fire Code

Section 903.3.1.1 of the

25% of the value
Table B105.1(2)°

in | Duration in Table B105.1(2) at

the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2022-01

Page 20




Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Roads

SECTION D103.1 “ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of
shoulders (see Figure D103.1).

Exception: Driveways
SECTION D103.2 “GRADE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended
California Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

SECTION D103.3 “TURNING RADIUS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the
fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 “FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less
than 15 feet (3658 mm).

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type.
3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person.

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced
or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the
fire code official.

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION D103.6.1 “ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 21



SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 “CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the ECFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances
herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared to be severable. The ECFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions,
sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared

invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The ECFPD Board
Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the

District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may

be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 22



certified copy shall be posted in the office of the ECFPD pursuant to Government Code Section
36933(c) (1).

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the ECFPD on
September 30, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the
Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 20, 2022 and approved by the following

vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD this, day of
, 2022.

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

Chris Swarbrick, Board Chair

ATTEST:

Kathleen Freeman, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 23



El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Monthly Run Statistics and Call Break Down - September 2022
Engine Companies and Medic Units

Total Responses for Engine Companies: 685

Engine Company Monthly Totals

350
300
250
200
150
100
b I II Il I“ rih
. 1 1
Engine 17 Engine 19 Engine 25 Engine 28 Engine 72
M January M February March ®April = May June mJuly mWAugust M September
Monthly Call Type Comparisions
Engine Companies
500
400
300
200
100
" el A0 Bl DD w5 -

Medical Aid Fire Traffic Collision Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover

M January M February March B April = May June MJuly M August HSeptember




El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Total Responses for Medic Units: 913

Medic Unit Monthly Totals

450
400
350
300
250

20 |I || |‘ ||| |I || ‘ll
0 II III II II III

15
Medic 17 Medic 19 Medic 25 Medic 28

o O

10
5

= ©

M January M February March ®April = May June mJuly mAugust M September

Monthly Call Type Comparision Medic Units

900
800
700
600

0 | S [ . | | .. I.. II mi mlm __ s |I I| ||I

40
Medical Aid Fire Traffic Collision Transfer Misc Move / Cover

o O

30
20
10

o O O

M January M February March ®April = May June MJuly MWAugust B September




El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Station 17 Run Review September 2022

ENGINE 17: 123 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 88

Fire-6

Traffic Collision- 7

Public Assist- 5

Misc.- 15

Move/Cover - 0

MEDIC 17: 149 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 130

Fire-3

Traffic Collision- 8
Transfer- 5

Misc-0

Move/Cover - 123




Response Breakdown September 2022

Move/Cover

2% 000 T

Miscellaneous
12%

Public Assists

4%

B Medical Aid
Fire m Traffic Collisions
5%

i Fire

M Public Assists

Traffic Collisions B Miscellaneous

6%
u Move/Cover
Medical Aid
71%
E17 Monthly Statistics Comparison
100
90
80 =
HJan-22
70 - M Feb-22
60 - = Mar-22
W Apr-22
50 -
B May-22
40 M 22-Jun
30 4 22-Jul
22-Aug
20 - 22-Sep
10 -
0 .

Medical Aid  Trafic Collision Fire Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover




Response Breakdown September 2022

Medical Aid

Move Up 47%
47%
B Medical Aid

H Traffic Collision
W Fire
H Transfer

M Miscellaneous

& Move Up
Miscellaneous
0% Traffic Collision
Transfer Fire 3%
2% 1%
M17 Monthly Statistics Comparison
160
140
120 mJan-22
W 22-Feb
100
m Mar-22
80 W Apr-22
B May-22
60 M 22-Jun
22-Jul
- 22-Aug
22-Sep

20

Medical Aid Traffic Fire Misc. Transfer Move/Cover

Collision




FIRE El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Station 19 Run Review September 2022

ENGINE 19: 74 Total Calls
Medical Aid - 42

Fire - 6

Traffic Collision - 9

Public Assist - 1

Misc - 16

Move/Cover - 2

MEDIC 19: 114 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 100

Fire-4

Traffic Collision- 8
Transfer- 3

Misc- 2

Move/Cover - 117




Response Breakdown September 2022

Miscellaneous
21%

Public Assists
1%
Medical Aid
55%

Traffic Collisions
12%

E19 Monthly Statistics Comparison

80

70

60

50

40

30

20

10

hl

Medical Aid Traffic Fire Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover
Collision

B May-22
M Jun-22
B Jul-22
H Aug-22
N Sep-22
1 Oct-22
Nov-22
Dec-22




Response Breakdown September 2022

Fire

. Miscellaneous
2% 1%

Medical Aid
43%

Move Up
50%

Traffic Collision
3%

M19 Monthly Statistics Comparison

200

180

160

140

120

100

80

60

40

20

Medical Aid Traffic Collision Fire Misc. Transfer Move/Cover

H May-22
M Jun-22
mJul-22
H Aug-22
H Sep-22
m Oct-22
Nov-22
Dec-22




El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Station 25 Run Review September 2022

ENGINE 25: 303 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 227

Fire-11

Traffic Collision- 14

Public Assist- 15

Misc- 29

Move/Cover - 7

MEDIC 25: 327 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 262

Fire- 3

Traffic Collision- 13
Transfer- 14

Misc- 5

Move/Cover - 70




Response Breakdown September 2022
Move/Cover
—

2%

Miscellaneous

9%

Public Assists
5%

Fire

4%

—_— -

B Medical Aid

M Traffic Collisions

Traffic Collisions
5%

i Fire
M Public Assists
M Miscellaneous

u Move/Cover

Medical Aid
75%

E25 Monthly Statistics Comparison

300

250

200

150

100

50

H Feb-22

H Mar-22
W Apr-22
B May-22

M Jun-22

mJul-22

Aug-22
Sep-22

Medical Aid  Trafic Collision Fire Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover




Response Breakdown September 2022

Move Up _—
19%

Miscellaneous

[V
1% B Medical Aid

Transfer | Traffic Collision
4% W Fire
M Transfer

Traffic Collision H Miscellaneous

4%
i Move Up
Medical Aid
71%
M25 Monthly Statistics Comparison
300
250
B Mar-22
200 W Apr-22
m May-22
150 N Jun-22
W Jul-22
100 m Aug-22
Sep-22
50 u
O -

Medical Aid Traffic Collision Fire Misc. Transfer Move/Cover




FIRE El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Station 28 Run Review September 2022

ENGINE 28: 142 Total Calls
Medical Aid - 85

Fire - 12

Traffic Collision - 12

Public Assist - 9

Misc - 11

Move/Cover - 13

MEDIC 28: 323 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 219

Fire- 10

Traffic Collision- 16
Transfer-5

Misc- 5

Move/Cover - 68




Response Breakdown September 2022
Move/Cover
9%
Miscellaneous

8%

Public Assists
6%

Fire

8%

Medical Aid
60%

Traffic Collisions
9%

E28 Monthly Statistics Comparison

100

90

80

70

60

50

40

30

20

10

Medical Aid  Traffic Collision Fire Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover

M Jan-22
H Feb-22
B Mar-22
W Apr-22
N May-22
M Jun-22
M Jul-22
W Aug-22
Sep-22
M Oct-22
B Nov-22
Dec-22




Response Breakdown September 2022

Miscellaneous
2%

Move Up
21%

Transfer
1%

. - Medical Aid
Traffic Collision 68%
5%
M28 Monthly Statistics Comparison
450
400 mJan-22
350 | Feb-22
m Mar-22
300
W Apr-22
250 H May-22
M Jun-22
200
W Jul-22
150 m Aug-22
-22
100 Sep
M Oct-22
50 " mNov-22
. .. Dec-22
Medical Aid Traffic Fire Misc. Transfer Move/Cover

Collision




FIRE El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Station 72 Run Review September 2022

ENGINE 72: 43 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 25

Fire- 4

Traffic Collision- 4
Rescues- 0

Public Assist- 5

Misc- 5

Move/Cover -0




Response Breakdown
Miscellaneous
5%

Move/Cover
0%

Rescue

Medical Aid
62%

Traffic Collisions
10%

E72 Monthly Statistics Comparison

40

I e JH_

Medical Aid Trafic Collision Fire Rescue Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover

M Jan-22
H Feb-22
m Mar-22
W Apr-22
B May-22
" Jun-22
mJul-22
m Aug-22
Sep-22
M Oct-22
W Nov-22
Dec-22




ENGINE 25: 297 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 255
Fire- 10
Traffic Collision- 7
Transfer- 20
Misc-4
Move/Cover — 70

El Dorado County Fire
Protection District

Station 25 Run Statistics
September 2022

MEDIC 25: 366 Total Calls
Medical Aid- 224
Fire- 10
Traffic Collision- 14
Public Assist- 20
Misc.- 28
Move/Cover - 1




El Dorado County Fire
Protection District

Monthly Run Statistics and Call Break Down - September 2022
Engine Companies and Medic Units

Total Responses for Engine Companies: 685

Engine Company Monthly Totals

350

300

250

200

150

100

; I II Il I“ il

: 1 1
Engine 17 Engine 19 Engine 25 Engine 28 Engine 72
M January M February March ®April = May June MWJuly MAugust B September
Monthly Call Type Comparisions
Engine Companies

500

450

400

350

300

250

200

150

100

: |

x el B Bk B o

Medical Aid Fire Traffic Collision Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover

HJanuary H February March ®April = May June MEJuly NAugust HSeptember




El Dorado County Fire
Protection District

Total Responses for Medic Units: 913

Medic Unit Monthly Totals

450

400

350

300

250

200

150 |I

100

& R

0

Medic 17 Medic 19 Medic 25 Medic 28
M January M February March ®April = May June mJuly MWAugust M September
Monthly Call Type Comparision Medic Units

900
800
700
600
500
400
300
il
100

0 mmcee=ln= nEEEE Ill II S 1 [ I —

Medical Aid Fire Traffic Collision Transfer Misc Move / Cover

M January M February March ®April = May June MJuly MWAugust B September




Miscellaneous

9%

Public Assists
5%

Fire

4%

Traffic Collisions
5%

—

Engine 25 Monthly Statistics Comparison

Response Breakdown September 2022

Move/Cover

B Medical Aid

H Traffic Collisions
i Fire

M Public Assists

H Miscellaneous

u Move/Cover

Medical Aid
75%

300

250

200

150

100

50

M Feb-22

H Mar-22
W Apr-22
B May-22

W Jun-22
mJul-22

Aug-22
Sep-22

Medical Aid

Trafic Collision Fire Public Assist Misc. Move/Cover




Miscellaneous

1%

Transfer
4% .
Fire

1%

Medic 25 Monthly Statistics Comparison

Response Breakdown September 2022

MoveUp____—
19%

B Medical Aid
M Traffic Collision
M Fire

M Transfer

Traffic Collision B Miscellaneous
4%
i Move Up
Medical Aid
71%
300
250
N Feb-22
200 m Mar-22
W Apr-22
150 [ | May-22
M Jun-22
100 o Jul-22
Aug-22

50

Medical Aid

Traffic Collision Fire Misc. Transfer Move/Cover




KRYSTEN KELLUM

RICHARD B. ESPOSITO
Editor

Mountain(@)

El Dorado County’s Leading Newspaper Since 1851

THANK YOU!

Your support of this 2022 edition of Happy Healthy Pets helped
make it the biggest and best magazine the Mountain Democrat has ever

published!

At 80 glossy pages, this exclusive and unique publication will be
distributed throughout the county via subscribers, racks, businesses who sell
the Mountain Democrat newspaper, and public locations such as veterinarian
offices, Chambers of Commerce, realtor offices, and more. Plus it is available
online on both the Village Life and Mountain Democrat websites for at least a

full year.

If you wish additional copies, let me know the quantity and I'll have
them available for will-call at the front desk between 8am to 4pm, M-F.

Chris Jones

Multi-Media Representative

Office: (530) 344-5023

Cell: (916) 417-2528

Village Life & Mountain Democrat
cjones@mtdemocrat.net

2889 Ray Lawyer Dr. - P.O. Box 1088 - Placerville, California 95667 - Phone: (530) 622-1255 - Fax: (530) 344-5092
0 HYPERLINK "http://www.mtdemocrat.com" Clhttp:/fwww. midemocrat. comO



	10-20-2022 Agenda
	9-30-2022 Minutes
	SOG-10-3-ROUTINE-PROCEDURES draft
	Financial Report
	September 2022 YTD
	Claims
	Staff Report - Insurance Renewal
	Staff Report - DSP Shared Service Agreement 10 2022 with documents
	Staff Report - DSP Shared Service Agreement 10 2022.pdf
	Shared Services Support Letter OCT 2022.pdf
	Union Letter on Shared Service Agreement.pdf

	Signed Shared Service Agreement with EDC Fire
	Staff Report - Ordinance 2022-02 Final Reading Adoption with documents
	Staff Report - Ordinance 2022-02 Final Reading Adoption.pdf
	ECF 2022 CFC Adoption 10 2022.pdf

	ECF 2022 CFC Adoption 9 2022 Power Point
	2022 California Fire Code Adoption�
	Model Codes
	Major Code Changes
	Major Code Changes
	Major Code Changes

	ECF Ordinance 2022-02 9-28-22
	September 2022 ECF Totals  Placerville Report
	September 2022 ECF Totals.pdf
	September 2022 Station 17.pdf
	September 2022 Station 19 .pdf
	September 2022 Station 25.pdf
	September 2022 Station 28.pdf
	September 2022 Station 72.pdf
	September 2022 City of Placerville.pdf

	Thank you Letter

